City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 5, 2024 Local Non-Local Local Local
For: Annual Contract for Paver Repair Services - B&B Masonry LLC A2Z Provision Frausto Castillo Milcon Construction,
Alamodome Construction Group LLC
6100017281 KH 9907 Moursund #2 434 Oakland Dr. 4754 Shavano Oak 8026 Vantage Dr.,
Estimated San Antonio, Blanco, San Antonio, San Antonio,
Item Description Annual TX 78221 Texas 78606 TX 78249 TX 78230
Quantity 210-287-3435
NAS
1 Paver Repair Services
Price Per Sq. Yd. 1,800 $117.00 $118.00 No Bid $183.00
Total Cost $210,600.00 $212,400.00 $329,400.00
2 Concrete Paver
Price Per Piece 600 $1.55 $5.54 No Bid $9.95
Total Cost $930.00 $3,324.00 $5,970.00
Pavers Per Pallet: 250 540
Subtotal $211,530.00 $215,724.00 No Bid $335,370.00
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 1.5 % 15 Days
Less Prompt Payment Discount $211,530.00 $215,724.00 $330,339.45
Estimated Annual Total $211,530.00 $215,724.00 No Bid $335,370.00

Estimated Annual Award

$211,530.00




	Final



