City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 14, 2023 NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL
For: POWERED LINE ARRAY SPEAKER SYSTEM FOR THE Clarity Media Group Bluum Usa Inc Digital Display Solutions Inc
CARVER COMMUNITY CULTURAL CENTER
6100016955 JH 4800 SW Meadows Rd. Ste 300 4675 E Cotton Ctr Blvd Ste 155 12223 San Pedro Ave
Lake Oswego, Phoenix, San Antonio,
Item Description Quantity |OR 97035 AZ 85040 TX 78216
503-534-3710
1 Main Speaker System Line Array Module 14
Price Per Each $2,799.00 $2,296.00 No Bid
Total Cost $39,186.00 $32,144.00
Manufacture NEXO NEXO
Model M1012-1 GEOM1025
Weight 47 Lb Not Provided
2 Line Array Module 2
Price Per Each $2,799.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Cost $5,598.00
Manufacturer NEXO
Model M1025-
Weight 47 Lb
3 L18, 18" Band-pass, horn loaded Subwoofer 2
Price Per Each $3,221.00 $2,684.86 No Bid
Total Cost $6,442.00 $5,369.72
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model L18 L18
4 M10 Flying/stacking bumper (1 or 2-point hang). Supports up to 2
12 modules
Price Per Each $1,063.00 $1,236.00 No Bid
Total Cost $2,126.00 $2,472.00
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model BUMPER VNI-BUMPM10
5 Extension bar (1 or 2-point hang) 2
Price Per Each $572.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Cost $1,144.00
Manufacturer NEXO
Model EX-BAR
6 120 degree Flanges for M10 8
Price Per Each $148.00 $123.78 No Bid
Total Cost $1,184.00 $990.24
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model 120° FLANG GMT-FLGM10
7 12 GA. Speaker Wire (500 ft.) 1
Price Per Each $475.00 $0.70 No Bid
Total Cost $475.00 $0.70
Manufacturer RAPCO LIBERTY
Model 12 GAWIRE 12-2C-P-BLK
8 Jumper Cable 12
Price Per Each $24.00 No Bid No Bid
Total Cost $288.00
Manufacturer RAPCO
Model 1 FOOT JUMPER
9 Riggin Rated and Tagged 2
Price Per Each $125.00 $2,340.00 No Bid
Total Cost $250.00 $4,680.00
Manufacturer STEEL SYMETRIX
Model Not Provided 80-0206
10 5
Side Fills and Under Balcony Fill Speakers Touring Version
dual 4" two-way speakers with rotatable 120x40 HF horn.
Price Per Each $874.00 $706.00 No Bid
Total Cost $4,370.00 $3,530.00
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model IP24-T12060 1D24-T12040
11 1 x Coaxial LF 8" 8 Ohms long excursion & Neodymium HF 2
1.5" 8 Ohms Frequency Response 66 Hz to 20 kHz. Peak SPL
Level 129 dB Peak
Price Per Each $1,483.00 $1,236.00 No Bid
Total Cost $2,966.00 $2,472.00
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model P8 P8-1
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12 U-Bracket for iD24-T (touring version) 5
Price Per Each $238.00 $172.68 No Bid
Total Cost $1,190.00 $863.40
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model IDT-HBRK24 IDT-HBRK24
13 Wall Mount (200mm) 2
Price Per Each $111.00 $92.67 No Bid
Total Cost $222.00 $185.34
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model VNI-WM200 VNI-WM200
14 Horizontal Bracket (425mm) 2
Price Per Each $187.00 $156.00 No Bid
Total Cost $374.00 $312.00
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model VNU - HBRK425 VNU-HBRK425
15 14 Gauge Speaker Cable (500ft) 1
Price Per Each $340.00 $0.46 No Bid
Total Cost $340.00 $0.46
Manufacturer RAPCO LIBERTY
Model 14 GA WIRE 14-2C-P-BLK
16 4 X 2500 Watts 4 x ultra-low distortion Class D amplifiers 2
Price Per Each $6,444.00 $5,370.44 No Bid
Total Cost $12,888.00 $10,740.88
Manufacturer NEXO NEXO
Model NXAMP4X2MK2 NXAMP4X2MK2
17 4 pole speakon connector 20
Price Per Each $5.00 $5.04 No Bid
Total Cost $100.00 $100.80
Manufacturer NEUTRIK NEUTRIK
Model NL4 NL4FXX-W-S
18 Power Distro 1
Price Per Each $3,500.00 $716.50 No Bid
Total Cost $3,500.00 $716.50
Manufacturer MOTION LABS MIDDLE ATLANTIC
Model 1104-2-KK-050-0012| PD920R (x2), PD815SC, QFAN (x3)
19 Amp Rack 1
Price Per Each $750.00 $1,027.24 No Bid
Total Cost $750.00 $1,027.24
Manufacturer EWI MIDDLE ATLANTIC
PTRK-2126, PTRK-RR21, LBP-1A,
LACE-13-OWP, HPQ, HBL1, UFA-8-
Model RIOU F1, VBK-PTRK26
20 CAT6 Cable (500ft) 1
Price Per Each $235.00 $0.37 No Bid
Total Cost $235.00 $0.37
Manufacturer RAPCO LIBERTY
Model CAT6 24-4P-P-L6-EN-BLK
21 Audio Control 1
Price Per Each $300.00 $1,366.58 No Bid
Total Cost $300.00 $1,366.58
Manufacturer APPLE SHURE/NEXO/BLIZZARD
LIGHTING
Model IPAD 9 GEN DH5C/O-MTQG, DH5B/O-MTQG
DMX5PCTRUE-3, DXS18XLF
22 System Installation (Includes motors, labor, & lift) 1
Price Per Each $20,500.00 $57,038.56 No Bid
Total Cost $20,500.00 $57,038.56
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Total $104.428.00 $124,010.79 No Bid
Total Award $104.428.00
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