
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: March 3, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local  Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Police Pursuit Tires-BESD Hesselbein Tire Southwest, Inc. Southern Tire Mart, LLC The Goodyear Tire 

4823 Corner Parkway 800 HWY 98 & Rubber Company
San Antonio, TX 78219 Columbia, MS 39429 200 Innovation Way
210-646-8448 601-424-3215 Akron, OH 44316

6100016476 JDLR 210-661-9886
Item

Description
Estimated 

Annual 
Quantity

   
CATEGORY 1 - CORE LIST
(MOST FREQUENTLY ORDERED TIRES)

1 Police Pursuit Tires - 
Category I - 97V / Traction A

1A GoodYear Eagle RS-A P225/60R16 20

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732354500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $231.58
List Discount: 53%
Price Per Each After Discount: $108.84
Extended price: $2,176.85

2 Police Pursuit Tires - 
Category II - 98W / Traction AA

2A Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P235/55R17 37

Bidder Part Number: Part# 011687 Part# 11687 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $152.38 $149.58
List Discount: 26% 24%
Price Per Each After Discount: $112.76 $113.68
Extended price: $4,172.16 $4,206.19

2B GoodYear Eagle RS-A P235/55R17 10

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732002500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $261.05
List Discount: 54%
Price Per Each After Discount: $120.08
Extended price: $1,200.83

3 Police Pursuit Tires - 
Category III - 108V / TRACTION A

3A Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P255/60R18 5

Bidder Part Number: Part# 012114 Part# 12114 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $164.13 $161.06
List Discount: 26% 23%
Price Per Each After Discount: $121.46 $124.02
Extended price: $607.28 $620.08

3B GoodYear Eagle Enforcer 884
**All Season Tires** P255/60R18

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732005563
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $324.21
List Discount: 55%
Price Per Each After Discount: $145.89
Extended price: $128,970.74

3C GoodYear Eagle RS-A P265/60R17 715

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732523500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $284.21
List Discount: 55%
Price Per Each After Discount: $127.89
Extended price: $91,444.57
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4 Police Pursuit Tires - 
Category IV - 99W / Traction AA

4A Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P225/60R16 5

Bidder Part Number: Part# 098388 Part# 11688 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $110.81 $167.95
List Discount: 4% 28%
Price Per Each After Discount: $106.38 $120.92
Extended price: $531.89 $604.62

4B GoodYear Eagle RS-A P235/50R18 4

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732276500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $330.53
List Discount: 53%
Price Per Each After Discount: $155.35
Extended price: $621.40

5 Police Pursuit Tires - 
Category V - 99W / Traction A

5A Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P245/55R18 720

Bidder Part Number: Part# 000702 Part# 702 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $185.06 $181.48
List Discount: 28% 26%
Price Per Each After Discount: $133.24 $134.30
Extended price: $95,935.10 $96,692.54

5B Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P225/60R18 5

Bidder Part Number: Part# 011688 Part# 11690 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $171.27 $190.16
List Discount: 30% 34%
Price Per Each After Discount: $119.89 $125.51
Extended price: $599.45 $627.53

5C Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P235/50R18 5

Bidder Part Number: Part# 011686 Part# 23325 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $193.99 $233.75
List Discount: 27% 36%
Price Per Each After Discount: $141.61 $149.60
Extended price: $708.06 $748.00

5D Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P265/60R17 5

Bidder Part Number: Part# 011685 Part# 11685 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $178.42 $174.85
List Discount: 31% 27%
Price Per Each After Discount: $123.11 $127.64
Extended price: $615.55 $638.20

5E Firestone Firehawk Pursuit P275/55R20 17

Bidder Part Number: Part# 008921 Part# 8921 No Bid
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: No Mileage Warranty No Mileage Warranty
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $221.05 $216.71
List Discount: 25% 26%
Price Per Each After Discount: $165.79 $160.37
Extended price: $2,818.39 $2,726.21
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5F GoodYear Eagle RS-A P225/60R18 5

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732312500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $265.09
List Discount: 57%
Price Per Each After Discount: $113.99
Extended price: $569.94

5G GoodYear Eagle Enforcer 10
**All Season Tires** P275/55R20

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732010563
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $320.00
List Discount: 57%
Price Per Each After Discount: $137.60
Extended price: $1,376.00

5H GoodYear Eagle RS-A P245/55R18 507

Bidder Part Number: No Bid No Bid Part# 732026500
List Manufacturer Mileage Warranty: N/A
Price Each from Manufacturer Price List: $293.77
List Discount: 57%
Price Per Each After Discount: $126.32
Extended price: $64,044.80

CATEGORY 2 - DISCOUNT ON 
MANUFACTURER'S PRICE LIST FOR 
NON-CORE TIRES

CAT 2A Firestone

Manufacturer Price List Name: Firestone Gov't Tire Catalog Base pricing COSA No Bid
Manufacturer Price List Date: 1/1/2023 3/3/2023
Type of Price Schedule (Dealer, Jobber, Etc.): Gov't Dealer Manufacturer
Price Schedule Column on Discounts already applied
Which Discount is Based: Gov't Price See attached Price List
Percent Discount (-): 10% Discount Varies per item

CAT 2B Goodyear

Manufacturer Price List Name: No Bid No Bid Goodyear Police 
Tire line up 2023

Manufacturer Price List Date: 2/1/2023
Type of Price Schedule (Dealer, Jobber, Etc.):
Price Schedule Column on 
Which Discount is Based: Base
Percent Discount (-): 52%

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Annual Total: $105,987.88 $106,863.38 $290,405.13
Estimated Annual Award: $103,169.49 $2,726.21 $290,405.13
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