

ORDINANCE 2023-01-12-0003

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH CAVENDER FORD MOTOR COMPANY, LTD., DBA CAVENDER GRANDE FORD, AND BRUCKNER TRUCK SALES, INC., DBA BRUCKNER'S TRUCK & EQUIPMENT, TO SUPPLY LIGHT AND MEDIUM DUTY SERVICE VEHICLES FOR A TOTAL COST OF \$706,579.00. FUNDING IN THE AMOUNT OF \$626,342.00 IS FROM THE FY 2023 EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, AND \$80,237.00 IS FROM THE HOMELAND SECURITY GRANT PROGRAM AWARDED BY THE UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF HOMELAND SECURITY AND THE FEDERAL EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT AGENCY.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light and medium duty service vehicles; and

WHEREAS, Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, submitted the low bid for items 8, 9, 12, 13, 14, 16, and 17 for a total cost of \$508,454.00; and

WHEREAS, Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc., dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment, submitted the low bid for item 11 for a total cost of \$198,125.00; **NOW THEREFORE**:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, for items 8, 9, 12, 13, 14, 16, and 17 for a total cost of \$508,454.00 and Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc., dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment, for item 11 for a total cost of \$198,125.00 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. A copy of the bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as **Exhibit I**.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of \$428,217.00 is available in Fund 72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023 Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of \$198,125.00 is available in Fund 72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023 Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 4. Payment in the amount of \$428,217.00 is authorized to Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, and should be encumbered with a purchase order.


SECTION 5. Payment in the amount of \$198,125.00 is authorized to Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc., dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment, and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 6. Current funding is available in Internal Order 120000000220, GL 5709080, Fund 2205620030 entitled "2021 UASI" for a total amount of \$80,237.00.

SECTION 7. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 8. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 12th day of January, 2023.



M A Y O R
Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST:

APPROVED AS TO FORM:



Debbie Racca-Sittre, City Clerk



Andrew Segovia, City Attorney



City of San Antonio

City Council Meeting January 12, 2023

6.

2023-01-12-0003

Ordinance approving contracts with Cavender Ford Motor Company Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, and Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc., dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment, to supply light and medium duty service vehicles for a total cost of \$706,579. Funding in the amount of \$626,342 is from the FY 2023 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund budget, and \$80,237 is from the Homeland Security Grant Program awarded by the United States Department of Homeland Security and the Federal Emergency Management Agency. [Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember Rocha Garcia moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Viagran seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello, Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Perry

LC
01/12/23
Item No. 6

Exhibit I

**City of San Antonio
Final Bid Tabulation**

Exhibit I

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL	
Item	Description	Quantity		
1	Deleted			
2	Deleted			
3	Deleted			
4	Deleted			
5	Deleted			
6	Deleted			
7	Deleted			
8	1 Ton Regular Cab, 4x2 Flatbed Truck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Flatbed Manufactured Offered: Flatbed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	<div style="border: 1px solid black; padding: 5px;"> <div style="text-align: right; padding-bottom: 5px;">\$66,794.00</div> <div style="text-align: right; padding-bottom: 5px;">\$66,794.00</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">2023 Ford F350 Regular Cab F3G</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">Ford 6.7L V8 Diesel 330 HP</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">Ford 10 Speed Automatic</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">36 Months or 36,000 Miles</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">Cavender Grande Ford</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">UTEC Model UT 9684TP</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">12 Months</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">180-240 Calender Days</div> <div style="text-align: center; padding-bottom: 5px;">12-14-2022</div> <div style="text-align: center;">12-14-2022</div> </div>	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle		Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478	
6100016155		GDL			
Item	Description	Quantity			
9	3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x2 Low Stake Bed Truck - Dual Rear Wheels Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid		
10	Deleted				

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
11	12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body Manufacturer Offered: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$198,125.00 \$198,125.00 2024 Mack Granite Model GV-813 Mack Engine Model MP-8 505 HP Eaton Fuller Model RTO-16908LL Per Attached Mack Certificate Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 TBEI - OX Bodies Model Maverick 12 Month Warranty 400 Calender Days 12-31-2023 12-31-2022

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478	
6100016155			GDL			
Item	Description	Quantity				
12	Class 5, Crew Cab, Low Profile Utility Body Truck, Gooseneck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Utility Bed Manufacturer Offered: Utility Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$80,237.00 \$80,237.00 2023 Ford F550 Crew Cab W5G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 Knapheide Model PG-TD- 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		No Bid	
13	Class 5, Regular Cab, Low Profile 9 Ft Stakebed Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$75,645.00 \$75,645.00 2023 Ford F550 Regular Cab F5G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 Knapheide PGNB-96 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		No Bid	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle		Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
14	3/4 Ton Regular Cab, Flatbed with Vector Control Attachments Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Flatbed and Vector Control Attachments Manufacturer Offered: Flatbed and Vector Control Attachments Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	<div>\$64,746.00</div> <div>\$64,746.00</div> <div>2023 Ford F250 Regular Cab F2A</div> <div>Ford 6.8L Gas V-8 305 HP</div> <div>Ford 10 Speed Automatic</div> <div>36 Months or 36,000 Miles</div> <div>Cavender Grande Ford</div> <div>4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219</div> <div>Knapheide Model PG-NB-838</div> <div>12 Months</div> <div>180 - 240 Calender Days</div> <div>12-14-2022</div> <div>12-14-2022</div>	No Bid
15	Deleted			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity			
16	1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, DRW, 12' Stake Bed with Lift Gate Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed and Lift Gate Manufactured Offered: Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid \$72,820.00 \$72,820.00 2023 Ford F350 Regular Cab F3G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 UTEC Model UT1296TP 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		
17	1 Ton, Crew Cab 4x2 Stake Bed Truck - Dual Rear Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid \$77,771.00 \$77,771.00 2023 Ford F350 Crew Cab W3G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 UTEC Model UT996TP 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
18	Deleted			
	Payment Terms:		Net 30	Net 30
	Total		\$508,454.00	\$198,125.00
Total Award			\$508,454.00	\$198,125.00