

ORDINANCE 2022-12-15-0949

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH CAVENDER FORD MOTOR COMPANY, LTD., DBA CAVENDER GRANDE FORD, GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC, AND SILSBEE FORD INC., TO PROVIDE THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO WITH LIGHT DUTY PICK-UP TRUCKS FOR AN ESTIMATED TOTAL COST OF \$1,732,891.13. FUNDING IN THE AMOUNT OF \$1,665,386.42 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2023 EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET AND \$67,504.71 IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2023 GENERAL FUND BUDGET.

* * * * *

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light duty pick-up trucks; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Chastang Ford, for items 1 and 3, failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements for light duty pick-up trucks; and

WHEREAS, the bid submitted by Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford (Items 5, 6, 11, and 12), a City Business as defined by the City's Local Preference Program, is within 3 percent of the lowest bid, which was from Grapevine DCJ, LLC, a bidder which is not a City Business; and

WHEREAS, Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, submitted the low bid for items 8, 9 and 10 and 14; and

WHEREAS, Grapevine DCJ, LLC, submitted the low responsive bid for item 3 for a total cost of \$243,656.00; and

WHEREAS, Silsbee Ford Inc., submitted the low responsive bid for item 1 for a total cost of \$98,090.13; and; **NOW THEREFORE:**

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, for items 5, 6, 8, 9, 10, 11, 12 and 14 for a total cost of \$1,391,145.00, Grapevine DCJ, LLC, for item 3 for a total cost of \$243,656.00, and Silsbee Ford Inc., for item 1 for a total cost of \$98,090.13 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. A copy of the bid tabulation is attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as **Exhibit I**.

SECTION 2. It has been found and declared that the bid submitted by Chastang Ford, for items 1 and 3, failed to meet the City's specifications and/or requirements for light duty service trucks.

SECTION 3. It has been found and declared that, pursuant to the City's Local Preference Program, passed by ordinance number 2013-03-21-0167 and as amended by ordinance number 2014-11-13-0923, Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford (Items 5, 6, 11, and 12), a City Business, is entitled to award.

SECTION 4. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of \$1,665,386.42 is available in Fund 72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023 Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 5. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of \$34,808.00 is available in Fund 11001000, Cost Center 2615070001 and General Ledger 5709060 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023 Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 6. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of \$32,696.71 is available in Fund 11001000, Cost Center 2612040001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023 Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 7. Payment in the amount of \$1,391,145.00 is authorized to Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, and should be encumbered with a purchase order.


SECTION 8. Payment in the amount of \$243,656.00 is authorized to Grapevine DCJ, LLC, and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 9. Payment in the amount of \$98,090.13 is authorized to Silsbee Ford Inc., and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 10. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers, SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 11. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes; otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.

PASSED and APPROVED this 15th day of December, 2022.




M A Y O R
Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST:



Debbie Racca-Sittre, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:



Andrew Segovia, City Attorney



City of San Antonio

City Council Meeting December 15, 2022

7.

2022-12-15-0949

Ordinance approving contracts with Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, Grapevine DCJ, LLC, and Silsbee Ford Inc. to provide light duty pick-up trucks for an estimated total cost of \$1,732,891.13. Funding is from the FY 2023 Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund budget in the amount of \$1,665,386.42 and \$67,504.71 is from the FY 2023 Adopted General Fund Budget. [Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember Rocha Garcia moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Castillo seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage, Gallagher

LC
12/15/22
Item No. 7

Exhibit I

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks						
6100015862			GDL			
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
			Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026
1	Compact RWD Crew Cab, Regular Bed Pickup	3				
	Price Each		\$28,081.76	No Bid	No Bid	NAS
	Total		\$84,245.28			\$35,540.00 \$106,620.00 Delivery/BuyBoard
	Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered		2023 Ford Ranger			2022 Ford F150
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)		2.3L Eco Boost			Ford F150 W1C 3.3L V6 PFDI 290@6,500
	Transmission Offered		10 Spd Auto			Electric 10 Speed Auto
	Warranty		36 mo/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain			3 yr/36,000 mile bumper- to-bumper; 5 yr/60,000 mile Powertrain Ltd 5 yr/unlimited mileage Corrosion Perforation 5 yr/60,000 mile Safety Restraint Warranty
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name		Red McCombs			Any Ford Dealership
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address		8333 I-10 WS San Antonio			
	Delivery		120 Calendar Days			Before end of year 2022
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		Cutoff (Stock)			Current on Schedule wk of Sept 19
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		Cutoff OnDemand			Subject to Prior Sale
1A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option	1				
	Price Each		\$750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price		\$750.00			
	Manufacturer/Product No.		50.EMPS25M52A (Sound off)			
1B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option	1				
	Price Each		\$750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price		\$750.00			
	Manufacturer/Product No.		50-EMPS25MS-4M (Sound off)			
1C	Arrow Stick/Blue Amber Option	1				
	Price Each		\$1,531.72	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price		\$1,531.72			
	Manufacturer/Product No.		50.EMPTC00WND (Sound off)			
1D	Toolbox Option	1				
	Price Each		\$899.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price		\$899.25			
	Manufacturer/Product No.		RKC 56LP (RK1)			
1E	Lift Gate Option	1				
	Price Each		\$3,595.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	Total Price		\$3,595.00			
	Manufacturer/Product No.		Tommy Gate Model G2- 54-7042			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks				NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
6100015862		GDL	Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity					
1F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer/Product No.	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 ROM.82373419 (ROF-T500LB)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer/Product No.	1	\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI Headaette Rack RKW616	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each: Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$465.00 \$465.00 Ford Option	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM 5 Vehicle Min.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1J	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 RinoCiner Lifetime	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$999.00 \$999.00 Whelen Amber W.Tac815	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
1L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$450 per Box \$450.00 RK 505 (RK1)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
	Sub-Total Unit With Options		\$98,090.13	No Bid	No Bid	Incomplete	
2	Deleted						
3	1/2 Ton RWD, Regular Cab, Regular Bed Pickup Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	7	Withdraw \$28,500.76 \$199,505.32 2023 Ford F-150 Reg Cab Ford 3.3L V6 10 Spd Auto 36 mon/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5yr/100,000 Powertrain Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120 Calendar Days On Demand Cut Off	 \$32,701.00 \$228,907.00 2023 Ram 500 Classic DS1262 Ram 3.6L V6 305 HP 850 RE 3 yr/36,000 miles 5 yr/100,000 limited powertrain Any Authorized Ram Above Est 120-240 Calendar Days August 2023 Est 1/15/2023	No Bid	NAS \$31,489.00 \$220,423.00 Delivery/BuyBoard 2022 Ford F150 Ford F150 F1C 3.3L V6 PFDI 290@6,500 Electric 10 Speed Auto *see below Any Ford Dealership Before end of year 2022 Current on Schedule Wk of Sept 19	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	
									Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity								
									*Warranty 3-year/36,000-mile (whichever comes first) bumper-to-bumper; no deductible 5-year/60,000-mile (whichever comes first) Powertrain Limited Warranty 5-year/unlimited mileage (whichever comes first) Corrosion Perforation (aluminum panel don't require perforation) 5-year/60,000 (whichever comes first) Safety Restraint Warranty Subject to Prior Sale	
3A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50 EMP525M52A (Sound off)		\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco		No Bid		No Bid	
3B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50-EMP525MS-4M (Sound off)		\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco		No Bid		No Bid	
3C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 50EMPTC00WND (Sound off)		\$1,350.00 \$1,350.00 Shorme		No Bid		No Bid	
3D	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 RKC56LP		\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard		No Bid		No Bid	
3E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate Model 62- 60-1342		\$3,390.00 \$3,390.00 Tommygate		No Bid		No Bid	
3F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom.82373419 (Rof-T 500LB)		\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik RofT		No Bid		No Bid	
3G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI RKW61L		\$850.00 \$850.00 Protect a Rast or Weatherproud		No Bid		No Bid	
3H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,206.00 \$1,206.00 Ford		\$300.00 \$300.00 OEM		No Bid		No Bid	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706		Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity										
3I	Color Option Price Each	1	\$900.00		200 Standard 500 low volume		No Bid		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$900.00		\$500.00							
	Manufacturer Offered		5 Vehicle Minimum		OEM							
3J	Bed Liner Option Price Each	1	\$365.00		\$575.00		No Bid		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$365.00		\$575.00							
	Manufacturer Offered		Rivo		Line-x							
3K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each	1	\$999.00		\$1,025.00		No Bid		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$999.00		\$1,025.00							
	Manufacturer Offered		Whelen W.TAC815		Whelen							
3L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each	1	\$450 per Box		\$2,850.00		No Bid		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$450.00		\$2,850.00							
	Manufacturer Offered		RK.505 (RK1)		Weatherguard							
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:		\$212,592.67		\$243,656.00		No Bid		Incomplete			
	Prompt Payment Discount:		Net 30		2%						Net 30	
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$212,592.67		\$238,782.88		No Bid		Incomplete			
4	Deleted											
5	3/4 Ton 4x4, Crew Cab, Long Bed Pick Up Price Each	2	\$54,800.52		\$52,242.00		\$53,082.00		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$109,601.04		\$104,484.00		\$106,164.00					
	Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered		2023 Ford F-250 Crew 4x4		2023 Ram 2500 Crew DJ7L92		2023 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 W2B					
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)		Ford 6.2L V8		Ram 6.4L hemi		Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP					
	Transmission Offered		6-Spd Auto		8HP 25-LCV		Ford Torq Shift 10-Speed					
	Warranty		36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain		3 yr/36,000 mile 5/100,000 5/100,000 limited powertrain		Basic 36 Months or 36,00 Miles					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name		Red McCombs		Any Ram Dealer		Cavender Grande Ford					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address		8333 I-10W San Antonio		Any Ram Dealer		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219					
	Delivery		120-160 Calendar Days		Est 150-300 Calendar Days		180-270 Calendar Days					
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		TBD		August 2023		10/21/2022					
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		TBD		Est November 20/2022		10/21/2022					
5A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each	1	\$750.00		\$910.00		\$660.00		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$750.00		\$910.00		\$660.00					
	Manufacturer Offered		50.EMP525M52A (Sound off)		Ecco		Ecco					
5B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each	1	\$750.00		\$910.00		\$740.00		No Bid			
	Total Price		\$750.00		\$910.00		\$740.00					
	Manufacturer Offered		50.EMP525M5-4M (Sound off)		Ecco		Ecco					

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706		Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity										
5C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 50.EMPTC00WND (Sound off)		\$1,350.00 \$1,350.00 Sho-me		\$950.00 \$950.00 Show-Me				No Bid	
5D	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 RKI 56LP (RKI)		\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard		\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built				No Bid	
5E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate Model 62-60-1342		\$3,390.00 \$3,390.00 Tommygate		\$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 Maxon				No Bid	
5F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom.82373419 (ROF-T500LB)		\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik Rof-T		\$800.00 \$800.00 Luverne				No Bid	
5G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI Headache Rack RKW616		\$850.00 \$850.00 Protect a Rail or Weatherguard		\$659.00 \$659.00 Westin				No Bid	
5H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	Standard		Std \$0.00 OEM		\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx				No Bid	
5I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM 5 Vehicle Min.		200 Standard colors 500 low volume \$500.00 OEM		N/C Std Colors Special Colors up to \$660 Add \$660.00 Ford				No Bid	
5J	Bed Liner option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino		\$575.00 \$575.00 Line-x		\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind				No Bid	
5K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$999.00 \$999.00 Wheler Amber W.TRC815		\$1,025.00 \$1,025.00 Wheler		\$750.00 \$750.00 Ecco				No Bid	
5L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$450 Per Box \$450.00 RK 505 (RKI)		\$2,850.00 \$2,850.00 Weatherguard		\$1,390.00 \$1,390.00 Better Built				No Bid	
Sub-Total Unit With Options:			\$121,482.39		\$118,933.00		\$117,377.00				No Bid	
Payment Terms:			Net 30		2%		Net 30					
Less Prompt Payment Discount:			\$121,482.39		\$116,554.34		\$117,377.00				No Bid	
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid							1%					
Price Differential							\$822.66					

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks							
6100015862			GDL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
			Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity					
6	3/4 Ton 4x4, Crew Cab, Regular Bed Pick Up Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	7	\$54,615.52 \$382,308.64 2023 Ford F-250 Crew 4x4 6.2L V8 Gas 10 Spd Auto 36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120-160 Calendar Days TBD TBD	\$52,042.00 \$364,294.00 2023 Ram 2500 Crew Cab DJ7L91 Ram 6.4L Hemi 8 HP 75-LCV 3 yr/36,000 miles 5/100,000 limited powertrain Any Ram Dealer Above Est 150-300 August 2023 Est 11/20/22	\$52,889.00 \$370,223.00 2023 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x4 W2B Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 180-270 Calendar Days 10/21/2022 10/21/2022	No Bid	
6A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50.EMP525M52A (Sound off)	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco	No Bid	
6B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50.EMP525M5-4M (Sound off)	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$740.00 \$740.00 Ecco	No Bid	
6C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 50 EMP-TC0000ND (Sound off)	\$1,350.00 \$1,350.00 Sho-me	\$950.00 \$950.00 Show-Me	No Bid	
6D	Toolbox Option Price Each Price Total Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 SKI 5LLP (RRI)	\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard	\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built	No Bid	
6E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate Model G2- 60-1342	\$3,390.00 \$3,390.00 Tommygate	\$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 Maxon	No Bid	
6F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom 82373419 (Rof-T 500LB)	\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik Rof-T	\$800.00 \$800.00 Laverne	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706		Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity										
6G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI Headache Rack RKW616		\$850.00 \$850.00 Protect a Rail or Weatherguard		\$659.00 \$659.00 Westin		No Bid	
6H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			Standard \$0.00 Ford		Std \$0.00 OEM		\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx		No Bid	
6I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM5 Vehicle Minimum		200 Standard 500 Low Volume \$500.00 OEM		N/C Std Colors Special Colors up to \$600 Add. \$600.00 Ford		No Bid	
6J	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino		\$575.00 \$575.00 Line-x		\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind		No Bid	
6K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			\$999.00 \$999.00 Whelen W.TAC815		\$1,025.00 \$1,025.00 Wheler		\$750.00 \$750.00 Ecco		No Bid	
6L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1			\$450 Per Box \$450.00 RK 505 (RKI)		\$2,850.00 \$2,850.00 Weatherguard		\$1,390.00 \$1,390.00 Better Built		No Bid	
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:				\$394,189.99		\$378,743.00		\$381,376.00		No Bid	
	Payment Terms: Less Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential				Net 30 \$394,189.99		2% \$371,168.14		Net 30 \$381,376.00 2.75%		No Bid	
									\$10,207.86			
7	Deleted											
8	3/4 Ton 4x4 Regular Cab, Long Bed Pickup Price Each Price Total	2			\$51,150.52 \$102,301.04		\$49,892.00 \$99,784.00		\$49,347.00 \$98,694.00		No Bid	
	Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered				2023 Ford F-250 Reg 4x4		2023 Ram 2500 DJ7L62		2023 Ford F250 R/C 4x4 F2B			
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP)				Ford 6.2L V8 Gas		Ram 6.4L Hemi		7.3L V8 Gas Ford 430 HP			
	Transmission Offered				6-Spd Auto		8 HP 75-LCV		Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic			
	Warranty				36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain		3 yr/36,000 miles 5/100,000 limited powertrain		Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name				Red McCombs		Any Ram Dealer		Cavender Grande Ford			
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address				5333 I-10W San Antonio		Above		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219			
	Delivery				120-160 Calendar Days		Est 150-300 Calendar Days		180-270 Calendar Days			
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model				TBD		August 2023		10/21/2022			
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model				TBD		Est 11/15/22		10/21/2022			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks 6100015862			GDL			
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	NON-LOCAL			
			Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	LOCAL Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	NON-LOCAL Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026
8A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50 EMPS25M52A (Sound off)	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco	No Bid
8B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50 EMPS 25MS-4M (Sound off)	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$740.00 \$740.00 Ecco	No Bid
8C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 50.EMPTC00WND (Sound off)	\$1,350.00 \$1,350.00 Sho-me	\$950.00 \$950.00 Show-Me	No Bid
8D	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 RKI 56LP (Rkl)	\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard	\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built	No Bid
8E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate 62-60-1342	\$3,390.00 \$3,390.00 Tommy Gate	\$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 Maxon	No Bid
8F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom 82373419 (Rof-T500LB)	\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik Rof-T	\$800.00 \$800.00 Luverna	No Bid
8G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI HeadAck Rak RKW61L	\$850.00 \$850.00 Protect a Rail or Weatherguard	\$659.00 \$659.00 Westin	No Bid
8H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	Standard. \$0.00	Std \$0.00 OEM	\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx	No Bid
8I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM 5 Vehicle Min.	200 Standard 500 low volume \$500.00 OEM	N/C Std Colors Special Colors up to \$660 Add. \$660.00 Ford	No Bid
8J	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino	\$575.00 \$575.00 Line-x	\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind	No Bid
8K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$999.00 \$999.00 Whelen W.TAC815	\$1,025.00 \$1,025.00 Wheler	\$750.00 \$750.00 Ecco	No Bid
8L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$450 per Box \$450.00 RK 505 (Rki)	\$2,850.00 \$2,850.00 Weatherguard	\$1,390.00 \$1,390.00 Better Built	No Bid
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:		\$114,182.39	\$114,233.00	\$109,907.00	No Bid
	Prompt Payment Discount:		Net 30	2%	Net 30	
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$114,182.39	\$111,948.34	\$109,907.00	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706		Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity										
9	3/4 Ton RWD Extended Cab, Regular Bed Pickup Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	2	\$50,738.00 \$101,476.00		No Bid		\$48,926.00 \$97,852.00		No Bid			
			2023 Ford F-250 Ext Cab				2023 Ford F250 Super Cab 4x2 X2A					
			Ford 6.2L V8 Gas				Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP					
			10 Spd Auto				Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic					
			36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain				Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles					
			Red McCombs				Cavender Grande Ford					
			8333 I-10W San Antonio				4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219					
			120-160 Calendar Days				180-270 Calendar Days					
			TBD				10/21/2022					
			TBD				10/21/2022					
OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES:												
9A	Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50 EMP525M52A (Sound off)		No Bid		\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco		No Bid			
9B	Blue/Amber Strobe Option Price Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50-EMPS25MS-4M (Sound off)		No Bid		\$740.00 \$740.00 Ecco		No Bid			
9C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 50EMPTC0000ND (Sound off)		No Bid		\$950.00 \$950.00 Show-Me		No Bid			
9D	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 RKI 56LP (RKI)		No Bid		\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built		No Bid			
9E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate 62-60-1342		No Bid		\$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 Maxon		No Bid			
9F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered:	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom 82373419 (Ref.T500LB)		No Bid		\$800.00 \$800.00 Luverne		No Bid			
9G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI HeadAcke Rack RKW616		No Bid		\$659.00 \$659.00 Westin		No Bid			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks							
6100015862			GDL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
			Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity					
9H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	Standard \$0.00	No Bid	\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx	No Bid	
9I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM 5 Vehicle Min.	No Bid	N/C Std Colors Special Colors up to \$660 Add. \$660.00 Ford	No Bid	
9J	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino	No Bid	\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind	No Bid	
9K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$999.00 \$999.00 Whelen W.TAC815	No Bid	\$750.00 \$750.00 Ecco	No Bid	
9L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$450 per Box \$450.00 RK 505 (RKi)	No Bid	\$1,390.00 \$1,390.00 Better Built	No Bid	
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:		\$113,357.35	No Bid	\$109,065.00	No Bid	
10	3/4 Ton RWD Extended Cab, Long Bed Pickup Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	3	\$50,024.52 \$150,073.56 2023 Ford F-250 Ext Ford 6.2L V8 6 Spd Auto 36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120-160 Calendar Days TBD TBD	No Bid	\$49,111.00 \$147,333.00 2023 Ford F250 Super Cab 4x2 X2A Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic Basic 36 Months 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 180-270 Calendar Days 10/21/2022 10/21/2022	No Bid	
10A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 50EMP525M52A (Sound off)	No Bid	\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco	No Bid	
10B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 Sound Off	No Bid	\$740.00 \$740.00 Ecco	No Bid	

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks						
6100015862			GDL			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks 6100015862			GDL	NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL			
				Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity					
11	3/4 Ton RWD Regular Cab, Long Bed Pickup Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	5		\$48,631.52 \$243,157.60 2023 Ford F-250 Reg Cab 6.2L V8 Gas 6-Spd Auto 36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120-160 Calendar Days TBD TBD	\$46,835.00 \$234,175.00 2023 Ram 2500 DJ2L62 Ram 6.4L Hemi 8 HP 75-LCV 3 yr/36,000 miles 5/100,000 limited powertrain Any Ram Dealer Above Est 150-300 August 2023 Est 11/15/22	\$46,772.00 \$233,860.00 2023 Ford F250 R/C 4x2 F2A Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 180-270 Calendar Days 10/21/2022 10/21/2022	No Bid
11A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$750.00 \$750.00 Sound off	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco	No Bid
11B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$750.00 \$750.00 Sound off	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$740.00 \$740.00 Ecco	No Bid
11C	Arrow Stick Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$1,531.72 \$1,531.72 Sound off	\$1,350.00 \$1,350.00 Sho-me	\$950.00 \$950.00 Show-Me	No Bid
11D	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$899.25 \$899.25 RKI	\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard	\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built	No Bid
11E	Lift Gate Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered:	1		\$3,895.00 \$3,895.00 Tommy Gate	\$3,390.00 \$3,390.00 Tommy Gate	\$3,250.00 \$3,250.00 Maxon	No Bid
11F	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom 82373419 (Rof.T500LB)	\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik Rof-T	\$800.00 \$800.00 Laverne	No Bid
11G	Headache Rack Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1		\$574.13 \$574.13 RKI	\$850.00 \$850.00 Protect a Rail or Weatherguard	\$659.00 \$659.00 Westin	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks						
6100015862			GDL			
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity	NON-LOCAL Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	NON-LOCAL Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	LOCAL Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	NON-LOCAL Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026
11H	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	Standard \$0.00	Std \$0.00 OEM	\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx	No Bid
11I	Color Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$900.00 \$900.00 OEM 5 Vehicle Min.	200 Standard 500 Low Volume \$500.00 OEM	N/C Std Colors Special Colors up to \$660 Add. \$660.00 Ford	No Bid
11J	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino	\$575.00 \$575.00 Line-x	\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind	No Bid
11K	Traffic Advisor Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$999.00 \$999.00 Whelen	\$1,025.00 \$1,025.00 Whelen	\$750.00 \$750.00 Ecco	No Bid
11L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$450 per Box \$450.00 RKI	\$2,850.00 \$2,850.00 Weatherguard	\$1,390.00 \$1,390.00 Better Built	No Bid
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:		\$255,038.95	\$248,624.00	\$245,073.00	No Bid
	Prompt Payment Discount: Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount: Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price Differential		Net 30 \$255,038.95	2% \$243,651.52	Net 30 \$245,073.00 0.58% \$1,421.48	No Bid
12	3/4 Ton RWD, Crew Cab, Regular Bed Pickup Price Each Total Price Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	4	\$52,088.52 \$208,354.08 2023 Ford F-250 Crew Cab Ford 6.2L V8 Gas 6-Spd Auto 36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper 5 yr/100,000 Powertrain Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120-160 Calendar Days TBD	\$49,181.00 \$196,724.00 2023 Ram 2500 Crew DJ2L91 Ram 6.4L Hemi 8 HP 75 LCV 3 yr/36,000 miles 5/100,000 limited powertrain Any Ram Dealer Above Est 150-300 Calendar Days August 2023	\$50,306.00 \$201,224.00 2023 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x2 W2A Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP Ford TorqShift 10 Speed Automatic Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78215 180-270 Calendar Days 10/21/2022	No Bid
12A	OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES: Amber Strobe Lighting Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$750.00 \$750.00 Sound off	\$910.00 \$910.00 Ecco	\$660.00 \$660.00 Ecco	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks 6100015862			NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL			
		GDL	Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191	Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541	Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706	Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity				
12B	Blue/Amber Strobe Lighting Option	1				
	Price Each		\$750.00	\$910.00	\$740.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$750.00	\$910.00	\$740.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Sound off	Ecco	Ecco	
12C	Arrow Stick Option	1				
	Price Each		\$1,531.72	\$1,350.00	\$950.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$1,531.72	\$1,350.00	\$950.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Sound off	Sho-me	Show-Me	
12D	Toolbox Option	1				
	Price Each		\$899.25	\$1,290.00	\$590.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$899.25	\$1,290.00	\$590.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		RKI	Weatherguard	Better Built	
12E	Lift Gate Option	1				
	Price Each		\$3,895.00	\$3,390.00	\$3,250.00	No Bid
	Price		\$3,895.00	\$3,390.00	\$3,250.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Tommy Gate	Tommygate	Maxon	
12F	Running Boards Option	1				
	Price Each		\$767.25	\$799.00	\$800.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$767.25	\$799.00	\$800.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Rom 82373419 (Rof.T500LB)	Romik Rof-T	Luverne	
12G	Headache Rack Option	1				
	Price Each		\$574.13	\$850.00	\$659.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$574.13	\$850.00	\$659.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		RKI	Protect a Rail or Weatherguard	Westin	
12H	Tow Hitch Option	1				
	Price Each		Standard	Std	\$389.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$0.00	\$0.00	\$389.00	
	Manufacturer Offered			OEM	Grimaxx	
12I	Color Option	1				
	Price Each		\$900.00	200 Standard 500 Low Volume	N/C Std Colors Special Colors Yellow, Orange, Vecmlion, Red	No Bid
	Total Price		\$900.00	\$500.00	\$660.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		OEM 5 Vehicle Min.	OEM	Ford	
12J	Bed Liner Option	1				
	Price Each		\$365.00	\$575.00	\$375.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$365.00	\$575.00	\$375.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Rino	Line-x	Autoxtras Marvel Ford	
12K	Traffic Advisor Option	1				
	Price Each		\$999.00	\$1,025.00	\$750.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$999.00	\$1,025.00	\$750.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		Whelen	Wheler	Ecco	
12L	Top Mount Side Boxes Option	1				
	Price Each		\$450 per Box	\$2,850.00	\$1,390.00	No Bid
	Total Price		\$450.00	\$2,850.00	\$1,390.00	
	Manufacturer Offered		RKI	Weatherguard	Better Built	
	Sub-Total Unit With Options:		\$220,235.43	\$211,173.00	\$212,437.00	No Bid
	Prompt Payment Discount:		Net 30	2%	Net 30	
	Total Cost with Prompt Payment Discount:		\$220,235.43	\$206,949.54	\$212,437.00	No Bid
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid				2.65%	
	Price Differential				\$5,487.46	
13	Deleted					

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 2, 2022 For: Light Duty Trucks			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100015862			GDL		Silsbee Ford 1211 US Hwy 96N Silsbee TX 77656 (409) 880-9191		Grapevine DCJ, LLC 2601 William Tate Grapevine TX 76051 (817) 410-7541		Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 245-4706		Chastang Ford 6200 N Loop East Houston TX 77026	
Item	Description	Estimated Quantity										
14	Retail 3/4 Ton RWD Crew Cab, Regular Bed Pickup Covert Price Each Price Total Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP) Transmission Offered Warranty Warranty Service Provider Facility Name Warranty Service Provider Facility Address Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model: OPTIONS/ACCESSORIES:	1	Withdrew \$53,941.52 \$53,941.52 2023 Ford F-250 Crew Cab Ford 6.2L V8 6-Spd Auto 36 mons/36,000 Bumper To Bumper Red McCombs 8333 I-10W San Antonio 120-160 Calendar Days TBD TBD		Withdrew \$51,753.00 \$51,753.00 2023 Ram 2500 Crew DJ2L91 Ram 6.4L Hemi 8 HP 75 LCV 3 yr/36,000 miles 5/100,000 limited powertrain Any Ram Dealer Above Est 150-300 Calendar Days August 2023 Est 11/15/22		\$54,550.00 \$54,550.00 2023 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4x2 W2A Ford 7.3L V8 Gas 430 HP Ford Torque Shift 10 Speed Automatic Basic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 180-270 Calendar Days 10/21/2022 10/21/2022		No Bid			
14A	Toolbox Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$899.25 \$899.25 RKI		\$1,290.00 \$1,290.00 Weatherguard		\$590.00 \$590.00 Better Built		No Bid			
14B	Running Boards Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	\$767.25 \$767.25 Rom 8237419		\$799.00 \$799.00 Romik Rof-T		\$800.00 \$800.00 Luverne		No Bid			
14C	Tow Hitch Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered	1	Standard \$0.00		0 Std \$0.00 OEM		\$389.00 \$389.00 Grimaxx		No Bid			
14D	Color Option Price Each Total Price	1	\$900.00 5 Vehicle Min. \$900.00		Any Standard Color Included \$0.00		Std Colors N/C Special Colors Vermilion Red, Orange, Yellow Add \$660 \$660.00		No Bid			
14E	Bed Liner Option Price Each Total Price Manufacturer Offered Sub-Total Unit With Options: Payment Terms: Estimated Total	1	\$365.00 \$365.00 Rino \$56,873.02 Net 30 \$1,747,997.23		\$575.00 \$575.00 Line-x \$54,417.00 2%, 10 Days; Net 30 \$1,369,779.00		\$375.00 \$375.00 Autoxtras Marvel Ind \$57,364.00 Net 30 \$1,391,145.00		No Bid Net 30 \$327,043.00			
Estimated Awarded Total			\$98,090.13		\$243,656.00		\$1,391,145.00		Incomplete			