

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity			
1	Deleted				
2	Deleted				
3	Deleted				
4	Deleted				
5	Deleted				
6	Deleted				
7	Deleted				
8	1 Ton Regular Cab, 4x2 Flatbed Truck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Flatbed Manufactured Offered: Flatbed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid		

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL	
Item	Description	Quantity		
9	3/4 Ton Crew Cab 4x2 Low Stake Bed Truck - Dual Rear Wheels Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$70,441.00 \$70,441.00 2023 Ford F350 Crew Cab W3G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 UTEC Model UT 9684 TP 12 Months 180-240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022	No Bid
10	Deleted			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
11	12 Cubic Yard Dump Truck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body Manufacturer Offered: 12 Cubic Yard Dump Body Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	No Bid	\$198,125.00 \$198,125.00 2024 Mack Granite Model GV-813 Mack Engine Model MP-8 505 HP Eaton Fuller Model RTO-16908LL Per Attached Mack Certificate Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 TBEI - OX Bodies Model Maverick 12 Month Warranty 400 Calender Days 12-31-2023 12-31-2022

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle		Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
12	Class 5, Crew Cab, Low Profile Utility Body Truck, Gooseneck Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Utility Bed Manufacturer Offered: Utility Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	<div><div>\$80,237.00</div><div>\$80,237.00</div><div>2023 Ford F550 Crew Cab W5G</div><div>Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP</div><div>Ford 10 Speed Automatic</div><div>36 Months or 36,000 Miles</div><div>Cavender Grande Ford</div><div>4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219</div><div>Knapheide Model PG-TD-</div><div>12 Months</div><div>180 - 240 Calender Days</div><div>12-14-2022</div><div>12-14-2022</div></div>	No Bid
13	Class 5, Regular Cab, Low Profile 9 Ft Stakebed Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	<div><div>\$75,645.00</div><div>\$75,645.00</div><div>2023 Ford F550 Regular Cab F5G</div><div>Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP</div><div>Ford 10 Speed Automatic</div><div>36 Months or 36,000 Miles</div><div>Cavender Grande Ford</div><div>4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219</div><div>Knapheide PGNB-96</div><div>12 Months</div><div>180 - 240 Calender Days</div><div>12-14-2022</div><div>12-14-2022</div></div>	No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL	
Item	Description	Quantity		
14	3/4 Ton Regular Cab, Flatbed with Vector Control Attachments Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Flatbed and Vector Control Attachments Manufacturer Offered: Flatbed and Vector Control Attachments Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$64,746.00 \$64,746.00 2023 Ford F250 Regular Cab F2A Ford 6.8L Gas V-8 305 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 Knapheide Model PG-NB-838 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022	No Bid
15	Deleted			

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708		Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155			GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity			
16	1 Ton Truck, Regular Cab, DRW, 12' Stake Bed with Lift Gate Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed and Lift Gate Manufactured Offered: Stake Bed and Lift Gate Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$72,820.00 \$72,820.00 2023 Ford F350 Regular Cab F3G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 UTEC Model UT1296TP 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		
17	1 Ton, Crew Cab 4x2 Stake Bed Truck - Dual Rear Price Each: Total: Year, Make & Model of Truck Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered (Include SAE Net HP): Transmission Offered: Warranty: Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Stake Bed Manufacturer Offered: Stake Bed Warranty: Delivery: Production Cut-off Date: Last day that the city can place orders under this contract without missing the production cut-off date:	1	\$77,771.00 \$77,771.00 2023 Ford F350 Crew Cab W3G Ford 6.7L V-8 Diesel 330 HP Ford 10 Speed Automatic 36 Months or 36,000 Miles Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219 UTEC Model UT996TP 12 Months 180 - 240 Calender Days 12-14-2022 12-14-2022		

No Bid

No Bid

City of San Antonio Final Bid Tabulation

Opened: November 4, 2022 For: Light & Medium Duty Service Vehicle			Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 278-9708	Bruckner Truck Sales, Inc. dba Bruckner's Truck & Equipment 4562 IH-10 East San Antonio TX 78219 (210) 863-6478
6100016155				
		GDL		
Item	Description	Quantity		
18	Deleted			
	Payment Terms:		Net 30	Net 30
	Total		\$508,454.00	\$198,125.00
	Total Award		\$508,454.00	\$198,125.00