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ORDINANCE 2022 -12 <01 <0 800

APPROVING CONTRACTS WITH HOLT TEXAS, LTD., AND SAN
ANTONIO SOUTHWEST TRAILERS, LTD., FOR TRAILERS FOR A
TOTAL COST OF $355,408.00. FUNDING IN THE AMOUNT OF $93,118.00
IS AVAILABLE FROM THE FY 2023 AIRPORT OPERATING AND
MAINTENANCE FUND BUDGET, $8,875.00 FROM THE FY 2023
GENERAL FUND BUDGET, $34,950.00 FROM THE FY 2023 SOLID
WASTE MANAGEMENT OPERATING AND MAINTENANCE FUND
BUDGET, $14,985.00 FROM THE FY 2023 STORM WATER FUND
BUDGET, $15,985.00 FROM THE FY 2023 PARKS ENVIRONMENTAL
FUND BUDGET, $153,860.00 FROM THE FY 2023 EQUIPMENT
RENEWAL AND REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET, AND $33,635.00
FROM THE FY 2023 PARKS DONATION AND CONTRIBUTION FUND
BUDGET.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with 22 trailers that will be
used by Aviation, Development Services, Parks & Recreation, Public Works, and Solid Waste
Management Departments; and

WHEREAS, San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd., submitted the low bid for items 1-8 and items
10-13 for a total cost of $316,350.00; and

WHEREAS, Holt Texas, Ltd., submitted the low bid for item 9 for a total cost of $39,058.00;
NOW THEREFORE:

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The bids submitted by San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd., for items 1-8 and
items 10-13 for a total cost of $316,350.00 and Holt Texas, Ltd., for item 9 for a total cost of
$39.058.00 are hereby accepted, subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds,
performance deposits, insurance certificates and endorsements. A copy of the bid tabulation is
attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit 1.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $153,860.00 is available in Fund
72001000, Cost Center 3503200001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 3. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $17,185.00 is available in Fund
51001000, Cost Center 3305030008 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 4. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $8,675.00 is available in Fund
51001000, Cost Center 3305030011 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.
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SECTION S. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $67,258.00 is available in Fund
51001000, Cost Center 3305040010 and General Ledger 5201040 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 6. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $34,950.00 is available in Fund
55001000, Cost Center 5559000001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 7. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $15,985.00 is available in Fund
29101004, Cost Center 2617010001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 8. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $8,875.00 is available in Fund
11001000, Cost Center 6105010001 and General Ledger 5709060 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 9. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $14,985.00 is available in Fund
29070000, Cost Center 2304050001 and General Ledger 5501055 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 10. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $33,635.00 is available in Fund
29826000, Cost Center 2690840001 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2023
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 11. Payment is authorized to San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd., and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 12. Payment is authorized to Holt Texas, Ltd., and should be encumbered with a
purchase order.

SECTION 13. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to
concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost
Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 14. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.
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PASSED and APPROVED this 1% day of December, 2022.

Ron Nirenberg

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Fay M /m’ﬁﬂﬁ LI

Debbie Racca-Sittre, City Clerk /,_Z/ndrew &egovia, City Attorney

(98]



City of San Antonio

City Coﬁncil Meeting
December 1, 2022

2022-12-01-0890
Ordinance approving contracts with Holt Texas, Ltd., and San Antonio Southwest Trailers, Ltd.,
for trailers for a total cost of $355,408. Funding in the amount of $93,118 is from the FY 2023
Airport Operating and Maintenance Fund budget, $8,875 from the FY 2023 General Fund
budget, $34,950 from the FY 2023 Solid Waste Management Operating and Maintenance Fund
budget, $14,985 from the FY 2023 Storm Water Fund Budget, $15,985 from the FY 2023 Parks
Environmental Fund budget, $153,860 from the FY 2023 Equipment Renewal and Replacement
Fund budget, and $33,635 from the FY 2023 Parks Donation and Contribution Fund budget.
[Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]
Councilmember Courage moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Viagran
seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKee-Rodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello
Havrda, Sandoval, Pelaez, Courage
Absent: Perry



LC
12/01/22
Item No. 7

Exhibit I



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom
Trailers, Ltd. Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N
6100015995 JDLR |San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533
Item Description Quantity | 210-657-5828 210-884-7026
1 18’ Custom Landscape Equipment Trailer 6 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $8,875.00
Extended price: $53,250.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B7083TTSU-18f
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 7821
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023|
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023|
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
2 25' Flat Deck, 25,000 Ibs., Pintle Dovetail Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $18,185.00]
Extended price: $18,185.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck|
& P25102EHSS-25
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023)
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023|
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
3 Tandem Axle Dual Wheel Pole Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $38,600.00]
Extended price: $38,600.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Butler Trailer MFG|
& BP-2080
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 190 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023]
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
Prepared by Purchasing 11/10/2022 Page 1



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom
Trailers, Ltd. Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N
6100015995 JDLR |San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533
Item Description Quantity |210-657-5828 210-884-7026
4 Trailer, Minimum 60,000 Ibs. Capacity, Non-Tilt Platform 2 NO BID
Price Each: $34,950.00 $43,656.00
Extended price: $69,900.00] $87,312.00.
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck| Interstate 50 DLA
& P60102EHSS-27|
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year] 1 Year,
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck| Holt Truck Center,
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road} 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78219|f San Antonio, TX 78222
Delivery 90 Days| 200 Days
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/202;1] 12/11/2022
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/202. 12/1/2022
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| No
5 22' Tandem Axle Utility Tilt Deck Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $15,985.00]
Extended price: $15,985.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck|
& B1081TBNR-20
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219}
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023|
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023]
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
6 14’ Landscape Utility Trailer 2 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $8,875.00)
Extended price: $17,750.00]
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B4583LSRG-14f
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/202:
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/202
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Ye
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom
Trailers, Ltd. Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N
6100015995 JDLR |San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533
Item Description Quantity | 210-657-5828 210-884-7026
7 16’ Tandem Axle Utility Trailer with Ramp, 6000 Ibs. 2 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $8,575.00)
Extended price: $17,150.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B7OB3TTRG-16#
Trailer Warranty: 1 Yearj
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023]
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
8 25’ Flat Deck, 14,000Ibs., Pintle Eye Dovetail Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $16,485.00]
Extended price: $16,485.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck|
& B14102EHSU-30)
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023)
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yegl
9 25’ Trailer, Minimum 48,000 Capacity, Tilt Platform 1 NO BID
Price Each: $41,185.00] $39,058.00
Extended price: $41,185.00] $39,058.00|
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck Interstate 40TDL|
& P45102TBNR-30
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year| 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck Holt Truck Center|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78222
Delivery 90 Days| 300 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023] 12/11/2022
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023) 12/1/2022
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes No|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom
Trailers, Ltd. Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N
6100015995 JDLR |San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533
Item Description Quantity [210-657-5828 210-884-7026
10 16' Tandem Axle Utility Trailer with Ramps, 7000 Ibs. 1 NO BID! NO BID
Price Each: $8,675.00
Extended price: $8,675.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck|
& B7083TTRG-16|
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Roal
San Antonio, TX 7821
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/ 1/202]
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/202:
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
1 20’ Trailer with Winch 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $17,185.00
Extended price: $17,185.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck|
& B1483CHRG-20|
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road|
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/ 11202]
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/202.
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
12 18’ Tandem Axle Enclosed Cargo Trailer 2 NO BID
Price Each: $14,100.00 $24,274.00
Extended price: $28,200.00] $48,548.00
Year, Make & Model Offered Stallion Manufactun'ngl 2023 Cynergy Cargo
& SM8518TR 8.5X18 TA Cargo Trailer
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year Warrany Information
Attached
Extended Warranties
Available for Purchase, if
needed
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Trialers|| Cynergy Cargo or
Local Facility in San Antonio
Area
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 10302 IH 35 North| 2122 Douglas Broxton Hwy|
San Antonio, TX 782::] Douglas, GA 31533
Delivery 120 Da 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom
Trailers, Ltd. Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N
6100015995 JDLR |San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533
Item Description Quantity | 210-657-5828 210-884-7026
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023 June 2024
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023} April 2023
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| Yes
13 Single Wheel Tandem Axle Gooseneck 1 NO BID NO BID
Price Each: $14,985.00]
Extended price: $14,985.00]
Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& G14102EHSS-25)
Trailer Warranty: 1 Year|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219
Delivery 90 Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023]
Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023]
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes|
Payment Terms Net 30| Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Total $357,535.00 $126,370.00 $48,548.00
Total Award $316,350.00| $39,058.00
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