
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd.
Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom 

Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N

6100015995 JDLR San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533

Item Description Quantity 210-657-5828 210-884-7026

1 18’ Custom Landscape Equipment Trailer 6 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $8,875.00
Extended price: $53,250.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck 
& B7083TTSU-18

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

2 25’ Flat Deck, 25,000 lbs., Pintle Dovetail Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $18,185.00
Extended price: $18,185.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck 
& P25102EHSS-25

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

3 Tandem Axle Dual Wheel Pole Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $38,600.00
Extended price: $38,600.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Butler Trailer MFG
& BP-2080

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 190 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd.
Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom 

Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N

6100015995 JDLR San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533

Item Description Quantity 210-657-5828 210-884-7026

4 Trailer, Minimum 60,000 lbs. Capacity, Non-Tilt Platform 2 NO BID

Price Each: $34,950.00 $43,656.00
Extended price: $69,900.00 $87,312.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck Interstate 50 DLA
& P60102EHSS-27

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck Holt Truck Center

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78222

Delivery 90 Days 200 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023 12/11/2022

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023 12/1/2022
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes No

5 22’ Tandem Axle Utility Tilt Deck Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $15,985.00
Extended price: $15,985.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B1081TBNR-20

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

6 14’ Landscape Utility Trailer 2 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $8,875.00
Extended price: $17,750.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B4583LSRG-14

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd.
Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom 

Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N

6100015995 JDLR San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533

Item Description Quantity 210-657-5828 210-884-7026

7 16’ Tandem Axle Utility Trailer with Ramp, 6000 lbs. 2 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $8,575.00
Extended price: $17,150.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B7083TTRG-16

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

8 25’ Flat Deck, 14,000lbs., Pintle Eye Dovetail Trailer 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $16,485.00
Extended price: $16,485.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B14102EHSU-30

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

9 25’ Trailer, Minimum 48,000 Capacity, Tilt Platform 1 NO BID

Price Each: $41,185.00 $39,058.00
Extended price: $41,185.00 $39,058.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck Interstate 40TDL
& P45102TBNR-30

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck Holt Truck Center

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78219 San Antonio, TX 78222

Delivery 90 Days 300 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023 12/11/2022

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023 12/1/2022
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd.
Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom 

Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N

6100015995 JDLR San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533

Item Description Quantity 210-657-5828 210-884-7026

10 16’ Tandem Axle Utility Trailer with Ramps, 7000 lbs. 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $8,675.00
Extended price: $8,675.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B7083TTRG-16

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

11 20’ Trailer with Winch 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $17,185.00
Extended price: $17,185.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& B1483CHRG-20

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

12 18’ Tandem Axle Enclosed Cargo Trailer 2 NO BID

Price Each: $14,100.00 $24,274.00
Extended price: $28,200.00 $48,548.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Stallion Manufacturing 2023 Cynergy Cargo 
& SM8518TR 8.5X18 TA Cargo Trailer

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year Warrany Information 
Attached

Extended Warranties 
Available for Purchase, if 

needed

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Trialers Cynergy Cargo or 
Local Facility in San Antonio 

Area

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 10302 IH 35 North 2122 Douglas Broxton Hwy

San Antonio, TX 78233 Douglas, GA 31533

Delivery 120 Days 120 Days
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 30, 2022 LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: Purchase of Trailers San Antonio Southwest 

Trailers, Ltd.
Holt Texas, LTD Coast to Coast Custom 

Mobile Vending, LLC
10302 IH 35 North 5665 SE Loop 410 1766 Hwy 221N

6100015995 JDLR San Antonio San Antonio Douglas
TX 78233 TX 78222 GA 31533

Item Description Quantity 210-657-5828 210-884-7026

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023 June 2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023 April 2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes

13 Single Wheel Tandem Axle Gooseneck 1 NO BID NO BID

Price Each: $14,985.00
Extended price: $14,985.00

Year, Make & Model Offered Southwest Gooseneck
& G14102EHSS-25

Trailer Warranty: 1 Year

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Southwest Gooseneck

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 343 Gembler Road
San Antonio, TX 78219

Delivery 90 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/1/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 8/1/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Estimated Total $357,535.00 $126,370.00 $48,548.00
Total Award $316,350.00 $39,058.00
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