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ORDINANCE  2022-06-23-0499

APPROVING THE FOLLOWING CONTRACTS WITH CAVENDER
FORD MOTOR COMPANY, LTD., DBA CAVENDER GRANDE FORD,
LAKE COUNTRY CHEVROLET, INC., SILSBEE FORD-LINCOLN-
MERCURY, INC., DBA SILSBEE FORD, INC., DONALSON-UMPHREY
AUTOMOTIVE GROUP, INC., DBA SILSBEE TOYOTA, AND TESLA,
INC., TO PROVIDE 50 LIGHT DUTY VEHICLES FOR VARIOUS CITY
DEPARTMENTS FOR A TOTAL COST OF $1,576,454.00. FUNDING IS
AVAILABLE FROM THE EQUIPMENT RENEWAL AND
REPLACEMENT FUND BUDGET IN THE AMOUNT OF $1,530,235.00
AND THE AIRPORT OPERATIONS & MAINTENANCE FUND BUDGET
IN THE AMOUNT OF $46,219.000 FOR A TOTAL AMOUNT OF
$1,576,454.00.

WHEREAS, bids were submitted to provide the City of San Antonio with light duty vehicles for
use by various City departments; and

WHEREAS, Donalson-Umphrey Automotive Group, Inc., dba Silsbee Toyota, submitted the low
bids for items 1-4 for a total cost of $927,430.00; and

WHEREAS, Lake Country Chevrolet, Inc., submitted the low bids for items 5-7 for a total cost
of $204,550.00; and

WHEREAS, Silsbee Ford-Lincoln-Mercury, Inc., dba Silsbee Ford, Inc., submitted the low bid
for item 8 for a total cost of $56,695.00; and

WHEREAS, Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford, submitted the
low bids for items 9-10 for a total cost of $323,339.00; and

WHEREAS, the Texas Local Government Code indicates that competitive bidding is not required
under section 252.022(a)(2), which prov1des for a procurement necessary to protect the public
health or safety; and

WHEREAS, Tesla, Inc., submitted an offer to provide an all-electric sedan, long range vehicle
for a cost of $64,440.00; and

WHEREAS, all expenditures will be in accordance with the applicable fiscal year’s budget
approved by City Council; NOW THEREFORE:
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BE IT ORDAINED. BY THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF SAN ANTONIO:

SECTION 1. The following bids and offer to furnish the City with 50 light duty vehicles for use
by various City departments as shown on the attached bid tabulation sheets are hereby accepted,
subject to and contingent upon the deposit of all required bonds, performance deposits, insurance
certificates and endorsements: (A) Donalson-Umphrey Automotive Group, Inc., dba Silsbee
Toyota, submitted the low bids for items 1-4 for a total cost of $927,430.00; (B) Lake Country
Chevrolet, Inc., submitted the low bids for items 5-7 for a total cost of $204,550.00; (C) Silsbee
Ford-Lincoln-Mercury, Inc., dba Silsbee Ford, Inc., submitted the low bid for item 8 for a total
cost of $56,695.00; (D) Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender Grande Ford,
submitted the low bids for items 9-10 for a total cost of $323,339.00; and (E) Tesla, Inc., for an
all-electric sedan, long range vehicle for a cost of $64,440.00, for a total amount of $1,576,454.00.
The bid tabulation sheets are attached hereto and incorporated herein for all purposes as Exhibit
I. Copies of the bids are available for inspection in the offices of the Purchasing Division of the
Finance Department.

SECTION 2. Funding for this ordinance in the amount of $46,219.00 is available in Fund
51001000, Cost Center 3305030006 and General Ledger 5709080 as part of the Fiscal Year 2022
Adopted Budget approved by City Council.

SECTION 3. Additional funding in the amount of $1,530,235.00 is contingent upon City Council
approval of the Fiscal Year 2023 and subsequent budgets that fall within the term of the contracts.

SECTION 4. Payment is authorized to Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender
Grande Ford, in the amount of $323,339.00 and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 5. Payment is authorized to Lake Country Chevrolet, Inc., in the amount of
$204,550.00 and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 6. Payment is authorized to Silsbee Ford-Lincoln-Mercury, Inc., dba Silsbee Ford,
Inc., in the amount of $56,695.00 and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 7. Payment is authorized to Donalson-Umphrey Automotive Group, Inc., dba Silsbee
Toyota, in the amount of $927,430.00 and should be encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 8. Payment is authorized to Tesla, Inc. in the amount $64,440.00 and should be
encumbered with a purchase order.

SECTION 9. The financial allocations in this ordinance are subject to approval by the Deputy
Chief Financial Officer, City of San Antonio. The Deputy Chief Financial Officer may, subject to
concurrence by the City Manager or designee, correct allocations to specific SAP Fund Numbers,
SAP Project Definitions, SAP WBS Elements, SAP Internal Orders, SAP Fund Centers, SAP Cost
Centers, SAP Functional Areas, SAP Funds Reservation Document Numbers, and SAP GL
Accounts as necessary to carry out the purpose of this ordinance.

SECTION 10. This ordinance is effective immediately upon passage by eight affirmative votes;
otherwise it is effective on the tenth day after passage.
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PASSED and APPROVED this 23" day of June, 2022.

ATTEST: APPROVED AS TO FORM:

< B2

ebble Racca-Sittre, City Clerk /‘%drew S€govia, City Attorney

(98]
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Exhibit I



City of San Antonio

City Council A Session Meeting
June 23, 2022

9. ' 2022-06-23-0499
Ordinance approving contracts with Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd., dba Cavender
Grande Ford, Lake Country Chevrolet, Inc., Silsbee Ford Lincoln Mercury, Inc., dba Silsbee
Ford, Inc., Donalson Umphrey Automotive Group, Inc., dba Silsbee Toyota, and Tesla, Inc., to
provide 50 light duty vehicles for various City departments for a total cost of $1,576,454.00.
Funding is available from the Equipment Renewal and Replacement Fund budget in the amount of
$1,530,235.00 and the Airport Operations & Maintenance Fund budget in the amount
$46,219.00, for a total amount of $1,576,454.00. [Ben Gorzell Jr., Chief Financial Officer; Troy
Elliott, Deputy Chief Financial Officer, Finance]

Councilmember Rocha Garcia moved to Approve on the Consent Agenda. Councilmember Castillo
seconded the motion. The motion carried by the following vote:

Aye: Nirenberg, Bravo, McKeeRodriguez, Viagran, Rocha Garcia, Castillo, Cabello
Havrda, Pelaez, Courage, Perry

Absent: Sandoval



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Exhibit I

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  |[4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
item Description Quantity |TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9181 210-245-4706
1 Compact Hybrid Sedan - White: 11
Price Each: $24,502.00 $26,754.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $269,522.00 $294,294.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Corollal
Hybrid LE|

2023 Toyota Corollaj
Hybrid LE, 1.8L 4Cyl|
Elec. Continously
Variable Trans
36m/36,000 Bumper to|
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

Not Provided|
Not Provided
Not Provided|

Not Provided|

2023 Toyota Prius LE

Prius LE, 1.8L 16V]
4Cyl

Hybrid Synergy Drive
System

36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  |4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
2 Compact Hybrid Sedan — OEM Dark Color: 4
Price Each: $24,502.00) $26,754.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $98,008.00) $107,016.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Corolla|
Hybrid LE|

2023 Toyota Corolla|
Hybrid LE, 1.8L 4Cyl|
Elec. Continously|
Variable Trans
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000|
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty|

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

2023 Toyota Prius LE

Prius LE, 1.8L 16V
4Cyl

Hybrid Synergy Drive
System

36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided|
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  |4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
ltem Description Quantity |TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
3 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan - White: 4
Price Each: No Bid $27,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $111,980.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Camery|
LE Hybrid|

2023 Toyota Camery
LE Hybrid 2.5L 4Cyl||
Elec. Continously|
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000)
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

Not Provided|
Not Provided|
Not Provided|

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  [4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity |TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
4 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan — OEM Dark: 16
Price Each: No Bid $27,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $447,920.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Camry LE]
Hybrid

2023 Toyota Camry LE|
Hybrid 2.5L 4Cyl

Elec. Continously,
Variable Trans|
36m/36,000 Bumper to}
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty|

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided|
Not Provided|

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity (TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
5 Compact Electric Sedan - White: 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $28,316.00 No Bid No Bid $29,775.00 $57,440.00
Total: $141,580.00 $148,875.00 $287,200.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV|

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV|
Electric Dr. Unit 200HP

Single Trans
36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper
5yr/100,000 Powertrain,

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

120-160 Days!
TBD)
TBD)

No

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV
1FB48

Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #,
Torgue (360 N-m)
CVT-1

5 yr/100,00 miles

Ancira Chev

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes

2022 Tesla Model 3
Long Range AWD
75 KW Battery

Automatic
Attached. 4 yr / 50k mi

Tesla Inc
23011 W I-10, San|
Antonio, TX 78257

90 Days
6/31/2022
5/15/2022

No




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
ltem Description Quantity |[TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
6 Electric Utility Vehicle - White: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $31,485.00 No Bid No Bid $32,970.00 No Bid
Total: $31,485.00 $32,970.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Chevlet Bolt EUV

2023 Chevlet Bolt EUV|

Single Ban Trans
36m/36,000 mls|
Bumper to Bumpe
5yr/100,000 Powertrain|

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No|

2022-2023 Cheviet
Bolt EUV 1FF48
Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #
Torgue (360 N-m)
CVT-1

5 yr/100,00 miles

Ancira Chev

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX|
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes|




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  [4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
ltem Description Quantity |TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
7 Electric Utility Vehicle — OEM Dark Color: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid| $31,485.00 No Bid No Bid $32,970.00 No Bid
Total: $31,485.00, $32,970.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date?

2023 Chevlet Bolt EVU

2023 Chevlet Bolt EVU

Single Trans
36m/36,000 mls
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/100,000 Powertrain

Local Dealer
Local Dealer,

120-160 Days|
TBD|
TBD|

Noj

2022-2023 Chevlet
Bolt EUV 1FF48!
Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #|
Torgue (360 N-m)
CVT-1

5 yr/100,00 miles

Angira Chev|

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Nen-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  |4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
ltem Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
8 Electric Police Response Sedan Long Range: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $56,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $56,695.00)

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Ford Mustang
Mach-E|

2023 Mach-E 70WH|
STD Battery,

Single Speed Trans|
36m/36,000 mis]
Bumper to Bumper]
5yr/60,000 Powertrain|
8yr Battery Warranty|
Local Dealer|

Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

Noj




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. 4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
item Description Quantity |TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
9 Electric Truck Long Range w/Charger: 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $61,299.00 $55,424.00] No Bid No Bid
Total: $306,495.00! $277,120.00]

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model! of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Ford Lightneen F
150 4x4]

2023 Ford Lightneen F
150 Extended Battery,

Single Speed|
Transmission)|
36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper]
5yr/60,000 Powertrain|
8yr Battery Warrantyj

Local Dealer|

Local Dealer|

120-160 Days|
TBD
TBD]

No

2022 or 2023 F150]

Lightning AWD Super]|
Crew 5.5' Bo:

Dual eMotor -

Extended Range]

Battery (FLT)

Ford Single-Speed

Automatic

36 months or 36,000

miles|

Cavender Grande|
Ford

4562 |H-10 Easf]
San Antonio, TX
78219

365 Days|
July 29th 2022
July 29th 2022

No




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N.  [4562 IH-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
ltem Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
10 Electric Truck Standard Range No Charger: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $53,664.00 $46,219.00) No Bid No Bid
Total: $53,664.00 $46,219.00)
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Ford Lightning F-[[2022 or 2023 Lightning|
150 4x4| AWD Super Crew 5.5/
Bo!
Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine 2023 Ford Lightning F-| Dual eMotor -
Offered (Include SAE Net HP): 150 Standard Battery| Standard Battery|
Transmission Offered: Single Speed Trans| Ford Single-Speed|
Automatic
Warranty: 36m/36,000 mis Base 36 months or|
Bumper to Bumpel 36,000 miles|
5yr/60,000 Powertrain|
8yr Battery Warrantyj
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Local Dealer] Cavender Grande|
ord|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Local Dealer| 4562 1H-10 East
San Antonio, TX|
78219
Delivery: 120-160 Days 365 Days|
Production Cut-off Date: TBD| July 29th 2022
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract TBD) July 29th 2022
without missing the production cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted, No Nol
after the production cut-off date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30] Net 30 Net 30
Total: $367,530.00 $961,210.00 $204,550.00 $416,854.00 $323,339.00 $214,815.00 $287,200.00
Total Award: $367,530.00 $559,900.00 $204,550.00 $56,695.00 $323,339.00




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 13, 2022 ' HS
For: All Electric Vehicle for Law Enforcement Tesla Inc.
6100015466 LD 45500 Fremont Blvd.
Freemont,
Item Description Quantity |CA 94538
415-792-2642
1 Electric Police Response Sedan Long Range: 1
Price Each: $64,440.00
Total: $64,440.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: Model Year 2022 Tesla|
Model Y Long Range AWD
Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered 74KWh Li-lon Battery, 361
Engine Offered Include SAE Net HP: Kw Power
Transmission Offered: Automatic
Warranty: 4 Yr/50,000 Mi New Vehicle
¢ Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tesla Motors TX
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 23011 IH-10 West, San
Antonio, TX 78257
Delivery: 90 Days
Month of Production Cut-off Date: 6/1/2022
Last month order can be placed without missing 6/1/2022
cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
Payment Terms: Net 30
Total: $64,440.00
Total Award: $64,440.00
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