City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
1 Compact Hybrid Sedan - White: 11
Price Each: $24,502.00 $26,754.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $269,522.00 $294,294.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:
Production Cut-off Date:
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract

without missing the production cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Corolla
Hybrid LE

2023 Toyota Corolla
Hybrid LE, 1.8L 4Cyl
Elec. Continously
Variable Trans
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty,

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

2023 Toyota Prius LE

Prius LE, 1.8L 16V
4Cyl

Hybrid Synergy Drive
System

36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
2 Compact Hybrid Sedan — OEM Dark Color: 4
Price Each: $24,502.00 $26,754.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $98,008.00 $107,016.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Corolla
Hybrid LE

2023 Toyota Corolla
Hybrid LE, 1.8L 4Cyl
Elec. Continously|
Variable Trans
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty,

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided

2023 Toyota Prius LE

Prius LE, 1.8L 16V
4Cyl

Hybrid Synergy Drive
System

36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
3 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan - White: 4
Price Each: No Bid $27,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $111,980.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Camery
LE Hybrid

2023 Toyota Camery
LE Hybrid 2.5L 4Cyl
Elec. Continously
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
4 Mid-Size Hybrid Sedan — OEM Dark: 16
Price Each: No Bid $27,995.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $447,920.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Hybrid Engine Offered (Include
SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,

after the production cut-off date:

2023 Toyota Camry LE
Hybrid

2023 Toyota Camry LE
Hybrid 2.5L 4Cyl

Elec. Continously
Variable Trans
36m/36,000 Bumper to
Bumper, 5yr/60,000
Powertrain 8yr/100,000
Battery Warranty

Local Dealer
Local Dealer

Not Provided
Not Provided
Not Provided

Not Provided




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
5 Compact Electric Sedan - White: 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $28,316.00 No Bid No Bid $29,775.00 $57,440.00
Total: $141,580.00 $148,875.00 $287,200.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV|
Electric Dr. Unit 200HP

Single Trans
36m/36,000 mls
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/100,000 Powertrain

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No

2023 Chevolet Bolt EV
1FB48

Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #

Torque (360 N-m)
CVT-1
5 yr/100,00 miles

Ancira Chev

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes

2022 Tesla Model 3
Long Range AWD
75 kW Battery

Automatic
Attached. 4 yr / 50k mi

Tesla Inc
23011 W 1-10, San
Antonio, TX 78257

90 Days
6/31/2022
5/15/2022

No




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
6 Electric Utility Vehicle - White: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $31,485.00 No Bid No Bid $32,970.00 No Bid
Total: $31,485.00 $32,970.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Chevlet Bolt EUV

2023 Chevlet Bolt EUV

Single Ban Trans
36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/100,000 Powertrain

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No

2022-2023 Chevlet
Bolt EUV 1FF48
Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #

Torgue (360 N-m)
CVT-1
5 yr/100,00 miles

Ancira Chev

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
7 Electric Utility Vehicle — OEM Dark Color: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid $31,485.00 No Bid No Bid $32,970.00 No Bid
Total: $31,485.00 $32,970.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:
Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date?

2023 Chevlet Bolt EVU

2023 Chevlet Bolt EVU

Single Trans
36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/100,000 Powertrain

Local Dealer|
Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No

2022-2023 Chevlet
Bolt EUV 1FF48
Electric Drive 200HP
(150KW) @ 266 #
Torgue (360 N-m)
CVT-1

5 yr/100,00 miles

Ancira Chev

6111 Bandera Rd.,
San Antonio, TX
78238

180 Days
April 2023
March 2023

Yes




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
8 Electric Police Response Sedan Long Range: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $56,695.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total: $56,695.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):
Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Ford Mustang
Mach-E

2023 Mach-E 70WH
STD Battery

Single Speed Trans

36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/60,000 Powertrain
8yr Battery Warranty
Local Dealer

Local Dealer

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
9 Electric Truck Long Range w/Charger: 5
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $61,299.00 $55,424.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $306,495.00 $277,120.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine
Offered (Include SAE Net HP):

Transmission Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date:

Last day that the city can place orders under this contract
without missing the production cut-off date:

Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted,
after the production cut-off date:

2023 Ford Lightneen F
150 4x4

2023 Ford Lightneen F
150 Extended Battery

Single Speed
Transmission
36m/36,000 mis
Bumper to Bumper|
5yr/60,000 Powertrain
8yr Battery Warranty

Local Dealer|

Local Dealer|

120-160 Days
TBD
TBD

No

2022 or 2023 F150
Lightning AWD Super
Crew 5.5' Box

Dual eMotor -
Extended Range
Battery (FLT)

Ford Single-Speed
Automatic

36 months or 36,000
miles

Cavender Grande
Ford

4562 IH-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219

365 Days
July 29th 2022
July 29th 2022

No




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 27, 2022 Non-Local
Alternate Bid Non- Local Non- Local Non- Local Local Non- Local Non- Local
For: Purchase of Light Duty Vehicles Silsbee Toyota Silsbee Toyota Lake Country Silsbee Ford Cavender Grande Caldwell Country Tesla Inc
Chevrolet Ford Chevrolet
6100015208 LD 1396 Hwy 327 E 1396 Hwy 327 E 2152 N Wheeler St. 1211 U.S. Hwy 96 N. (4562 |H-10 East PO Box 27 45500 Fremont Blvd
Silsbee, Silsbee, Jasper, Silsbee, San Antonio, Caldwell, Fremont,
Item Description Quantity [TX 77656 TX 77656 TX 75951 TX 77656 TX 78219 TX 77836 CA 94538
409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 409-880-9191 210-245-4706
10 Electric Truck Standard Range No Charger: 1
Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid $53,664.00 $46,219.00 No Bid No Bid
Total: $53,664.00 $46,219.00
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Ford Lightning F-|[2022 or 2023 Lightning
150 4x4{f AWD Super Crew 5.5'
Box
Specific Make & Model of Electric Powered Engine 2023 Ford Lightning F- Dual eMotor -
Offered (Include SAE Net HP): 150 Standard Battery Standard Battery
Transmission Offered: Single Speed Trans Ford Single-Speed
Automatic
Warranty: 36m/36,000 mis Base 36 months or
Bumper to Bumper 36,000 miles
5yr/60,000 Powertrain
8yr Battery Warranty
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Local Dealer Cavender Grande
Ford
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Local Dealer 4562 |H-10 East
San Antonio, TX
78219
Delivery: 120-160 Days 365 Days
Production Cut-off Date: TBD July 29th 2022
Last day that the city can place orders under this contract TBD July 29th 2022
without missing the production cut-off date:
Can bidder provide bid items, at the bid price submitted, No No
after the production cut-off date:
Payment Terms: Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total: $367,530.00 $961,210.00 $204,550.00 $416,854.00 $323,339.00 $214,815.00 $287,200.00
Total Award: $367,530.00 $559,900.00 $204,550.00 $56,695.00 $323,339.00
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