Opened:

November 3, 2023

OMNIA

For: Annual Contract for Rehrig Refuse Containers & Replacement Parts [Rehrig Pacific Company
6100017551 JF 625 W. Mockingbird Ln.
Item Description Estimated Annual [Dallas,
Quantity TX 75247
830-992-0121
1 95 -98 Gallon EnviroGuard Roll-Out Nestable 5,000
Cart. Color of Cart and Lid to be Specified on
Purchase Order
Model EnviroGuard 95EG
Part Number ROC-95EG BRAILE LID
Color BLUE/BROWN/GREEN
Unit List Price each $56.00
Line Total $280,000.00
2 63 -68 Gallon EnviroGuard Roll-Out Nestable 5,000
Cart. Color of Cart and Lid to be Specified on
Purchase Order
Model 65NB/65EG
Part Number ROC-65NB BRAILE LID
Color BLUE/BROWN/GREEN
Unit List Price each $51.00
Line Total $255,000.00
3 44 -48 Gallon Roll-Out Nestable Cart. Color of 1,000 No Bid
Cart and Lid to be Specified on Purchase
Order
Model
Part Number
Color
Unit List Price each
Line Total
4 24 -36 Gallon Metal Bar Roll-Out Nestable 1
Cart. Color of Cart and Lid to be Specified on
Purchase Order
Model 35EG
Part Number ROC-35EG BRAILE LID
Color BLUE/BROWN/GREEN
Unit List Price each $50.91
Line Total $50.91
5 95 - 98 Gallon EnviroGuard Roll-Out Nestable 5,000
Cart Lid
Model 95 LID BRAILE
Part Number ROC-95 LID CUSTOM BRAILE
Color BLUE/BROWN/GREEN/
YELLOW/RED/ORANGE
Unit List Price each $20.00
Line Total $100,000.00
6 63 - 68 Gallon EnviroGuard Roll-Out Nestable 5,000
Cart Lid
Model 65 LID BRAILE
Part Number ROC-65 LID CUSTOM BRAILE
Color BLUE/BROWN/GREEN/
YELLOW/RED/ORANGE
Unit List Price each $19.00

Line Total

$95,000.00




Opened: November 3, 2023 OMNIA
For: Annual Contract for Rehrig Refuse Containers & Replacement Parts [Rehrig Pacific Company
6100017551 JF 625 W. Mockingbird Ln.
Item Description Estimated Annual [Dallas,
Quantity TX 75247
830-992-0121
7 44 - 48 Gallon Roll-Out Nestable Cart Lid 1,000 No Bid
Model
Part Number
Color
Unit List Price each
Line Total
8 24 - 36 Gallon Metal Bar Roll-Out Nestable 1
Cart Lid
Model 35 LID BRAILE
Part Number ROC-35 LID CUSTOM BRAILE
Color BLUE/BROWN/BLACK
Unit List Price each $18.00
Line Total $18.00
9 Wheels 2,000
Size 10 INCH WHEEL
Model BMSO WHEEL
Part Number ROC-10" BWHEEL
Colors BLACK
Unit List Price each $6.00
Line Total $12,000.00
10 Wheels 2,000
Size 8 INCH WHEEL
Model BMSO WHEEL
Part Number ROC-8" BWHEEL
Colors BLACK
Unit List Price each $6.00
Line Total $12,000.00
11 Hinge for Lid 1,000 No Bid
Model
Part Number
Colors
Unit List Price each
Line Total
12 Fastener for Lid 1,000
Model LID PIN
Part Number ROC-LID PIN
Color BLACK
Unit List Price each $1.00
Line Total $1,000.00
13 Deleted
14 Deleted




Opened: November 3, 2023 OMNIA
For: Annual Contract for Rehrig Refuse Containers & Replacement Parts [Rehrig Pacific Company
6100017551 JF 625 W. Mockingbird Ln.
Item Description Estimated Annual [Dallas,
Quantity TX 75247
830-992-0121
15 Axel 1,000
Size 22.651 INCHES
Model AXLE 95
Part Number ROC-AXLE-95
Color METAL
Unit List Price each $6.00
Line Total $6,000.00
16 Axel 1,000
Size 9.45 INCHES
Model AXLE 65
Part Number ROC-AXLE-65
Color METAL
Unit List Price each $6.00
Line Total $6,000.00
17 Deleted
18 Stop Bar: 1,000
Size 8.25 INCHES
Model METAL CATCH BAR
Part Number ROC METAL CB
Color GRAY]
Unit List Price each $4.00
Line Total $4,000.00
19 Deleted
20 Deleted
21 Cart Recycling Credit for Plastic Recovered 5,000
Unit List Price each $1.25
Line Total $6,250.00
22 Freight, per cart, FOB Destination for 95 — 98 5,000
Gallon Cart
Unit List Price each (95 EG) $1.25
Line Total $6,250.00
23 Freight, per cart, FOB Destination for 63 — 68 5,000
Gallon Cart
Unit List Price each (65 EG) $2.13
Line Total $10,650.00
Freight, per cart, FOB Destination for 63 — 68 5000
Gallon Cart
Unit List Price each (65 NB) $2.85

Line Total

$14,250.00




Opened: November 3, 2023 OMNIA
For: Annual Contract for Rehrig Refuse Containers & Replacement Parts [Rehrig Pacific Company
6100017551 JF 625 W. Mockingbird Ln.
Item Description Estimated Annual [Dallas,
Quantity TX 75247
830-992-0121
24 Freight, per cart, FOB Destination for 44 — 48 1,000 No Bid
Gallon Cart
Unit List Price each
Line Total
25 Freight, per cart, FOB Destination for 24 — 36 1
Gallon Cart
Unit List Price each $3,150.00
Line Total $3,150.00
26 Deleted
27 Additional Items Needed for Installation 1
ltem 1 IML
Part Number IN-MOLD-LABEL
Unit List Price each 1.99
Item 2 HOTSTAMP CART
Part Number RB
Unit List Price each 350.00
Item 3 HOTSTAMP LID
Part Number BRAND PLATE
Unit List Price each 350.00
Line Total $701.99
Payment Terms Net 30




