

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
6100017970 JDLR			Ariens Company 655 West Ryan St. Brillion, WI 54110 920-756-4665	Dewinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 210-684-5296	Ewald Kubota, Inc. 1900 W IH 10 Seguin, TX 78155 830-755-5505	HCOP, LLC 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741
Item	Description	Quantity				
1	4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 115 HP min 9,400 lbs. Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid	No Bid	\$98,541.04 \$197,082.08 2024 Kubota M7-154D Kubota V6108 133 Horsepower 5 Range 16 Speed Powershift (30F/15R) Hyd. Syncho. Shuttle 3pt - 11,797 lbs. 24" behind 2 Year Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 Left Blank Left Blank	No Bid
2	Compact Tractor with Accessories Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$34,086.50 \$34,086.50 2024 Kubota L3302 Kubota D1803 31.4 Net HP Hydrostatic Drive 3 Range 1,506 Front Loader 2 Years Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 8/31/2024 Yes	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:	May 1, 2024	NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
For:	FY24 Landscaping Equipment	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 830-243-8855		Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 7920 Anderson Sq. Austin, TX 78757	
6100017970		JDLR			
Item	Description	Quantity			
1	4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 115 HP min 9,400 lbs. Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	NAS <div style="text-align: right;">\$94,950.00 \$189,900.00</div> <div style="text-align: right;">2024 John Deere 5120M John Deere 120 HP Engine 105PTO HP</div> <div style="text-align: right;">16F/16R - No rear roller blind or dark tent our AC system cool as they should</div> <div style="text-align: right;">5150 LBS</div> <div style="text-align: right;">2 Years or 2000 Hours whichever comes first</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Tellus Equipment SA, Castoville, Floresville, Seguin</div> <div style="text-align: right;">8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 any of the 20+ locations in Texas</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Quoted at time of PO</div> <div style="text-align: right;">probably Nov. 1</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Left Blank</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No but Maybe</div>		
2	Compact Tractor with Accessories Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	<div style="text-align: right;">\$28,800.00 \$28,800.00</div> <div style="text-align: right;">2024 John Deere 3025E with 300E Loader and RC2060 Frontier Rotary Cutter</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Yanmar 24.4 HP Engine 17.4 HP PTO</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Hydro with 2 Speed Hi-Low Range not 3 range</div> <div style="text-align: right;">1356 LBS 3PT</div> <div style="text-align: right;">2 Years or 2000 Hours comprehensive 6 Years or 2000 Hours Powertrain Whatever comes first</div> <div style="text-align: right;">Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC</div> <div style="text-align: right;">8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250</div> <div style="text-align: right;">30 Calendar Days</div> <div style="text-align: right;">August Usually</div> <div style="text-align: right;">July 31 Most Likely</div> <div style="text-align: right;">No But Can Try</div>		

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL			
6100017970			JDLR		Ariens Company 655 West Ryan St. Brillion, WI 54110 920-756-4665		Dewinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 210-684-5296		Ewald Kubota, Inc. 1900 W IH 10 Seguin, TX 78155 830-755-5505		HCOP, LLC 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741	
Item	Description	Quantity										
3.A	72 Inch Diesel Zero Turn Mower Liquid Cooled with Sun Canopv Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	Up to 2			No Bid \$18,270.00 \$36,540.00		2024 Husler HTHDZV072PER Perkins 1130 CC 25HP 72" Side Discharge 2 Year no HR limit or 5 year 1200 HR DeWinne Equipment Co. Inc. 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 21 Calendar Days 9/1/2024 8/15/2024 No		2024 Kubota ZD1211L-3-72 Kubota D1105 24.8 HP 72 inch Side Discharge 2 Year Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 8/31/2024 Yes		\$23,811.08 \$47,622.16 <	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 830-243-8855		NON-LOCAL Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 7920 Anderson Sq. Austin, TX 78757
6100017970			JDLR		
Item	Description	Quantity			
3.A	72 Inch Diesel Zero Turn Mower Liquid Cooled with Sun Canopy Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	Up to 2	\$19,670.00 \$39,340.00 2024 John Deere Z994R Yanmar 24.7 HP 72" Side Discharge 1st 24 Months no hour limitation or 3 Year 1500 Hour Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 60 - 90 Calendar Days Not Sure Not Sure No But Can Try		
			\$27,199.55 \$54,399.10 2024 Toro 72076 Yanmar 3TNV88C-DTR5 72" Turbo Force 5 Years / 2000 Hours Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 200 Trademark Drive Buda, TX 78610 21 Calendar Days 11/1/2024 9/2/2024 No		
3.B	Deleted				
4.A	60-inch Zero Turn Gas Mower Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	Up to 3	\$13,800.00 \$41,400.00 2024 John Deere Z950M Kawasaki FX850V 27HP Carbonated Engine Manual Choke per 4.7.10 72" Side Discharge 2 Years unlimited hours or 3 Year 1200 Hours Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 60 - 90 Calendar Days Not Sure Don't Know No But Can Try		
			\$13,421.60 \$40,264.80 2024 Gravelly 992519 Kawasaki FX1000V EFI 60" 5 Year / 1250 Hour Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 200 Trademark Drive Buda, TX 78610 21 Calendar Days 11/1/2024 9/2/2024 No		
	Subtotal Payment Terms Less Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price differential Non-Local Preference Award				
4.B	Deleted				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
6100017970 JDLR			Ariens Company 655 West Ryan St. Brillion, WI 54110 920-756-4665	Dewinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 210-684-5296	Ewald Kubota, Inc. 1900 W IH 10 Seguin, TX 78155 830-755-5505	HCOP, LLC 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741
Item	Description	Quantity				
5	7 ft. Shredder Mower Deck Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	8	No Bid	No Bid	\$12,850.00 \$102,800.00 2024 Land Pride RCF3684 Left Blank 84 inch 1 Year Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 8/31/2024 Yes	No Bid
6	15 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	No Bid	No Bid	\$24,746.50 \$74,239.50 2024 Land Pride RC5715 Left Blank 15 Foot 1 Year Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 120 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 8/31/2024 No	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:	May 1, 2024	NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
For:	FY24 Landscaping Equipment	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 830-243-8855		Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 7920 Anderson Sq. Austin, TX 78757	
6100017970		JDLR			
Item	Description	Quantity			
5	7 ft. Shredder Mower Deck	8	NAS		
	Price Each:		\$10,100.00	No Bid	
	Extended price:		\$80,800.00		
	Year, Make & Model Mower Offered:		2024 John Deere RC7R		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		RC7R 45HP Min Gear Case HP Continuos 205HP Peak		
	Mowing Deck Offered:		RC7R is a patented double decker design		
	Mower Warranty:		1 Year full 5 Years on Gearbox		
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas		
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250		
	Delivery		Must order for date		
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model	Up to John deere				
Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	Don't Know				
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	No But Can Try				
6	15 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter	3			
	Price Each:		\$27,600.00	No Bid	
	Extended price:		\$82,800.00		
	Year, Make & Model Mower Offered:		2024 John Deere FC15R		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		FC15R 300HP Tranfer Gearbox HP CAT6 Driveline and Torsional deck sus.		
	Mowing Deck Offered:		7 Gauge top and 3 qauge side skirt		
	Mower Warranty:		1 Year comprehensive and 5 Years Gearbox		
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas		
	Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250		
	Delivery		Must order for date		
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model	Up to John deere				
Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model	Can change at any time				
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	No But Can Try				

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL	LOCAL	NON-LOCAL	NON-LOCAL
6100017970 JDLR			Ariens Company 655 West Ryan St. Brillion, WI 54110 920-756-4665	Dewinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 210-684-5296	Ewald Kubota, Inc. 1900 W IH 10 Seguin, TX 78155 830-755-5505	HCOP, LLC 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741
Item	Description	Quantity				
7	Zero Turn Mower with 144" Batwing mower with 6 Extra Blades Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	On site 200 hour service at no charge \$67,549.00 \$67,549.00 2024 ExMark Lazer Z LZS86TDYM12RW0 Yanmar 3TNV86CT 43HP Exmark Batwing 144" 7 gauge welded deck 2 Year Full Warranty Hill Country Outdoor Power Any warranty repairs the machine will be picked up and returned at no charge 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741 30 Calendar Days N/A N/A N/A
8	4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 110 HP, min 12,500 lbs. Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid	No Bid	\$98,541.04 \$98,541.04 2024 Kubota M7-154D Kubota V6108 133HP 5 Range /6 Speed Powershift (30F/15R) Hyd. Syncho. Shuttle 3pt 11,797 lbs 24" behind 2 Year Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 1/1/2025 8/31/2024 No	No Bid

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
6100017970			JDLR			
Item	Description	Quantity	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 830-243-8855		Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 7920 Anderson Sq. Austin, TX 78757	
7	Zero Turn Mower with 144" Batwing mower with 6 Extra Blades Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid		NAS \$63,632.57 \$63,632.57 2024 Toro 72144 Yanmar 44 HP Turbo Diesel 3TNV86CT-DTR2 144" Turbo Force RD 5 Year / 1,500 Hour; 2 Year / No Hour Limit Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 200 Trademark Drive Buda, TX 78610 30 Calendar Days 10/1/2024 9/2/2024 No	
8	4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 110 HP, min 12,500 lbs. Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	\$124,100.00 \$124,100.00 John Deere 6110M - 2024 Year Model John Deere Engine 110HP rated with IPM 130 HP 16 / 16 8267 LBS 3PT 24M or 2000HRS whichever comes 1st Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 Must order for date Will have to see when PO issued Not Sure No But Can Try		No Bid	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL		LOCAL		NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
6100017970JDLR			Ariens Company 655 West Ryan St. Brillion, WI 54110 920-756-4665		Dewinne Equipment Company 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 210-684-5296		Ewald Kubota, Inc. 1900 W IH 10 Seguin, TX 78155 830-755-5505		HCOP, LLC 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741	
Item	Description	Quantity								
9	Brush Clearing - Tracked Skid Loader with Attachments Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	No Bid		No Bid		\$148,266.52 \$296,533.04 2024 Kubota SVL97-2HFC Kubota V3800 96HP 2 Speed Hydrostatic Bucker Breakout 7961 lbs Tipping Load 9143 lbs 2 Years Ewald Kubota 29171 I-10 W Boerne, TX 78006 90 Calendar Days 8/31/2024 8/31/2024 Yes		No Bid	
10	Zero Turn Mower with 104" Batwing mower with 6 Extra Blades Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Subtotal Payment Terms Less Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price differential Local Preference Award Payment Terms Total	1	No Bid		\$27,417.00 \$27,417.00 2024 Hustler 994058 Kawasaki Fx 1000 EFI 38.5 HP 104" 2 Year unlimited hours of 5 Year 1200 DeWinne Equipment Co. Inc. 11002 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 21 Calendar Days 9/1/2024 9/1/2024 No \$27,417.00 Net 30 \$27,417.00 1% \$375.96 \$27,417.00 Net 30 \$110,139.00		No Bid		On site 200 hour service at no charge \$33,449.00 \$33,449.00 2024 Exmark Lazer ZX 96" Batwing LZX980ECK96RWO Kohler Command Pro EFI 38.5 HP Exmark 96" Batwing 7 gauge welded deck 2 Year Full Warranty Hill Country Outdoor Power Any warranty repairs the machine will be picked up and returned at no charge 2914 Montopolis Drive #200 Austin, TX 78741 30 Calendar Days N/A N/A N/A Net 30 \$850,904.32 \$185,680.00	
Total Award			\$39,602.16		\$45,687.00		\$744,449.16		\$67,549.00	

City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 1, 2024 For: FY24 Landscaping Equipment			NON-LOCAL		NON-LOCAL	
6100017970			JDLR			
Item	Description	Quantity	Tellus Equipment Solutions, LLC 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 830-243-8855		Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 7920 Anderson Sq. Austin, TX 78757	
9	Brush Clearing - Tracked Skid Loader with Attachments Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Tractor Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Transmission Offered: Lift Capacity: Tractor Warranty: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	\$156,400.00 \$312,800.00 2024 John Deere 333P - With John Deere MH72D Mulch head and BA72C angle broom John Deere 333P 108HP Yanmar 4TNV94FHT (No oil cooler needed,oil cooler will void warranty) 2 Speed EH Controls Tipping Load 11,000LBS Break out force 7800LBS 24 Months or 2000 Hours whichever comes first Tellus Equipment Solutions LLC any of the 20+ locations in Texas 8587 Bandera Rd San Antonio, TX 78250 Must order for date Deere may change anytime sooner better No But Can Try		No Bid	
10	Zero Turn Mower with 104" Batwing mower with 6 Extra Blades Price Each: Extended price: Year, Make & Model Mower Offered: Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP): Mowing Deck Offered: Mower Warranty: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: Delivery Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	1	No Bid		\$27,041.04 \$27,041.04 2024 Hustler 944058 Kawasaki FX1000V 38.5HP EFI FXT00V-B540-R 104" 5 Year / 1200 Hour Top Gunn Equipment Rentals, Inc. 200 Trademark Drive Buda, TX 78610 30 Calendar Days 10/1/2024 9/2/2024 No Subtotal Payment Terms Less Prompt Payment Discount Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid Price differential Local Preference Award Payment Terms Total	
Total Award			\$28,800.00		\$185,337.51	