

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2025 For: Purchase of Forklifts and Man Lifts 6100018707			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Associated Supply Company Inc DBA Asco Equipment 2102 E Slaton Rd Lubbock, TX 79404 (806) 745-2000			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. dba Briggs Equipment, Inc. 5655 S Interstate 35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132 (210) 480-1480			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Octane Forklifts, Inc 4905 Lima Street Denver, CO 80239 (844) 628-2637		
CM											
Item	Description	Quantity									
1	Deleted										
2	Minimum 3,000lbs, 10ft Lift, Cushion Tired Forklift LPG	1									
	Price Each:		\$28,900.00			\$34,465.00			\$31,186.00		
	Extended Price:		\$28,900.00			\$34,465.00			\$31,186.00		
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2025 Bobcat GC15			2025 GC030N			2025 Octane FL20		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		GCT/GK25 50.6 HP			Yanmar 2.2 I LPG			Kubota WG2503-L 58.3HP		
	Warranty:		Standard 2 Year/3,000 Hour, Powertrain 3 Year/6,000 Hour, OCDB 5 Year/10,000 Hour			12 Months/ 2000 hrs ; 36 Months/ 6000 hrs powertrain			12 month / 2,000 hour manufacturers warranty		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Associated Supply Company Inc			Briggs Equipment			Equipment Depot		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		1920 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220			5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			5250 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247		
	Delivery		120 Days			210 Days (14-21 Alt Bid)			180-210 Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		6/8/2025						12/31/2025		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		10/8/2025			6/1/2025			9/30/2025		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No			Yes			No		
3	Minimum 5,000lbs, 20ft Lift, Cushion Tired Forklift LPG	1	NAS								
	Price Each:		\$37,100.00			\$41,247.00			\$35,061.00		
	Extended Price:		\$37,100.00			\$41,247.00			\$35,061.00		
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2025 Bobcat G25E-7 LP			2025 GC050N			2025 Octane FY25		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		HMC 2.4 59HP			PSI 2.4 LPG			Kubota WG2503-L 58.3HP		
	Warranty:		Standard 2 Year/3,000 Hour, Powertrain 3 Year/6,000 Hour, OCDB 5 Year/10,000 Hour			12 Months/ 2000 hrs ; 36 Months/ 6000 hrs powertrain			12 month / 2,000 hour manufacturers warranty		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Associated Supply Company Inc			Briggs Equipment			Equipment Depot		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		1920 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220			5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			5250 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247		
	Delivery		120 Days			255 Days (Alt Bid 14-21 Days)			180-210 Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		6/8/2025						12/31/2025		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		10/8/2025			6/1/2025			9/30/2025		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No			Yes			No		

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2025 For: Purchase of Forklifts and Man Lifts 6100018707			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. dba Briggs Equipment, Inc. 5655 S Interstate 35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Crown Equipment Corporation 8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Shoppas Material Handling LTD 15217 Grand River Rd Fort Worth, TX 76155-2731		
			CM								
Item	Description	Quantity									
1	Deleted		<b>Alternate Bid</b>								
2	Minimum 3,000lbs, 10ft Lift, Cushion Tired Forklift LPG	1									
	Price Each:		\$35,027.00			\$33,065.54			\$30,280.00		
	Extended Price:		\$35,027.00			\$33,065.54			\$30,280.00		
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2024 GLC050LX			2024 Crown CGC15			Toyota 50-8FGCU15		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		PSI 2.4 LPG			GCT / GK25L 50.6HP			2.2L 4Y-US Industrial LP 51HP		
	Warranty:		12 Months/ 2000 hrs ; 36 Months/ 6000 hrs powertrain			24 month / 4,000 hours power train			12 months / 2,000 hour ; 36 month / 6,000 hours powertrain		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Briggs Equipment			Crown Lift Trucks			Toyota Lift of South Texas		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219			4001 N PanAm Expy San Antonio, TX 78219-2206		
	Delivery		14-21 Days			30 Days			16 - 18 Weeks		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model					12/28/2024			N/A		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		6/1/2025			1/23/2025			N/A		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		Yes			No			N/A		
3	Minimum 5,000lbs, 20ft Lift, Cushion Tired Forklift LPG	1	<b>NAS</b>								
	Price Each:		\$35,027.00			\$47,524.35			NO BID		
	Extended Price:		\$35,027.00			\$47,524.35					
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2024 GLC050LX			2025 Crown C51000-50					
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		PSI 2.4 LPG			Crown Industrial 4cyd					
	Warranty:		12 Months/ 2000 hrs ; 36 Months/ 6000 hrs powertrain			48 month / 8,000 hours					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Briggs Equipment			Crown Lift Trucks					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219					
	Delivery		14-21 Days			90 Days					
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model					12/26/2025					
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		6/1/2025			11/15/2025					
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		Yes			Yes					

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2025 For: Purchase of Forklifts and Man Lifts					
6100018707			CM		
			NON-LOCAL		
			NON-LOCAL		
			NON-LOCAL		
			Associated Supply Company Inc DBA Asco Equipment 2102 E Slaton Rd Lubbock, TX 79404 (806) 745-2000		
			Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. dba Briggs Equipment, Inc. 5655 S Interstate 35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132 (210) 480-1480		
			Octane Forklifts, Inc 4905 Lima Street Denver, CO 80239 (844) 628-2637		
Item	Description	Quantity			
4	Minimum 15,000lbs, 20ft Lift, Tired Forklift LPG	1	NAS		
	Price Each:		\$95,850.00	\$106,853.00	\$91,614.00
	Extended Price:		\$95,850.00	\$106,853.00	\$91,614.00
	Year, Make & Model Offered:		2025 Bobcat G70S-7	Yale 2025 G155VX	2025 Octane FY70
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		PSI 4.3L 93 HP	3.8 Kubota LPG 91HP	PSI GM 4.3 - 104HP
	Warranty:		Standard 2 Year/3,000 Hour, Powertrain 3 Year/6,000 Hour, OCDB 5 Year/10,000 Hour	12 Months/ 2000 hrs ; 36 Months/ 6000 hrs powertrain	12 month / 2,000 hour manufacturers warranty
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Associated Supply Company Inc	Briggs Equipment	Equipment Depot
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		1920 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78220	5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132	5250 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247
	Delivery		120 Days	175 Days	180-210 Days
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		6/8/2025		12/31/2024
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		10/8/2025	6/1/2025	9/30/2025
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No	Yes	No
5	Minimum 500lbs, 32ft Working Height, Man Lift - Electric	1	NO BID		
	Price Each:			\$20,980.00	\$26,861.00
	Extended Price:			\$20,980.00	\$26,861.00
	Year, Make & Model Offered:			2025 Genie G2632 E Drive	2025 GMG 2632i
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):				Electric / AGM Battery
	Warranty:			Standard 12 Month Manufacturer Warranty	24 month parts and service warranty 60 month structural components warranty
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:			Briggs Equipment	Equipment Depot
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:			5655 S I-35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132	5250 N Loop 1604 E San Antonio, TX 78247
	Delivery			70 Days	30 Days
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model				12/31/2024
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model			6/1/2025	10/31/2025
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:			Yes	No
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
	Total:		\$161,850.00	\$203,545.00	\$184,722.00
	Total Award:		\$28,900.00	\$127,833.00	\$35,061.00

Deleted Item(s): Item 1 - will be rebid

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: January 8, 2025 For: Purchase of Forklifts and Man Lifts 6100018707			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. dba Briggs Equipment, Inc. 5655 S Interstate 35 Frontage Road New Braunfels, TX 78132			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Crown Equipment Corporation 8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219			<b>NON-LOCAL</b> Shoppas Material Handling LTD 15217 Grand River Rd Fort Worth, TX 76155-2731		
CM											
Item	Description	Quantity									
4	Minimum 15,000lbs, 20ft Lift, Tired Forklift LPG	1				<b>NAS</b>					
	Price Each:		NO BID			\$101,604.04			NO BID		
	Extended Price:					\$101,604.04					
	Year, Make & Model Offered:					2025 Crown CG70					
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):					PSI 4.3L (Tier III)					
	Warranty:					36 month / 6,000 hour warranty					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:					Crown Lift Trucks					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:					8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219					
	Delivery					120 Days					
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model					12/28/2024					
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model					11/15/2025					
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					Yes					
5	Minimum 500lbs, 32ft Working Height, Man Lift - Electric	1				<b>NAS</b>					
	Price Each:		NO BID			\$21,925.16			NO BID		
	Extended Price:					\$21,925.16					
	Year, Make & Model Offered:					2025 JLG ES2632					
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):					Electric					
	Warranty:					12 months					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:					Crown Lift Trucks					
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:					8302 NE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78219					
	Delivery					60 Days					
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model					12/26/2025					
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model					11/15/2025					
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:					Yes					
	Payment Terms		Net 30			Net 30			Net 30		
	Total:		\$70,054.00			\$204,119.09			\$30,280.00		
<b>Total Award:</b>											

Deleted Item(s): Item 1 - will be rebid