
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Alternate Bid
Opened: August 28, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Off Road Equipment American Sales & Service Inc. Associated Supply Company Inc. BD Holt Co. Harris County Rentals LLC HCOP, LLC Vermeer Equipment of Texas LLC

5515 Dietrich Rd. DBA ASCO Equipment Holt Texas LTD DBA Holt Cat DBA Texas State Rentals Hill Country Outdoor Power 3025 State Hwy 161
San Antonio, TX 78219 2102 E Slaton RD 5665 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200 Irving, TX 75062

6100017289 JDLR 1-800-458-6258 Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 Austin, TX 78741 210-337-7700
Item Description Quantity 806-745-2000 979-324-0336 512-557-8454 210-584-5981

1 Deleted

2 Tired Pneumatic Roller 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $132,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended price: $132,000.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 / 2024 CW16

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: CAT C3.4B
(Include SAE NET HP): 100.5 HP

Warranty: 12 Month / Unlimited Hours Total Machine

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Holt Cat

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

Delivery 185 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 9/30/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing None
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes

3 Walk-Behind Trencher & Trailer Combo 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $23,000.00
Extended price: $23,000.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2024 Vermeer RTX250

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kohler Command Pro ECH740
(Include SAE NET HP): 25 HP

Warranty: 3 Year / 3,000 Hour

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Vermeer Equipment of Texas

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 16593 IH 35 N
Selma, TX 78154

Delivery 180 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/31/2024

Last day order can be placed without missing 12/31/2024
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

4 6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG 2

Price Each: No Bid $33,999.00 No Bid $30,358.39 No Bid No Bid
Extended price: $67,998.00 $60,716.78

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Doosan G30E-7 2023 Liugong CLG 2030 G-3

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Hyundai 2.4 L4KB-C1 Kubota 2.5L
(Include SAE NET HP): 65 HP 59 HP

Warranty: 24M / 3000 hr Factory 3 Year Warranty
36M / 3000 hr Drivetrain

60M / 10,000 Oil Cooled Disc Brakes

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: ASCO Equipment Texas State Rentals
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 28, 2023
For: Off Road Equipment

6100017289 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 Deleted

2 Tired Pneumatic Roller 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

3 Walk-Behind Trencher & Trailer Combo 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

4 6,000 lb. Pneumatic Tired Forklift LPG 2

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
BossTx Inc. Crown Equipment Corporation DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA Boss JCB DBA Crown Lift Trucks 11002 Bandera Road Hill Country Outdoor Power
3744 SE Loop 410 8302 N.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78250 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78741

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid $48,865.55 No Bid No Bid
$97,731.10

2023 Crown C51050-06

Crown 2.5L LPG Engine
59 HP @ 2800 RPM

1 Year / Unlimited Hours

Crown Lift Trucks
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Alternate Bid
Opened: August 28, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Off Road Equipment American Sales & Service Inc. Associated Supply Company Inc. BD Holt Co. Harris County Rentals LLC HCOP, LLC Vermeer Equipment of Texas LLC

5515 Dietrich Rd. DBA ASCO Equipment Holt Texas LTD DBA Holt Cat DBA Texas State Rentals Hill Country Outdoor Power 3025 State Hwy 161
San Antonio, TX 78219 2102 E Slaton RD 5665 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200 Irving, TX 75062

6100017289 JDLR 1-800-458-6258 Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 Austin, TX 78741 210-337-7700
Item Description Quantity 806-745-2000 979-324-0336 512-557-8454 210-584-5981

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220

Delivery 120 Days 120 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/15/2023 10/31/2023

Last day order can be placed without missing 10/15/2023 11/15/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No

5 Stand-On Blower 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,500.00 No Bid
Extended price: $10,500.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 Scag Windstorm

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: WS23-37BV-EFI 37 HP
(Include SAE NET HP): Brigs Vanguard Fuel Injected

Warranty: 2 Years

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Hill Country Outdoor Power

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
Austin, TX 78741

Delivery 7 - 10 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model N/A

Last day order can be placed without missing N/A
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: N/A

Subtotal $10,500.00
Payment Terms Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $10,500.00
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:
Price differential
Non-Local Preference Award $10,500.00

6 525 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water 2
Pressure Washer

Price Each: $22,295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,250.00 No Bid
Extended price: $44,590.00 $52,500.00

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 American Sales Custom Build 2023 MTM HS 4000PSI 4.0 GPM

400 Gallon Dual Axle Trailer
(Please note changes from Specs)

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Alfota 6455 J Hot Water Washer with Honda 668 cc

(Include SAE NET HP): Honda GX800 with 24.9 HP (18.6kW) @ Gas Engine GX630

3,600 rpm (SAE J1349)

Warranty: 1 Year 3 Year limited engine and coil
7 year limited pump

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: American Sales and Service Hill Country Outdoor Power

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5515 Dietrich Rd. 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78741
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 28, 2023
For: Off Road Equipment

6100017289 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

5 Stand-On Blower 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms
Less Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:
Price differential
Non-Local Preference Award

6 525 Gallon Trailer Mounted Hot Water 2
Pressure Washer

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:

(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
BossTx Inc. Crown Equipment Corporation DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA Boss JCB DBA Crown Lift Trucks 11002 Bandera Road Hill Country Outdoor Power
3744 SE Loop 410 8302 N.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78250 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78741

8302 N.E. Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78219

220 Days

N/A

10/1/2023

Yes

No Bid No Bid $11,899.00 $12,300.00
$11,899.00 $12,300.00

2023 Billy Goat Z3000 2023 Billy Goat Z3000

Briggs and Stratton Vanguard Briggs Vanguard
35 HP 35 HP

2 Year Limited 2 Years

DeWinne Equipment Compnay Inc. Hill Country Outdoor Power

11002 Bandera Road 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

15 Days 7 - 10 Days

10/1/2023 N/A

9/29/2023 N/A

If Available N/A

$11,899.00 $12,300.00
Net 30 Net 30

$11,899.00 $12,300.00
13.32%

$1,399.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid $26,250.00
$52,500.00

2023 MTM HS 4000PSI 4.0 GPM

400 Gallon Dual Axle Trailer
(Please note changes from Specs)

Honda 668 cc

Gas Engine GX630

3 Year limited engine and coil
7 year limited pump

Hill Country Outdoor Power

2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
Austin, TX 78741
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Alternate Bid
Opened: August 28, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Local Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Off Road Equipment American Sales & Service Inc. Associated Supply Company Inc. BD Holt Co. Harris County Rentals LLC HCOP, LLC Vermeer Equipment of Texas LLC

5515 Dietrich Rd. DBA ASCO Equipment Holt Texas LTD DBA Holt Cat DBA Texas State Rentals Hill Country Outdoor Power 3025 State Hwy 161
San Antonio, TX 78219 2102 E Slaton RD 5665 SE Loop 410 803 SE Loop 410 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200 Irving, TX 75062

6100017289 JDLR 1-800-458-6258 Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78220 Austin, TX 78741 210-337-7700
Item Description Quantity 806-745-2000 979-324-0336 512-557-8454 210-584-5981

Delivery 60 Days 14 - 28 Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/1/2023 N/A

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2023 N/A
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes Yes

7 Loader Backhoe with 24” Bucket 1

Price Each: No Bid $99,250.00 $128,000.00 $106,089.01 No Bid No Bid
Extended price: $99,250.00 $128,000.00 $106,089.01

Year, Make & Model Offered: 2023 CASE 580SV Extendahoe 2023 / 2024 416 2023 New Holland B95D Extendahoe

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: FPT F5BFL413B*B CAT C3.6 FPT F5BFL413B
(Include SAE NET HP): 98 HP 86 HP 95 HP

Warranty: 1 Year Unlimited Hour 12 Month / Unlimited Hours Total Machine 1 Year / Unlimited Hours

2 Year / 2000 hr Factory Warranty
Holt Cat

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: ASCO Equipment Texas State Rentals
5665 SE Loop 410

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 1920 SE Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78222 803 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220 San Antonio, TX 78220

210 Days
Delivery 120 Days 120 Days

10/30/2023
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 10/15/2023 11/30/2023

None
Last day order can be placed without missing 10/15/2023 11/30/2023
cut-off date for current year model

Yes
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No No

Subtotal $99,250.00 $128,000.00 $106,089.01
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $99,250.00 $128,000.00 $106,089.01
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid: 6.89%
Price differential $106,089.01
Non-Local Preference Award $99,250.00

8 Hammer Attachment 1

Price Each: No Bid No Bid $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended price: $10,000.00

Make & Model Offered: CAT B6S

Warranty: 12 Month / Unlimited Hours Total Machine

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Holt Cat

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5665 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

Delivery 60 Days

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $44,590.00 $167,248.00 $260,000.00 $166,805.79 $63,000.00 $23,000.00
Total Award $44,590.00 $99,250.00 $142,000.00 $60,716.78 $10,500.00 $23,000.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: August 28, 2023
For: Off Road Equipment

6100017289 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

7 Loader Backhoe with 24” Bucket 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms
Less Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid:
Price differential
Non-Local Preference Award

8 Hammer Attachment 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Make & Model Offered:

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery

Payment Terms

Total
Total Award

Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
BossTx Inc. Crown Equipment Corporation DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA Boss JCB DBA Crown Lift Trucks 11002 Bandera Road Hill Country Outdoor Power
3744 SE Loop 410 8302 N.E. Loop 410 San Antonio, TX 78250 2914 Montopolis Dr. # 200
San Antonio, TX 78222 San Antonio, TX 78219 Austin, TX 78741

14 - 21 Days

N/A

N/A

N/A

$131,019.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
$131,019.50

2023 JCB 3X-15 Super

JCB Ecomac 4.4L
109 HP

2 Year 2000 Hours

Boss JCB

3744 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78222

60 Days

12/31/2023

10/31/2023

No

$131,019.50
Net 30

$131,019.50

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$131,019.50 $97,731.10 $11,899.00 $64,800.00
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