City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, W1 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
1 Deleted
2 4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle 2 No Bid No Bid

ELECTRIC

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$18,699.99
$37,399.98,

2024 John Deere Gator TE|

Electric 6.0 HP Motor|
Trojan T-105 Battery

12 Months or 1000 Hours

Local Dealer|

Location will be determined at time|
of warranty claim (If Necessary)

120 Calendar Days
8/31/2024

8/31/2024

Most Likely|

$12,478.00|
$24,956.00|

2024 Cushman Hauler 800X]
Elite 2.2
56.7V Litium Samsung Battery with

Zero Maintenance and 11.7 HP|

Two Year on Car and 5 Year on
Samsung Lithium Battery|

Mission Golf Cars|

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259

10-14 Calendar Days|
While Supplies Last]

N/A|

No|
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS DeWinne Equipment Company JRE Golf Cars, LLC Victoria McVay LLC
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc. |dba Mission Golf Cars dba Cartz Partz
11002 Bandera Rd 18865 Redland Road 14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
6100018113 JDLR [San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78259 Phoenix, AZ 85022
Item Description Quantity
Alternate Bid
1 Deleted
2 4 Wheeled 4x2 Open Cab Light Utility Vehicle 2 No Bid NAS
ELECTRIC
Price Each: $6,944.00 $14,500.00
Extended price: $13,888.00 $29,000.00

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2024 Evolution Turman 200

48V Lithium Battery

Two Year on Car and 6 Year on
Samsung Lithium Battery
Mission Golf Cars

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259

10-14 Calendar Days
While Supplies Last

N/A

2024 XT6 Aetric Electric Utility
Truck with 6ft tilt bed with 650Ib
pay load Capacity

S5kw AC Motor Toyota 440 amp
Controller

3 Year MFC warranty on truck
5 Year MFC warranty on Battery

Cartz Partz

14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
Phoenix, AZ 85022

30 Calendar Days
11/30/2024

12/1/2024

Left Blank

Page 2



City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, WI 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
3 Off Road 2 Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle 4 NAS No Bid No Bid
w/ Dump Bed
Price Each: $17,299.00 $16,499.99
Extended price: $69,196.00 $65,999.96

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal

Payment Terms

Less Prompt Payment Discount

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price differential

Non-Local Preference Award

2024 Polaris Pro XD Mid-Size Gas|
Polaris ProStar 570 DOHC|

Gas Engine, 39.5 HP|

2 Year Man. Limited Warranty|
Briggs Equipment

5655 S I-35 Frontage Rd
New Braunfels, TX 78132

45 Calendar Days|
12/30/2024

12/30/2024

Yes|
$69,196.00

Net 30
$69,196.00|

$69,196.00)

2024/25 Kubota RTV520-H
Kubota GZ520-E3F-UV
31.4cc 17.4 Net ENG HP
24 Months or 1000 Hours
Local Dealer

Location will be determined at time
of warranty claim (If Necessary)

120 Calendar Days
8/31/2024

8/31/2024

Most Likely
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS DeWinne Equipment Company JRE Golf Cars, LLC Victoria McVay LLC
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc. [dba Mission Golf Cars dba Cartz Partz
11002 Bandera Rd 18865 Redland Road 14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
6100018113 JDLR |San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78259 Phoenix, AZ 85022
Item Description Quantity
3 Off Road 2 Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle 4 No Bid No Bid

w/ Dump Bed

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal

Payment Terms

Less Prompt Payment Discount

Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price differential

Non-Local Preference Award

$20,166.99
$80,667.96

2024 Gravely JSV 3400SD Steel
Bed 996204

Polaris 999cc 40HP

1 Year
DeWinne Equipment Co.

11002 Bandera Rd
San Antonio, TX 78250

30 Calendar Days
9/1/2024

9/1/2024

Dependent on Availability

$80,667.96
Net 30
$80,667.96
17%
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, WI 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
4 Infield Groomer with Attachments 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Price Each: $43,999.99
Extended price: $87,999.98

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

2024 Smithco Sand Star Il

Vanguard V-Twin Air Cooled Gas|
Engine (18 HP / 570cc)

12 Months|
Local Dealer|

Location will be determined at time|
of warranty claim (If Necessary)

180 Calendar Days
8/31/2024

8/31/2024

Most Likely]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS DeWinne Equipment Company JRE Golf Cars, LLC Victoria McVay LLC
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc. [dba Mission Golf Cars dba Cartz Partz
11002 Bandera Rd 18865 Redland Road 14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
6100018113 JDLR |San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78259 Phoenix, AZ 85022
Item Description Quantity
4 Infield Groomer with Attachments 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, WI 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
5 Mid-Size Off-Road 4 Seater 4x4 Utility Vehicle 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/ Bed

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$18,999.99
$18,999.99

2024/25 Kawasaki Mule 4010 Trans|
4x4 FE|

4 Stroke, 2 Cylinder, OHV, 90 Degree
V-Twin Liquid Cooled (617cc)

36 Months
Local Dealer|

Location will be determined at time|
of warranty claim (If Necessary)

120 Calendar Days
8/31/2024

8/31/2024

Most Likely]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS DeWinne Equipment Company JRE Golf Cars, LLC Victoria McVay LLC
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc. [dba Mission Golf Cars dba Cartz Partz
11002 Bandera Rd 18865 Redland Road 14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
6100018113 JDLR |San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78259 Phoenix, AZ 85022
Item Description Quantity
5 Mid-Size Off-Road 4 Seater 4x4 Utility Vehicle 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid

w/ Bed

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, WI 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
6 2-Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle 2 No Bid No Bid

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

$22,199.00|
$44,398.00,

2024 Polaris Pro XD Full Size Diesel

Kubota 24 HP Diesel Motor 898CC

2 Year Man. Limited Warranty|
Briggs Equipment]

5655 S I-35 Frontage Rd
New Braunfels, TX 78132

45 Calendar Days|
12/30/2024

12/30/2024

Yes|

$21,699.99
$43,399.98,

2025 Polaris Pro XD Full Size Diesel

Kubota 3 Cylinder 24.5 HP Diesel
Engine, 898 cc Liquid Cooled

Two Year Limited Warranty|
Local Dealer|

Location will be determined at time|
of warranty claim (If Necessary)

240 Calendar Days|
8/31/2024

8/31/2024

Most Likely]
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS DeWinne Equipment Company JRE Golf Cars, LLC Victoria McVay LLC
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc. [dba Mission Golf Cars dba Cartz Partz
11002 Bandera Rd 18865 Redland Road 14634 N Cave Creek Rd.
6100018113 JDLR |San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78259 Phoenix, AZ 85022
Item Description Quantity
6 2-Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle 2 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: July 3, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Local Non-Local
For: UTVS & ATVS Briggs Industrial Solutions, Inc. Chaves Brothers Management, LLC JRE Golf Cars, LLC Ariens Company
dba Briggs Equipment 300 SW 8th St. #17 dba Mission Golf Cars 655 West Ryan St.
5655 S |-35 Frontage Rd Boca Raton, FL 33432 18865 Redland Road Brillion, WI 54110
6100018113 JDLR |New Braunfels, TX 78132 973-975-5272 San Antonio, TX 78259
Item Description Quantity |210-333-1430 210-325-8782
7 4-Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with 2 No Bid No Bid
Amber Beacon and Windows
Price Each: $35,000.00 $28,999.99
Extended price: $70,000.00 $57,999.98
Year, Make & Model Offered: 2024 Polaris Pro XD Full Size Diesel 2024 Polaris Pro XD Full Size Diesel
Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: Kubota 24 HP Diesel Motor 898CC| Kubota 3 Cylinder 24.5 HP Diesel
(Include SAE NET HP): Engine, 898 cc Liquid Cooled
Warranty: 2 Year Man. Limited Warranty| Two Year Limited Warranty|
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Briggs Equipment Local Dealer
Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 5655 S I-35 Frontage Rd Location will be determined at time
New Braunfels, TX 78132 of warranty claim (If Necessary)
Delivery 45 Calendar Days| 240 Calendar Days|
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model 12/30/2024 8/31/2024
Last day order can be placed without missing 12/30/2024 8/31/2024
cut-off date for current year model
Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Yes| Most Likely|
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $183,594.00 $311,799.87 $24,956.00 $0.00
Total Award $69,196.00 $208,399.93 $24,956.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100018113

July 3, 2024
UTVS & ATVS

JDLR

Local

Local

Non-Local

Item

Description

Quantity

DeWinne Equipment Company
dba DeWinne Equipment Co Inc.

11002 Bandera Rd
San Antonio, TX 78250

JRE Golf Cars, LLC
dba Mission Golf Cars

18865 Redland Road
San Antonio, TX 78259

Victoria McVay LLC
dba Cartz Partz

14634 N Cave Creek Rd.

Phoenix, AZ 85022

4-Seater 4x4 Light Utility Vehicle with
Amber Beacon and Windows

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered:
(Include SAE NET HP):

Warranty:
Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Delivery
Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model

Last day order can be placed without missing
cut-off date for current year model

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:
Payment Terms

Total

No Bid

Net 30

$80,667.96

No Bid

Net 30

$13,888.00

No Bid

Net 30

$29,000.00

Total Award
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