
City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

1 Compact Tractor with Accessories 1 No Bid No Bid

Price Each: $30,447.00
Extended price: $30,447.00

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered: 2025 Kubota L2502 HST / LAS26

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 2 Years

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 29171 I - 10 W
Boerne, TX 78006

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.3.1 Engine: Yes
4.3.2 PTO HP: Yes
4.3.3 Transmission: Yes
4.3.4 Fuel: Yes
4.3.5 Electrical 12 Volt: Yes
4.3.9 Front End Loader: Yes
4.3.10 Cutter/Shredder Attachment: Yes
4.3.11 Safety: Yes

Delivery: 60 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 Compact Tractor with Accessories 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.3.1 Engine:
4.3.2 PTO HP:
4.3.3 Transmission:
4.3.4 Fuel:
4.3.5 Electrical 12 Volt:
4.3.9 Front End Loader:
4.3.10 Cutter/Shredder Attachment:
4.3.11 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

No Bid No Bid

$33,568.01
$33,568.01

2025 Case iH F40A

2 Year 2000 Hour Basic Warranty
Full Coverage

ASCO San Antonio

1920 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

ASAP

In Stock

In Stock

(Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

1 Compact Tractor with Accessories 1

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.3.1 Engine:
4.3.2 PTO HP:
4.3.3 Transmission:
4.3.4 Fuel:
4.3.5 Electrical 12 Volt:
4.3.9 Front End Loader:
4.3.10 Cutter/Shredder Attachment:
4.3.11 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

2A 60 Inch Zero Turn Gas Mower with Up to No Bid
Sun Canopy & Fan 8

Price Each: $14,622.74 $15,409.26
Extended price: $116,981.92 $123,274.08

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered: 2025 Gravely Pro Turn Mach One 2025 Gravely Pro-Turn Mach-One
992515 Carbureted (992519)

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 5 Year, 1500 Hour 5 Year / 1250 Hours
No Hour Limit First Two Years

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinne Equipment Company DeWinne Equipment Company

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Road 11002 Bandera Road
San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78250

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.4.1 Engine: Yes Yes
4.4.2 Transmission: Yes Yes
4.4.3 Fuel System: Yes Yes
4.4.4 Mowing Deck: Yes Yes
4.4.5 Blades: Yes Yes
4.4.10 Seating: Yes Yes
4.4.11 Safety: Yes Yes
4.4.14 Canopy: Yes Yes

Delivery: 45 Calendar Days 21 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: September 10/1/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing August 31st. 9/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Dependent on Inventory Availability Yes

Subtotal $116,981.92
Payment Terms Net 30
Less Prompt Payment Discount $116,981.92
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid 2%
Price differential $1,789.92
Local Preference Award $116,981.92

2B Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

2A 60 Inch Zero Turn Gas Mower with Up to
Sun Canopy & Fan 8

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.4.1 Engine:
4.4.2 Transmission:
4.4.3 Fuel System:
4.4.4 Mowing Deck:
4.4.5 Blades:
4.4.10 Seating:
4.4.11 Safety:
4.4.14 Canopy:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms
Less Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price differential
Local Preference Award

2B Deleted

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

No Bid

$15,234.26 $13,599.00
$121,874.08 $108,792.00

2025 Gravely Pro Turn Mach One 2025 Exmark Lazer Z-S 60"
992519 EFI LRS749AKC604A1 26.5 HP

5 Year, 1500 Hour 2 Years

DeWinne Equipment Company Hill Country Outdoor Power

11002 Bandera Road 4327 Centergate
San Antonio, TX 78250 San Antonio, TX 78217

Yes No - 26.5 HP
Yes No - 10mph / 7mph
Yes Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes

Yes to all, except no manual choke Yes
Yes Yes
Yes Yes

45 Calendar Days 14 Calendar Days

September N/A

August 31st. N/A

Dependent on Inventory Availability N/A
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

2A 60 Inch Zero Turn Gas Mower with Up to
Sun Canopy & Fan 8

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.4.1 Engine:
4.4.2 Transmission:
4.4.3 Fuel System:
4.4.4 Mowing Deck:
4.4.5 Blades:
4.4.10 Seating:
4.4.11 Safety:
4.4.14 Canopy:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Subtotal
Payment Terms
Less Prompt Payment Discount
Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid
Price differential
Local Preference Award

2B Deleted

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

$15,095.99 $14,399.00 $15,048.99
$120,767.92 $115,192.00 $120,391.92

2025 Gravely Pro Turn Mach One 60" 2025 Scag Cheetah 2 61" 2025 STIHL 60" Zero Turn Mover
31 HP 38 HP Kawasaki EFI RZ 960i

2 Years 2 Years 3 Years or 1500 Engine Hours
Whichever comes first

Hill Country Outdoor Power Hill Country Outdoor Power Region Equipment

4327 Centergate 4327 Centergate 8617 Pagewood Ln.
San Antonio, TX 78217 San Antonio, TX 78217 Houston, TX 77063

Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes No - 12 MPH Forward, 5 MPH Rev
Yes Yes No - 11 Gallon Gas Tank
Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes
Yes Yes Yes

21 Calendar Days 14 Calendar Days 30 Calendar Days

N/A N/A December

N/A N/A 12/15/2025

N/A N/A Yes

$115,192.00
Net 30

$115,192.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

3 15 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter No Bid No Bid

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025): $24,718.00
Quantity: 1 
Extended price: $24,718.00

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025): $24,718.00
Quantity: 1 
Extended price: $24,718.00

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered: 2025 LandPride RC5715

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 1 Year

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 29171 I - 10 W
Boerne, TX 78006

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.6.1 Cutting Width: Yes
4.6.2 PTO: Yes
4.6.3 Hitch: Yes
4.6.4 Cutting Height: Yes
4.6.5 Blade: Yes
4.6.6 Blade Speed: Yes
4.6.7 Gear Box Yes
4.6.8 Driveline Protection: Yes
4.6.9 Deck Thikness: Yes
4.6.10 Driveline: Yes
4.6.11 Tires: Yes
4.6.12 Safety: Yes

Delivery: 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

3 15 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025):
Quantity: 1 
Extended price:

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):
Quantity: 1 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.6.1 Cutting Width:
4.6.2 PTO:
4.6.3 Hitch:
4.6.4 Cutting Height:
4.6.5 Blade:
4.6.6 Blade Speed:
4.6.7 Gear Box
4.6.8 Driveline Protection:
4.6.9 Deck Thikness:
4.6.10 Driveline:
4.6.11 Tires:
4.6.12 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

NAS No Bid No Bid

$23,332.55

$23,332.55

$23,332.55

$23,332.55

2025 Woods BW 15.72

2 Year Structure / 10 Year Gearbox

ASCO San Antonio

1920 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220

Yes
Yes
Yes
No

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

90 Calendar Days

11/30/2025

11/30/2025

(Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

3 15 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025):
Quantity: 1 
Extended price:

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):
Quantity: 1 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.6.1 Cutting Width:
4.6.2 PTO:
4.6.3 Hitch:
4.6.4 Cutting Height:
4.6.5 Blade:
4.6.6 Blade Speed:
4.6.7 Gear Box
4.6.8 Driveline Protection:
4.6.9 Deck Thikness:
4.6.10 Driveline:
4.6.11 Tires:
4.6.12 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid

$28,246.00

$28,246.00

$28,246.00

$28,246.00

2025 Blue Diamond 15' Flex Wing
Rotary Cutter

12 Months

Region Equipment

8617 Pagewood Ln.
Houston, TX 77063

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

No - Splitter gearbox rated at 235 HP
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

30 Calendar Days

December

12/15/2025

(Left Blank)
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

4 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 110 HP, min 12,500 lbs. No Bid No Bid

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025): $116,949.05
Quantity: 6 
Extended price: $701,694.30

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025): $116,949.05
Quantity: 7 
Extended price: $818,643.35

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered: 2025 Kubota M7-134D

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 2 Years

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 29171 I - 10 W
Boerne, TX 78006

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.7.1 Engine: Yes
4.7.2 PTO: Yes
4.7.3 Drive Train/Transmission: Yes
4.7.4 Fuel Capacity: Yes
4.7.5 Locking Gas Caps: Yes
4.7.6 Remote Valves: Yes
4.7.7 Tires: Yes
4.7.8 Mirrors: Yes
4.7.9 Lift Capacity: Yes
4.7.11 Cab and Additional Items: Yes
4.7.12 Lighting: Yes
4.7.13 Safety: Yes
4.7.15 In Field Weight: Yes

Delivery: 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

5 Deleted
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

4 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 110 HP, min 12,500 lbs.

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025):
Quantity: 6 
Extended price:

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):
Quantity: 7 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.7.1 Engine:
4.7.2 PTO:
4.7.3 Drive Train/Transmission:
4.7.4 Fuel Capacity:
4.7.5 Locking Gas Caps:
4.7.6 Remote Valves:
4.7.7 Tires:
4.7.8 Mirrors:
4.7.9 Lift Capacity:
4.7.11 Cab and Additional Items:
4.7.12 Lighting:
4.7.13 Safety:
4.7.15 In Field Weight:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

5 Deleted

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

NAS No Bid No Bid

$98,846.75

$593,080.50

$98,846.75

$691,927.25

2026 Case iH Farmall 110A

2 Year 2,000 Basic Warranty
Full Coverage

ASCO San Antonio

1920 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
No

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

180 Calendar Days

11/30/2025

11/30/2025

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

4 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 110 HP, min 12,500 lbs.

Price Each: (Upon Award Through 9/30/2025):
Quantity: 6 
Extended price:

Price Each: (Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):
Quantity: 7 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.7.1 Engine:
4.7.2 PTO:
4.7.3 Drive Train/Transmission:
4.7.4 Fuel Capacity:
4.7.5 Locking Gas Caps:
4.7.6 Remote Valves:
4.7.7 Tires:
4.7.8 Mirrors:
4.7.9 Lift Capacity:
4.7.11 Cab and Additional Items:
4.7.12 Lighting:
4.7.13 Safety:
4.7.15 In Field Weight:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

5 Deleted

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

6 Zero Turn Mower with 104” Batwing with 1 No Bid No Bid
6 Extra Blades

Price Each: $26,750.00
Extended price: $26,750.00

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered: 2025 Hustler Super 104
944058

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered Kawasaki FX1000 EFI
(Include SAE Net HP): 38.5 HP

Mowing Deck Offered: 104 Rear Discharge

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 5 Year / 1200 Hour 
(First 2 Years No Hour Limit)

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: DeWinne Equipment Company

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 11002 Bandera Road
San Antonio, TX 78250

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.9.1 Engine: Yes
4.9.2 Drive: Yes
4.9.3 Mowing Deck: Yes
4.9.4 Blades: Yes - Unit has 5 blade, and will

 come with extra 6 blades
4.9.5 Discharge: Yes
4.9.9 Seating: Yes
4.9.10 Safety: Yes

Delivery: 15 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: September 1st

Last day order can be placed without missing August 15th
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: Dependent on Inventory Availability
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

6 Zero Turn Mower with 104” Batwing with 1
6 Extra Blades

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Mowing Deck Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.9.1 Engine:
4.9.2 Drive:
4.9.3 Mowing Deck:
4.9.4 Blades:

4.9.5 Discharge:
4.9.9 Seating:
4.9.10 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

6 Zero Turn Mower with 104” Batwing with 1
6 Extra Blades

Price Each:
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered
(Include SAE Net HP):

Mowing Deck Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.9.1 Engine:
4.9.2 Drive:
4.9.3 Mowing Deck:
4.9.4 Blades:

4.9.5 Discharge:
4.9.9 Seating:
4.9.10 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

7 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 115 HP min 9,400 lbs. 3 No Bid No Bid
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: $116,949.05
Extended price: $350,847.15

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered: 2025 Kubota M7-134D

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 2 Years

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 29171 I - 10 W
Boerne, TX 78006

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.10.1 Engine: Yes
4.10.2 PTO: Yes
4.10.3 Drive Train: Yes
4.10.4 Fuel Capacity: Yes
4.10.5 Locking Gas Caps: Yes
4.10.6 Remote Valves: Yes
4.10.8 Mirrors: Yes
4.10.9 Lift Capacity: Yes
4.10.11 Cab and Additional Items: Yes
4.10.12 Lighting: Yes
4.10.13 Safety: Yes
4.10.15 In Field Weight: Yes

Delivery: 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/31/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

7 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 115 HP min 9,400 lbs. 3
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.10.1 Engine:
4.10.2 PTO:
4.10.3 Drive Train:
4.10.4 Fuel Capacity:
4.10.5 Locking Gas Caps:
4.10.6 Remote Valves:
4.10.8 Mirrors:
4.10.9 Lift Capacity:
4.10.11 Cab and Additional Items:
4.10.12 Lighting:
4.10.13 Safety:
4.10.15 In Field Weight:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

NAS No Bid No Bid

$84,521.23
$253,563.69

2026 Case iH Farmall Utility 115A

2 Year 2000Hr Basic Warranty
Full Coverage

ASCO San Antonio

1920 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220

Yes
Yes
Yes
No

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

180 Calendar Days

180

11/30/2025

Yes
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

7 4x4 Utility Tractor minimum 115 HP min 9,400 lbs. 3
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Tractor Offered:

Tractor Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Tractor Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.10.1 Engine:
4.10.2 PTO:
4.10.3 Drive Train:
4.10.4 Fuel Capacity:
4.10.5 Locking Gas Caps:
4.10.6 Remote Valves:
4.10.8 Mirrors:
4.10.9 Lift Capacity:
4.10.11 Cab and Additional Items:
4.10.12 Lighting:
4.10.13 Safety:
4.10.15 In Field Weight:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025 NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment Ewald II LLC DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. Ariens Company

DBA Ewald Kubota DBA DeWinne Equipment 655 West Ryan Street
1900 W I - 10 11002 Bandera Rd. Brillion, WI 54110

6100018952 JDLR Seguin, TX 78155 San Antonio, TX 78250
Item Description Quantity 830-755-5305 210-684-5296

8 20 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter 3 No Bid No Bid
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: $34,798.55
Extended price: $104,395.65

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered: 2025 Modern AG Predator 20

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY): 1 Year

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name: Ewald Kubota

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address: 29171 I-10 W
Boerne, TX 78006

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.11.1 Cutting Width: Yes
4.11.2 PTO: Yes
4.11.3 Hitch: Yes
4.11.4 Cutting Height: Yes
4.11.5 Blade: Yes
4.11.6 Blade Speed: Yes
4.11.7 Gear Box Yes
4.11.8 Driveline Protection: Yes
4.11.9 Deck Thikness: Yes
4.11.10 Driveline: Yes
4.11.12 Safety: Yes

Delivery: 90 Calendar Days

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model: 12/31/2025

Last day order can be placed without missing 11/1/2025
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date: No

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

Total $2,055,463.45 $143,731.92 $123,274.08
Total Award $2,055,463.45 $143,731.92
* Bid Item 2.B and Bid Item 5 are Deleted to be re-bid*
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

8 20 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter 3
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.11.1 Cutting Width:
4.11.2 PTO:
4.11.3 Hitch:
4.11.4 Cutting Height:
4.11.5 Blade:
4.11.6 Blade Speed:
4.11.7 Gear Box
4.11.8 Driveline Protection:
4.11.9 Deck Thikness:
4.11.10 Driveline:
4.11.12 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

Total
Total Award
* Bid Item 2.B and Bid Item 5 are Deleted to be re-bid*

NON-LOCAL LOCAL NON-LOCAL
Associated Supply Company Inc. DeWinne Equipment Company Inc. HCOP, LLC
DBA ACSO Equipment DBA DeWinne Equipment DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power
2102 E Slaton Td. 11002 Bandera Rd. 2914 Montopolis #200
Lubbock, TX 79404 San Antonio, TX 78250 Austin, TX 78741

Alternate Bid NAS

NAS No Bid No Bid

$25,882.38
$77,647.14

2026 Woods BW20.51

2 Year Structure & 10 Year Gearbox

ASCO San Antonio

1920 SE Loop 410
San Antonio, TX 78220

Yes
Yes
Yes
No

Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes
Yes

90 Calendar Days

90 Days

9/14/2025

Yes

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$1,696,451.69 $121,874.08 $108,792.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: April 14, 2025
For: BESD Landscaping Equipment

6100018952 JDLR
Item Description Quantity

8 20 ft. Batwing Rotary Cutter 3
(Est. 10/1/2025 – 11/30/2025):

Price Each: 
Extended price:

Year, Make & Model of Mower Offered:

Mower Warranty (1-Year or 2000 hours ONLY):

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:

Mower Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:

Complies with all Specifications, Including:
4.11.1 Cutting Width:
4.11.2 PTO:
4.11.3 Hitch:
4.11.4 Cutting Height:
4.11.5 Blade:
4.11.6 Blade Speed:
4.11.7 Gear Box
4.11.8 Driveline Protection:
4.11.9 Deck Thikness:
4.11.10 Driveline:
4.11.12 Safety:

Delivery:

Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model:

Last day order can be placed without missing 
cut-off date for current year model:

Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:

Payment Terms

Total
Total Award
* Bid Item 2.B and Bid Item 5 are Deleted to be re-bid*

NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL NON-LOCAL
HCOP, LLC HCOP, LLC Top5 Equipment LLC
DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Hill Country Outdoor Power DBA Region Equipment
2914 Montopolis #200 2914 Montopolis #200 8617 Pagewood Ln
Austin, TX 78741 Austin, TX 78741 Houston, TX 77063

Alternate Bid #1 Alternate Bid #2

No Bid No Bid No Bid

Net 30 Net 30 Net 30

$120,767.92 $115,192.00 $176,883.92
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