City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:
For:

6100016496

September 27, 2023
Annual Contract for Indoor Plant Lease & Maintenance for
San Antonio Airport Systems

SG

LOCAL

LOCAL

Item

Description

Estimated
Annual
Quantity

Green Oasis, LLC
155 Remount
San Antonio
Texas, 78218
210-653-8900

Plant Interscapes, Inc
6436 Babcock Rd
San Antonio

Texas, 78249

1A

1B

1C

1D

1F

1G

1H

1l

1J

1L

™

1N

One time Initial lease fee to provide, deliver and install plants
and planter materials.

Level Zero-Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking
garage. Next to Elevator.

Price For Location A (Including 1 plant &1 planter)

Level Zero-Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking
garage.

Price For Location B (Including 42 plants & 7 planters - 6
plants per planter)

Skybridge-Bridge connecting Terminal B to the ConRac
Rental Car Center
Price For Location C (Including 12 plants &12 planters)

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby along the large
front windows
Price For Location D (Including 7 plants & 7 planters)

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the frosted
glass wall just outside of the TSA checkpoint near chair
grouping

Price For Location E (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating
grouping at the first door (East most TB door)
Price For Location F (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating
grouping and elevator landing near the airport chapel

Price For Location G (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal A Departure level ticket lobby seating area just
behind the Ambassador booth
Price For Location H (Including 6 plants & 6 planters)

Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area tall trees
along windows
Price For Location | (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area, plants
inside the baggage carrousel loop
Price For Location J (Including 3 plants & 3 planters)

Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area near the
ambassador booth and far East end of TB near elevator
Price For Location K (Including 2 plants & 2 planters)

Terminal A Arrivals level in Baggage claim area, plants inside
the baggage carrousel loop
Price For Location L (Including 6 plants & 6 planters)

Inside the ConRac rental car customer service lobby on 4th
floor
Price For Location M (Including 6 plants & 6 planters)

Inside the ConRac rental car customer service lobby on 4th
floor

Price For Location N (Including 36 plants & 6 planters - 6
plants per planters)

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

NAS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 27, 2023
For: Annual Contract for Indoor Plant Lease & Maintenance for LOCAL LOCAL
San Antonio Airport Systems Green Oasis, LLC Plant Interscapes, Inc
155 Remount 6436 Babcock Rd
San Antonio San Antonio
6100016496 SG Texas, 78218 Texas, 78249
Estimated |210-653-8900
Item Description Annual
Quantity
$0.00 No Bid
2 Weekly Maintenance Fee to provide weekly maintenance
and service of all plants and planters at each Location.
2A Level Zero-Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking 52
garage. Next to Elevator.
Unit Price For Location A $5.04 No Bid
Total Cost For Location A $262.08 No Bid
2B Level Zero-Tunnel Entrance coming in from the parking 52
garage.
Unit Price For Location B $62.94 No Bid
Total Cost For Location B $3,272.88 No Bid
2C Skybridge-Bridge connecting Terminal B to the ConRac 52
Rental Car Center
Unit Price For Location C $54.96 No Bid
Total Cost For Location C $2,857.92 No Bid
2D Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby along the large 52
front windows
Unit Price For Location D $90.72 No Bid
Total Cost For Location D $4,717.44 No Bid
2E Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the frosted 52
glass wall just outside of the TSA checkpoint near chair
grouping
Unit Price For Location E (Including 2 plants & 2 planters) $8.67 No Bid
Total Cost For Location E $450.84 No Bid
2F Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating 52
grouping at the first door (East most TB door)
Unit Price For Location F $8.67 No Bid
Total Cost For Location F $450.84 No Bid
2G Terminal B Departure Level Ticket Lobby near the seating 52
grouping and elevator landing near the airport chapel
Unit Price For Location G $8.67 No Bid
Total Cost For Location G $450.84 No Bid
2H Terminal A Departure level ticket lobby seating area just 52
behind the Ambassador booth
Unit Price For Location H $28.22 No Bid
Total Cost For Location H $1,467.44 No Bid
2l Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area tall trees 52
along windows
Unit Price For Location | $8.79 No Bid
Total Cost For Location | $457.08 No Bid
2J Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area, plants 52
inside the baggage carrousel loop
Unit Price For Location J $8.67 No Bid
Total Cost For Location J $450.84 No Bid
2K Terminal B Arrivals level in Baggage claim area near the 52
ambassador booth and far East end of TB near elevator
Unit Price For Location K $8.67 No Bid
Total Cost For Location K $450.84 No Bid




City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: September 27, 2023
For: Annual Contract for Indoor Plant Lease & Maintenance for LOCAL LOCAL
San Antonio Airport Systems Green Qasis, LLC Plant Interscapes, Inc
155 Remount 6436 Babcock Rd
San Antonio San Antonio
6100016496 SG Texas, 78218 Texas, 78249
Estimated |210-653-8900
Item Description Annual
Quantity
2L Terminal A Arrivals level in Baggage claim area, plants inside 52
the baggage carrousel loop
Unit Price For Location L $30.43 No Bid
Total Cost For Location L $1,582.36 No Bid
2M Inside the ConRac rental car customer service lobby on 4th 52
floor
Unit Price For Location M $75.76 No Bid
Total Cost For Location M $3,939.52 No Bid
2N Inside the ConRac rental car customer service lobby on 4th 52
floor
Unit Price For Location N $37.73 No Bid
Total Cost For Location N $1,961.96 No Bid
Payment Term Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $22,772.88 No Bid
Estimated Annual Award $22,772.88 No Bid
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