City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 8, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
Item Description A"::;'I“;f::m TX 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y |737-252-0049 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
1 One (1) Gallon Trees
1-11 DELETED
12 Cedro blanco (Arizona cypress) 100
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $1,200.00] No Bid
13-19 DELETED
20 Carya illinoinensis (Pecan) 500 ]
Price per Tree No Bid 12.00] No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00] No Bid
21-31 DELETED
32 Cercis canadensis var. canadensis (Texas redbud - tree form) 200
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $2,400.00] No Bid
33 DELETED 200
34 Chilopsis linearis (desert willow) 200

Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $2,400.00] No Bid

35-46 DELETED

47 Ehritia anacua (anaqua) 100
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $1,200.00] No Bid

48-61 DELETED

62 llex decidua (deciduous holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
63 DELETED
64 llex vomitoria (yaupon holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $12.00 No Bid

65-70 DELETED

7 Magnolia grandiflora (Southern magnolia) 50
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $600.00] No Bid

72-91 DELETED

92 Platanus occidentalis (American sycamore) 300
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $3,600.00] No Bid

93-98 DELETED

% Prunus mexicana (Mexican plum) 300
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $3,600.00 No Bid

100-104 DELETED

105 Quercus falcata (southern red oak) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $1,200.00] No Bid

106-108 DELETED

109 Quercus fusiformis (Texas live oak) 500
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00] No Bid

110-111 DELETED

112 Quercus laceyi (blue oak) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid $12.00 No Bid

113-114 DELETED

115 Quercus macrocarpa (bur oak) 500
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00] No Bid

116-117 DELETED

118 Quercus muehlenbergii (chinquapin oak - Tree form) 500
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00] No Bid

119-122 DELETED

123 Quercus polymorpha (Monterrey oak) 500
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00] No Bid

124-131 DELETED

132 Taxodium mucronatum (Montezuma cypress) 300
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $3,600.00] No Bid

133-139 DELETED

140 Lagerstroemia x 'Natchez' (Natchez crape myrtle) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $1,200.00| No Bid
141 Lagerstroemia (Tree form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $1,200.00| No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 8, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
i Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
Item Description A"f:;'l“g:f::my TX 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
737-252-0949 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
142 Lagerstroemia (Shrub form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $1,200.00] No Bid

143-145 DELETED

146 Taxodium distichum (baldcypress) 300
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $3,600.00] No Bid
147-149 DELETED
150 Ulmus parvifolia (lacebark elm) 100
Price per Tree No Bid $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $1,200.00| No Bid
151 Ulmus crassifolia (Cedar elm) 500
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $6,000.00| No Bid
152 Ungnadia speciosa (Mexican buckeye) 300
Price per Tree No Bid| $12.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $3,600.00j No Bid
163-154 DELETED
Subtotal 1 Gallon Trees No Bid $67,836.00 No Bid
n Five (5) Gallon Trees
1-9 DELETED
10 Apple (Any suitable for the climate) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $32.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid| $3,200.00
" DELETED
12 Cedro blanco (Arizona cypress) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid

13-19 DELETED

20 Carya illinoinensis (Pecan) 150
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 $65.00
Extended Price No Bid|| $3,600.00] $9,750.00
21-33 DELETED
34 Chilopsis linearis (desert willow) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
35 DELETED
36 Citrus  aurantifolia (thornless keylime) 150
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid| $9,750.00
37-39 DELETED
40 Lagerstroemia x 'Natchez' (Natchez crape myrtle) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $2,400.00 No Bid
41 DELETED
42 Lagerstroemia (Shrub form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $2,400.00 No Bid
43 Citrus x latifolia (Persian lime) 150
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $9,750.00
44 Citrus lime (any suitable for the climate) 150
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $9,750.00
45 Citrus limon (lemon) 150
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $9,750.00
46-47 DELETED
48 Cornus florida (Flowering Dogwood) 1
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid| $65.00
49-51 DELETED
52 Diospyros virginiana (Eastern persimmon) 1
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $40.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $40.00
53-56 DELETED
57 Fig (any suitable for the climate) 50
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $40.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $2,000.00
58 Fruiting pear 50
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $32.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $1,600.00
59-67 DELETED
68 llex decidua (deciduous holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
69-83 DELETED
84 Nectarine 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $32.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $3,200.00
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

February 8, 2023

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
item Description An:::l"c‘;:::m X 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y |737-252-0049 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
85 DELETED
86 Olea europaea (Olive) 1
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $70.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $70.00
87 Orange 200
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $65.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $13,000.00
88-91 DELETED
%2 Diospyros texana (Texas persimmon) 200
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $40.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid| $8,000.00
93-97 DELETED
%8 Platanus occidentalis (American sycamore) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
99 DELETED
100 Plum (edible fruiting) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $32.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid| $3,200.00
101-104 DELETED
105 Prunus mexicana (Mexican plum) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $45.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $4,500.00
106 Prunus persica (peach) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $32.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $3,200.00
107 Prunus sect, Armeniaca (apricot) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $40.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $4,000.00
108 Punica granatum (pomegranate) 100
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid $50.00
Extended Price No Bid No Bid $5,000.00
109-110 DELETED
111 Quercus falcata (southern red oak) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $24.00 No Bid
112-120 DELETED
121 Quercus macrocarpa (bur oak) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
122-144 DELETED
145 Sophora affinis (Eve's necklace) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
146 DELETED
147 Taxodium distichum (baldcypress) 1
Price per Tree No Bid No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| No Bid
148-151 DELETED
152 Ulmus crassifolia (Cedar elm) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $24.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $24.00 No Bid
153-155 DELETED
Subtotal 5 Gallon Trees No Bid $8,616.00 $90,075.00
m Fifteen (15) Gallon Trees
1-9 DELETED
10 Apple (Any suitable for the climate) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $75.00 No Bid
1" DELETED
12 Cedro blanco (Arizona cypress) 5
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $375.00 No Bid
13-33 DELETED
34 Chilopsis linearis (desert willow) 30
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $2,250.00] No Bid
35-61 DELETED
62 llex decidua (deciduous holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
63 DELETED
64 llex vomitoria (yaupon holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
65-73 DELETED
74 Lagerstroemia x 'Natchez' (Natchez crape myrtle) 100
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $7,500.00 No Bid
75 DELETED
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 8, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
Item Description An:::l"c‘;:::m TX 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y 737-252-0949 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
76 Lagerstroemia (Shrub form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $7,500.00 No Bid
77-97 DELETED
98 Platanus occidentalis (American sycamore) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $75.00 No Bid
99 DELETED
100 Plum (edible fruiting) 1

Price per Tree No Bid $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $75.00 No Bid

101-105 DELETED

106 Prunus persica (peach) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
107 Prunus sect, Armeniaca (apricot) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $75.00 No Bid

108-110 DELETED

111 Quercus falcata (southern red oak) 1
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $75.00 No Bid

112-117 DELETED

118 Quercus laceyi (blue oak) 10
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| §750.00) No Bid

119-123 DELETED

124 Quercus muehlenbergii (chinquapin oak - Tree form) 50
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| $3,750.00 No Bid

125-146 DELETED

147 Taxodium distichum (baldcypress) 10
Price per Tree No Bid| $75.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| §750.00) No Bid

148-155 DELETED

Subtotal 15 Gallon Trees No Bid $23,475.00 No Bid
% Thirty (30) Gallon Trees
1 DELETED
2 Acer grandidentatum (bigtooth maple) 5
Price per Tree $150.00) No Bid No Bid
Extended Price §750.00 No Bid No Bid
311 DELETED
12 Cedro blanco (Arizona cypress) 5
Price per Tree $150.00) No Bid No Bid
Extended Price §750.00 No Bid No Bid

13-19 DELETED

20 Caryailinoinensis (Pecan) 5
Price per Tree $125.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price | $625.00 No Bid No Bid
21-31 DELETED
32 Cercis canadensis var. canadensis (Texas redbud - tree form) 5
Price per Tree $150.00) No Bid No Bid
Extended Price §750.00 No Bid No Bid
33-63 DELETED
64 llex vomitoria (yaupon holly) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $250.00) No Bid
Extended Price No Bid| §250.00 No Bid
65-70 DELETED
7 Magnolia grandifiora (Southern magnolia) 1
Price per Tree $150.00) No Bid No Bid
Extended Price | $150.00 No Bid No Bid
72-91 DELETED
92 Platanus occidentalis (American sycamore) 1

Price per Tree No Bid $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $250.00 No Bid

93-103 DELETED
104 Lagerstroemia x 'Natchez' (Natchez crape myrtle) 1
Price per Tree $125.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $125.00 $250.00 No Bid
105 Lagerstroemia (Tree form crape myrtle of any color) 1
Price per Tree $125.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $125.00 No Bid No Bid
106 Lagerstroemia (Shrub form crape myrtle of any color) 1
Price per Tree $125.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $125.00 $250.00 No Bid
107 Prunus sect, Armeniaca (apricot) 1
Price per Tree $150.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $150.00 No Bid No Bid
108 Punica granatum (pomegranate) 1
Price per Tree $150.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $150.00 No Bid No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: February 8, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
Item Description An:::l"c‘;:::m TX 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y |737-252-0049 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
109-110 DELETED
111 Quercus falcata (southern red oak) 1
Price per Tree $175.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $175.00 No Bid No Bid
112-114 DELETED
115 Quercus fusiformis (Texas live oak) 5
Price per Tree $150.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $750.00 $1,250.00 No Bid
116-120 DELETED
121 Quercus macrocarpa (bur oak) 1
Price per Tree $150.00 $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price $150.00 $250.00 No Bid
122-123 DELETED
124 Quercus muehlenbergi (chinquapin oak - Tree form) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $250.00 No Bid
125-128 DELETED
129 Quercus polymorpha (Monterrey oak) 1
Price per Tree No Bid $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $250.00 No Bid
130-135 DELETED
136 Quercus virginiana (Southern live oak) 5
Price per Tree $150.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $750.00 No Bid No Bid
137-151 DELETED
152 Ulmus crassifolia (Cedar elm) 5
Price per Tree No Bid $250.00 No Bid
Extended Price No Bid|| $1,250.00] No Bid
153-155 DELETED
Subtotal 30 Gallon Trees $5,525.00 $2,250.00 No Bid
v Forty Five (45) Gallon Trees
1
1 Acacia famesiana (sweet acacia)
Price per Tree $499.99 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $499.99 No Bid No Bid
2 Acer grandidentatum (bigtooth maple) 5
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,250.00| No Bid No Bid
3 Acer macrophyllum (Bigleaf Maple) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
4 Acer negundo (boxelder) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
5 Acer rubrum (red maple) 1
Price per Tree $399.99 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $399.99 No Bid No Bid
6 Acer saccharinum (silver cloud/queen maple) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
7-10 DELETED
1 Arbutus xalapensis (Texas madrone) 5
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,500.00| No Bid No Bid
12 Cedro blanco (Arizona cypress) 5
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,250.00| No Bid No Bid
13 Asimina triloba (pawpaw) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
14 Betula nigra (Black Birch) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
15-16 DELETED
17 Carya aquatica (Bitter pecan) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
18-19 DELETED
20 Carya illinoinensis (Pecan) 5
Price per Tree $300.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $1,500.00) No Bid No Bid
21-25 DELETED
26 Catalpa bignonioides (Southern catalpa) 5
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,750.00| No Bid No Bid
27 Catalpa bungei (Manchurian catalpa) 1
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $550.00 No Bid No Bid
28 Catalpa ovata (Yellow catalpa) 1
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $550.00 No Bid No Bid
29 Catalpa speciosa (Northern Catalpa) 5
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,750.00) No Bid No Bid
30-31 DELETED
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

February 8, 2023

Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
item Description An:::l"c‘;:::m X 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y |737-252-0049 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
32 Cercis canadensis var. canadensis (Texas redbud - tree form) 5
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,250.00| No Bid No Bid
33 Cercis canadensis var. mexicana (Meixcan redbud) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
34 Chilopsis linearis (desert willow) 5
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,500.00| No Bid No Bid
35 Chionanthus virginicus (white fringetree) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
36 Citrus x aurantiifolia (thornless keylime) 1
Price per Tree $650.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $650.00 No Bid No Bid
37 Citrus x latifolia (Persian lime) 1
Price per Tree $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $600.00 No Bid No Bid
38 Citrus lime (any suitable for the climate) 1
Price per Tree $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $600.00 No Bid No Bid
39 Citrus limon (lemon) 1
Price per Tree $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $600.00 No Bid No Bid
40-41 DELETED
2 Cornus florida (Flowering Dogwood) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price | $450.00 No Bid No Bid
43-45 DELETED
46 Diospyros virginiana (Eastern persimmon) 1 |
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price | $550.00 No Bid No Bid
47-50 DELETED
51 Fig (any suitable for the climate) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
52 Fruiting pear 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
53 Ginkgo biloba (maidenhair) 1
Price per Tree $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $600.00 No Bid No Bid
54-62 DELETED
63 llex opaca (American holly) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
64 llex vomitoria (yaupon holly) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
65-66 DELETED
67 Liqui iflua (American ) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
68 Liriodendron tulipifera (Tuliptree) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
69-70 DELETED
71 Magnolia grandifiora (Southern magnolia) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
72 Magnolia macrophylla (Bigleaf Magnolia) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
73 DELETED
74 Magnolia virginiana (Sweetbay magnolia) 1
Price per Tree $300.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price | $300.00 No Bid No Bid
75-77 DELETED
78 Nectarine 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
79 Nyssa sylvatica (black tupelo) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
80 Olea europaea (Olive) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
81 Orange 1
Price per Tree $600.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $600.00 No Bid No Bid
82 Ostrya virginiana (Hophornbeam / Ironwood) 1
Price per Tree $550.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $550.00 No Bid No Bid
83 Parkinsonia aculeata (paloverde) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
84 DELETED
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Non-Local

Non-Local

Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc.
200 Mosty Lane

Center Point,

TX 78010

830-634-2643

Sorelle Farms, LLC
975 CR 2220
Mineola,

TX 75773
430-205-4757

Opened: February 8, 2023 Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd
: Buda,
item Description An f:;'l“g::::“ o | TX 78610
Y |737.252-0049
85 Persea americana (Avocado) 1
Price per Tree $800.00
Extended Price $800.00
86 Diospyros texana (Texas persimmon) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
87-89 DELETED
90 Pinus taeda (Loblolly pine) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
91 Platanus Mexicana (Mexican sycamore) 5
Price per Tree $300.00
Extended Price $1,500.00|
92 Platanus occidentalis (American sycamore) 1
Price per Tree $300.00
Extended Price $300.00
93 DELETED
94 Plum (edible fruiting) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
95 Populus deltoides (Eastern Cottonwood) 1
Price per Tree $550.00
Extended Price $550.00
96-98 DELETED
99 Prunus mexicana (Mexican plum) 1
Price per Tree $450.00
Extended Price $450.00
100 Prunus persica (peach) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
101 Prunus sect, Armeniaca (apricot) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
102 Punica granatum (pomegranate) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
103 Quercus alba (White oak) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
104 Quercus buckleyi (buckley oak) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
105 Quercus falcata (southern red oak) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
106-108 DELETED
109 Quercus fusiformis (Texas live oak) 5
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price $1,750.00)
110-114 DELETED
115 Quercus macrocarpa (bur oak) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price | $400.00
116-117 DELETED
118 Quercus muehlenbergi (chinquapin oak - Tree form) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
119 Quercus nigra (water oak) 1
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price $350.00
120-122 DELETED
123 Quercus polymorpha (Monterrey oak) 1
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $400.00
124 Quercus rubra (red oak) 1
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price $350.00
125 DELETED
126 Quercus shumardii (spotted oak) 1
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price | $350.00
127-129 DELETED
130 Quercus virginiana (Southern live oak) 5
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price $1,750.00)
131-133 DELETED
134 Albizia julibrissin (Mimosa) 50
Price per Tree $500.00
Extended Price $25,000.00|
135 Lagerstroemia indica "Twilight' (Twilight crape myrtle) 100
Price per Tree $450.00
Extended Price $45,000.00|
136 Lagerstroemia x ‘Natchez' (Natchez crape myrtle) 100
Price per Tree $350.00
Extended Price $35,000.00|
137 Lagerstroemia (Tree form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree $400.00
Extended Price $40,000.00]
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No Bid

No Bid
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No Bid
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No Bid
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No Bid

No Bid
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No Bid
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City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened:

February 8, 2023 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: ANNUAL CONTRACT FOR SUPPLY OF TREES Moon Valley Nursery of Texas,
LLC Mosty Brothers Nursery, Inc. Sorelle Farms, LLC
6100015328 SMM 14620 S 1-35 Frontage Rd 200 Mosty Lane 975 CR 2220
: Buda, Center Point, Mineola,
item Description An:::l"c‘;:::m X 78610 TX 78010 TX 75773
Y |737-252-0049 830-634-2643 430-205-4757
138 Lagerstroemia (Shrub form crape myrtle of any color) 100
Price per Tree $350.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $35,000.00] No Bid No Bid
139 DELETED
140 Robinia pseudoacacia (black locust - purple robe) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
141 DELETED
142 Salix babylonica (weeping willow) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
143-146 DELETED
147 Taxodium distichum (baldcypress) 1
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $400.00 No Bid No Bid
148 DELETED
149 Ulmus alata (winged elm) 1
Price per Tree $500.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $500.00 No Bid No Bid
150 Ulmus americana (American Elm) 1
Price per Tree $450.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $450.00 No Bid No Bid
151 Ulmus parvifolia (lacebark elm) 1
Price per Tree $300.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $300.00 No Bid No Bid
152 Ulmus crassifolia (Cedar elm) 5
Price per Tree $400.00 No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,000.00) No Bid No Bid
153-155 DELETED
Subtotal 45 Gallon Trees $232,549.98 No Bid No Bid
vi Palms - DELETED
Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Estimated Annual Total $238,074.98 $102,177.00 $90,075.00
Total Annual Award $238,074.98 $102,177.00 $90,075.00
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