
City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

Category 1 Passenger Tires
Core Discount Offered 0% 15% - 54.23% 48% - 54.23% 4.13% - 49.35% 0.00% - 67.79%
Catalog Discount Offered 0% 0%- 20% 48% 0% 0%- 20%
Estimated Annual Total - Core $505,426.76 $419,580.36 $411,521.03 $420,004.65 $396,268.41
Estimated Annual Total - Non-Core $505,426.76 $652,644.02 $419,410.06 $665,550.06 $671,910.47

1a Services
Road Service
Labor Rate - Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm 12 $50.00 $125.00 $160.00 No Bid $50.00
Labor Rate - After Hours, Weekends, City Holidays 1 $75.00 $175.00 $240.00 No Bid $85.00
Labor Rate - Expedited 1 $50.00 $225.00 $205.00 No Bid $50.00
Service Call 3 $45.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Estimated Total $860.00 $2,485.00 $2,365.00 No Bid $735.00

Service Charge for Tires
Dismount Tires 1 $7.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid $7.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Recap 1 $7.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid $7.00
Flat Repairs (up to 4 nails holes) 1 $3.00 $50.00 $40.00 No Bid $3.00
Estimated Total $17.00 $90.00 $80.00 No Bid $17.00

Subtotal $1,011,730.52 $1,074,799.38 $833,376.09 Incomplete $1,068,930.88

Category 2 Turf Tires
Core Discount Offered 0% 15% No Bid No Bid 0% - 34.25%
Catalog Discount Offered 0% 0% No Bid No Bid 0%
Estimated Annual Total - Core $38,027.26 $29,666.43 No Bid No Bid $34,914.43
Estimated Annual Total - Non-Core $38,027.26 $34,901.68 No Bid No Bid $35,516.82

2a Services
Road Service
Labor Rate - Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm 1224 $50.00 $125.00 $165.00 No Bid $75.00
Labor Rate - After Hours, Weekends, City Holidays 1 $75.00 $175.00 $240.00 No Bid $95.00
Labor Rate - Expedited 1 $50.00 $225.00 $205.00 No Bid $65.00
Service Call 408 $45.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Estimated Total $79,685.00 $232,960.00 $202,405.00 No Bid $91,960.00

Service Charge for Tires
Dismount Tires 204 $7.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid $10.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Recap 204 $7.00 $20.00 $20.00 No Bid $10.00
Flat Repairs (up to 4 nails holes) 204 $9.00 $50.00 $40.00 No Bid $9.00
Estimated Total $4,692.00 $18,360.00 $16,320.00 No Bid $5,916.00

Tire Repair and Balancing Materials
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount 

MT
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Valve Stems, Tube Tire, Tubeless Tire
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount 

Specified Items
Rubber Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 ALLIGATOR/TR413 No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $2.50 $0.40 $3.00 No Bid $0.02
Extended Price $2,500.00 $400.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $20.00

Metal Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A162858 ALLIGATOR/TR454 No Bid DILL/TR416
Unit Price $3.95 $14.13 $7.00 No Bid $0.78
Extended Price $1,975.00 $7,065.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $390.00

Plastic Valve Cups
Estimated Annual Use 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133970 MYERS/X2-25 No Bid DILL/CAPP
Unit Price $0.25 $0.01 $0.20 No Bid $0.05
Extended Price $250.00 $10.00 $200.00 No Bid $50.00

Valve, Stem, Cap & Core Replacement 
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR416C
Unit Price $3.95 $0.40 No Bid No Bid $1.00
Extended Price $1,975.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00

Subtotal $165,156.52 $323,363.11 Incomplete No Bid $168,767.25

2b Delivery Schedule
Restocking Orders are Placed Every 1 Day 1 Day Not Specified 1 Day
Business Days Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Not Specified Monday to Friday
Business Hours 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM Not Specified 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

CATEGORY 3 Truck and Industrial Tires
Core Discount Offered 0% 15% - 60% 48% - 70.20% 47.96% - 52.82% 0% - 67.33%
Catalog Discount Offered 0% 0% - 20% 60% 0% 36% - 39%
Estimated Annual Total - Core $2,518,929.88 $3,202,724.73 $2,785,978.40 $84,451.11 $2,641,995.37
Estimated Annual Total - Non-Core $2,518,929.88 $6,318,662.60 $2,764,315.01 $165,871.60 $3,654,395.77

3a Services
Road Service
Labor Rate - Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm 19,089 $50.00 $125.00 $165.00 No Bid No Bid
Labor Rate - After Hours, Weekends, City Holidays 1 $75.00 $175.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid
Labor Rate - Expedited 1 $50.00 $225.00 $205.00 No Bid No Bid
Service Call 6,363 $45.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Estimated Total $1,240,910.00 $3,627,310.00 $3,150,130.00 No Bid No Bid

Service Charge for Tires
Dismount Tires 3,182 $8.00 $30.00 $36.00 No Bid $10.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Recap 3,182 $8.00 $30.00 $36.00 No Bid $10.00
Flat Repairs (up to 4 nails holes) 3,182 $9.00 $65.00 $75.00 No Bid $9.00
Estimated Total $79,550.00 $397,750.00 $467,754.00 No Bid $92,278.00

Service Charge for Tires up to 24.5"
Dismount Tires 1 $8.00 $30.00 $36.00 No Bid $10.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Recap 1 $8.00 $30.00 $36.00 No Bid $10.00
Flat Repairs (up to 4 nails holes) 1 $9.00 $65.00 $75.00 No Bid $9.00
Powder Coating of Wheels and Painted White 1 $27.00 No Bid $35.00 No Bid $35.00
Estimated Total $52.00 $125.00 $182.00 No Bid $64.00

Retreading and Repair Service:
Retreading  
Manufacturer
Discount Offered 0% No Bid 20.00% No Bid No Bid

Retreading Specified Items:
11R22.5
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Part Offerred Not Specified No Bid 254086702 No Bid 11225BRM3
Unit Price $147.00 No Bid $144.34 No Bid $212.00
Extended Price $367,500.00 No Bid $360,850.00 No Bid $530,000.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

11R24.5
Estimated Annual Quantity 100 100 100 100 100
Part Offerred Not Specified No Bid 254090587 No Bid 11245BRM3
Unit Price $153.00 No Bid $170.85 No Bid $214.00
Extended Price $15,300.00 No Bid $17,085.00 No Bid $21,400.00

12R22.5
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified No Bid 254087592 No Bid 12225BRM3
Unit Price $153.00 No Bid $182.54 No Bid $220.00
Extended Price $153,000.00 No Bid $182,540.00 No Bid $220,000.00

315/80R22.5
Estimated Annual Quantity 3000 3000 3000 3000 3000
Part Offerred Not Specified No Bid 254096592 No Bid 31580225BRM3
Unit Price $234.00 No Bid $191.84 No Bid $252.00
Extended Price $702,000.00 No Bid $575,520.00 No Bid $756,000.00

Repairs:
Section Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 400 400 400 400 400
Unit Price $25.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25.00
Extended Price $10,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $10,000.00

Spot Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Unit Price $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Nail Hole Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 2000 2000 2000 2000 2000
Unit Price $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bead Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Unit Price $1.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $1,000.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tubes and Flaps
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Tire Repair and Balancing Materials
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Valve Stems, Tube Tire, Tubeless Tire (Rubber and Metal)
Rubber Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 ALLIGATOR/TR413 No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $2.50 $0.40 $3.00 No Bid $0.25
Extended Price $2,500.00 $400.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $250.00

Short Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133853 ALLIGATOR/TR454 No Bid DILL/TR416
Unit Price $3.00 $2.42 $7.00 No Bid $0.78
Extended Price $1,500.00 $1,210.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $390.00

Plastic Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified TIP TOP/A135661 ALLIGATOR/TR572 No Bid DILL/T5572
Unit Price $3.95 $4.08 $12.00 No Bid $2.50
Extended Price $1,975.00 $2,040.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $1,250.00

Metal Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133976 ALLIGATOR/TR572 No Bid DILL/TR572C
Unit Price $0.90 $0.11 $1.75 No Bid $1.00
Extended Price $450.00 $55.00 $875.00 No Bid $500.00

Valve, Stem, Cap & Core Replacement
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Repair Specified Items
TRC1HT Valve Core
Estimated Annual Quantity 2000 2000 2000 2000 2000
Part Offerred MYERS/21547 DILL/A133974 ALLIGATOR/21547 No Bid DILL/D100TP
Unit Price $0.25 $0.09 $0.25 No Bid $0.15
Extended Price $500.00 $180.00 $500.00 No Bid $300.00

Subtotal $6,358,319.76 $13,546,447.33 $9,168,177.41 Incomplete $6,388,669.14

3b Delivery Schedule
Restocking Orders are Placed Every 1 Day 1 Day Not Specified 1 Day
Business Days Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Not Specified Monday to Friday
Business Hours 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00PM 8:00 AM to 5:00PM Not Specified 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Category 4 Emergency Tires
Core Discount Offered 0% 15% - 70.20% 48% - 70.20% 0% - 50% 34.13% - 66.71%
Catalog Discount Offered 0% 0% - 20% No Bid 0% 0% - 39%
Estimated Annual Total - Core $1,175,978.06 $1,255,440.27 $1,088,736.60 $245,279.09 $1,016,364.83
Estimated Annual Total - Non-Core $1,175,978.06 $2,449,516.10 No Bid $466,498.00 $1,582,571.86

4a Services
Road Service
Labor Rate - Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm 60 $50.00 $125.00 $165.00 No Bid $75.00
Labor Rate - After Hours, Weekends, City Holidays 1 $75.00 $175.00 $240.00 No Bid $95.00
Labor Rate - Expedited 1 $50.00 $200.00 $205.00 No Bid $50.00
Service Call 20 $45.00 $195.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00
Estimated Total $4,025.00 $11,775.00 $10,345.00 No Bid $4,845.00

Service Charge for Tires
Dismount Tires 1 $8.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid $10.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Recap 1 $8.00 $35.00 $35.00 No Bid $10.00
Flat Repairs (up to 4 nails holes) 1 $9.00 $70.00 $75.00 No Bid $9.00
Estimated Total $25.00 $140.00 $145.00 No Bid $29.00

Tire Repair and Balancing Materials
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Valve Stems, Tube Tire, Tubeless Tire (Rubber & Metal)
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Rubber Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 ALLIGATOR/TR413 No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $2.50 $0.40 $3.00 No Bid $0.25
Extended Price $2,500.00 $400.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $250.00

Short Metal Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133853 ALLIGATOR/TR454 No Bid DILL/TR416
Unit Price $3.00 $2.42 $7.00 No Bid $0.78
Extended Price $1,500.00 $1,210.00 $3,500.00 No Bid $390.00

Long Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified TIP TOP/A135661 ALLIGATOR/TR572 No Bid DILL/TR572
Unit Price $3.95 $4.24 $12.00 No Bid $2.50
Extended Price $1,975.00 $2,120.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $1,250.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Metal Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Nopt Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133976R/FLOW THROUGH CAP No Bid DILL/TR632
Unit Price $0.90 $0.11 $2.00 No Bid $1.00
Extended Price $450.00 $55.00 $1,000.00 No Bid $500.00

Valve, Stem, Cap & Core Replacement
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR572C
Unit Price $3.95 $0.40 No Bid No Bid $2.50
Extended Price $1,975.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $1,250.00

Specified Items
TRC1HT Valve Core
Estimated Annual Quantity 2000 2000 2000 2000 2000
Part Offerred Not Specified DILL/A133974 HALTEC/VALVE CORE No Bid HALTEC/VALVE CORE
Unit Price $0.25 $0.09 $0.25 No Bid $0.10
Extended Price $500.00 $180.00 $500.00 No Bid $200.00

Subtotal $2,356,006.12 $3,716,871.37 Incomplete Incomplete $2,603,810.69

4b Delivery Schedule
Restocking Orders are Placed Every 1 Day 1 Day Not Specified 1 Day
Business Days Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Not Specified Monday to Friday
Business Hours 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM Not Specified 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM

Category 5 Heavy Equipment Tires
Core Discount Offered 0% 15% 20% No Bid 0%-54.74%
Catalog Discount Offered 0% 0%-20% 0%-20% No Bid 0%-36%
Estimated Annual Total - Core $328,298.49 $220,009.40 $119,794.43 No Bid $304,310.49
Estimated Annual Total - Non-Core $328,298.49 $252,615.85 $149,743.04 No Bid $324,957.65

5a Services
Road Service
Labor Rate - Monday through Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm 1,926 $65.00 $250.00 $225.00 No Bid $75.00
Labor Rate - After Hours, Weekends, City Holidays 1 $95.00 $300.00 $285.00 No Bid $95.00
Labor Rate - Expedited 1 $65.00 $400.00 $225.00 No Bid $50.00
Service Call 642 $65.00 $300.00 $175.00 No Bid $85.00
Estimated Total $167,080.00 $674,800.00 $546,210.00 No Bid $199,165.00

Service Charge for Fleet Service Truck - 20.5 and Above Tires
Mount, Dismount and Valve, Stem, Cap & Core 360 $25.00 $160.00 $175.00 No Bid $85.00
Flat Repairs 155 $25.00 $150.00 $200.00 No Bid $45.00
Wheel Powder Coating 1 $27.00 No Bid $65.00 No Bid $55.00
Cleaning and Polishing of Aluminum Wheels 1 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $38.50
Estimated Total $12,902.00 $80,850.00 $94,065.00 No Bid $37,668.50
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Service Charge for Fleet Service Truck - 20.5 and Below Tires
Dismount Tires 166 $12.00 $80.00 $125.00 No Bid $75.00
Mount Tires New, Used, Rexap 166 $12.00 $80.00 $45.00 No Bid $45.00
Flat repairs (up to 4 nails) 166 $10.00 $130.00 $50.00 No Bid $25.00
Estimated Total $5,644.00 $48,140.00 $36,520.00 No Bid $24,070.00

Service Charge for Fleet Service Truck - up to 1 ton not 
 Labor Rate Monday thorugh Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm $65.00 $250.00 $165.00 No Bid $75.00

Labor Rate After Hours, Weekends, and City Holidays $95.00 $300.00 $240.00 No Bid $95.00

Service Charge for Fleet Service Truck - 20.5 and Above Tires
Labor Rate Monday thorugh Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm $65.00 $250.00 $124.00 No Bid $75.00
Labor Rate After Hours, Weekends, and City Holidays $95.00 $300.00 $240.00 No Bid $95.00

Service Charge for Fleet Service Truck - 20.5 and Below Tires
Labor Rate Monday thorugh Friday 8:00 am to 5:00 pm $65.00 $250.00 $165.00 No Bid $75.00
Labor Rate After Hours, Weekends, and City Holidays $95.00 $300.00 $240.00 No Bid $125.00

Retreading and Repair Service
Deleted - Retreading Manufacturer Discount

Retreading Specified Items
1400 x 24 Sure Grip Grader
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
List Price $899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $693.86
Discount Offered 0% No Bid No Bid No Bid 0%
Net Price $899.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $693.86
Extended Price  $44,950.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $34,693.00

17.5 x 25 Sure Grip Loaded
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
List Price $1,035.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $748.73
Discount Offered 0% No Bid No Bid No Bid 0%
Net Price $1,035.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $748.73
Extended Price  $51,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $37,436.50

20.5 x 25 Sure Grip Loaded
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
List Price $1,236.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,600.00
Discount Offered 0% No Bid No Bid No Bid 0%
Net Price $1,236.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,600.00
Extended Price  $61,800.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $80,000.00

Page 8 of 15



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Types of Repairs
Section Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $230.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $500.00
Extended Price $11,500.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $25,000.00

Spot Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $118.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00
Extended Price $5,900.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $7,500.00

Nail Hole Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $54.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bead Repair
Estimated Annual Quantity 50 50 50 50 50
Unit Price $101.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Extended Price $5,050.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Tubes and Flaps
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Tire Repair and Balancing Materials
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Valve Stems, Tube Tire, Tubeless Tire (Rubber & Metal)
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Rubber Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $2.50 $0.40 No Bid No Bid $0.20
Extended Price $2,500.00 $400.00 No Bid No Bid $200.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Short Metal Valve
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133853 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $3.00 $2.42 No Bid No Bid $0.78
Extended Price $1,500.00 $1,210.00 No Bid No Bid $390.00

Long Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified TIP TOP/A135661 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $3.95 $4.24 No Bid No Bid $1.50
Extended Price $1,975.00 $2,120.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00

Metal Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133976 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $0.90 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.10
Extended Price $450.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid $50.00

Valve, Stem, Cap & Core Replacement
Estimated Annual Use 500 500 500 500 500
Part Offerred Not Specified GROUP 31 CO/A133901 No Bid No Bid DILL/TR413
Unit Price $3.95 $0.40 No Bid No Bid $2.50
Extended Price $1,975.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid $1,250.00

Subtotal $1,027,002.98 Incomplete Incomplete No Bid $1,077,981.14

5b Delivery Schedule
Restocking Orders are Placed Every 1 Day 1 Day Not Specified 1 Day
Business Days Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Not Specified Monday to Friday
Business Hours 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM Not Specified 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM

6 Tire Repair and Balancing Materials

Wheel Weight for Passenger Cars
.025 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.25 $0.19 No Bid No Bid $0.15
Price per Box $7.50 $4.75 No Bid No Bid $7.50
Extended Cost $625.00 $95.00 No Bid No Bid $75.00

.050 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 50 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.25 $0.30 No Bid No Bid $0.20
Price per Box $62.50 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $10.00
Extended Cost $3,125.00 $750.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00

Page 10 of 15



City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

.075 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.25 $0.28 No Bid No Bid $0.25
Price per Box $62.50 $7.00 No Bid No Bid $12.50
Extended Cost $3,125.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid $625.00

P100 1.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.31 No Bid No Bid $0.30
Price per Box $75.00 $7.75 No Bid No Bid $15.00
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $775.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00

SDP100 1.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.31 No Bid No Bid $0.30
Price per Box $75.00 $7.75 No Bid No Bid $15.00
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $775.00 No Bid No Bid $750.00

SDP125 1.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.31 No Bid No Bid $0.35
Price per Box $75.00 $7.75 No Bid No Bid $17.50
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $775.00 No Bid No Bid $875.00

SDP150 1.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.33 No Bid No Bid $0.40
Price per Box $75.00 $8.25 No Bid No Bid $20.00
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $825.00 No Bid No Bid $1,000.00

1.25 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.42 No Bid No Bid $0.35
Price per Box $75.00 $10.50 No Bid No Bid $17.50
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $1,050.00 No Bid No Bid $875.00

1.50 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 2500 2500 2500 2500 2500
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.41 No Bid No Bid $0.38
Price per Box $75.00 $10.25 No Bid No Bid $19.00
Extended Cost $3,750.00 $1,025.00 No Bid No Bid $950.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

1.75 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 350 350 350 350 350
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.47 No Bid No Bid $0.40
Price per Box $75.00 $11.75 No Bid No Bid $20.00
Extended Cost $525.00 $164.50 No Bid No Bid $140.00

2.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 400 400 400 400 400
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.75 $0.60 No Bid No Bid $0.50
Price per Box $43.75 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00
Extended Cost $700.00 $240.00 No Bid No Bid $200.00

2.25 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 150 150 150 150 150
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.75 $0.56 No Bid No Bid $0.55
Price per Box $43.75 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $27.50
Extended Cost $262.50 $84.00 No Bid No Bid $82.50

2.50 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 100 100 100 100 100
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.75 $0.59 No Bid No Bid $0.60
Price per Box $43.75 $14.75 No Bid No Bid $30.00
Extended Cost $175.00 $59.00 No Bid No Bid $60.00

Wheel Weights for Light-Duty Trucks
1.75 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Qty per Box 50 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $1.50 $0.47 No Bid No Bid $0.65
Price per Box $75.00 $11.75 No Bid No Bid $32.50
Extended Cost $1,500.00 $470.00 No Bid No Bid $650.00

2.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $2.00 $0.60 No Bid No Bid $0.50
Price per Box $50.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid $25.00
Extended Cost $2,000.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid $500.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

2.25 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $2.00 $0.56 No Bid No Bid $0.55
Price per Box $50.00 $14.00 No Bid No Bid $27.50
Extended Cost $2,000.00 $560.00 No Bid No Bid $550.00

2.50 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $2.00 $0.59 No Bid No Bid $0.60
Price per Box $50.00 $14.75 No Bid No Bid $30.00
Extended Cost $2,000.00 $590.00 No Bid No Bid $600.00

2.75 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $2.15 $0.62 No Bid No Bid $0.65
Price per Box $53.75 $15.50 No Bid No Bid $32.50
Extended Cost $1,075.00 $387.50 No Bid No Bid $325.00

3.00 Ounce
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Qty per Box 25 25 No Bid No Bid 50
Price per Each Weight $2.15 $0.65 No Bid No Bid $0.65
Price per Box $53.75 $16.25 No Bid No Bid $32.50
Extended Cost $1,075.00 $325.00 No Bid No Bid $325.00

Wheel Weights & Lead for Wheel Materials
Deleted - Manfacturer Discount

Buffer Liquid
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Valve Stems
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Valve Stems
TR 413 Rubber Valve Stems
Estimated Annual Quantity 1000 1000 1000 1000 1000
Manufacturer Offered MYERS DILL TR413 GROUP 31 CO/A133901 ALLIGATOR/TR413 No Bid DILL TR413
Price Each $2.50 $0.45 $3.00 No Bid $0.25
Extended Price $2,500.00 $450.00 $3,000.00 No Bid $250.00

TR 572 Metal Valve Stems Short
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Manufacturer Offered MYERS TR572 DILL TRUCK GROUP 31 CO/A133853 ALLIGATOR/TR572 No Bid DILL TR572
Price Each $3.00 $2.52 $9.00 No Bid $3.00
Extended Price $1,500.00 $1,260.00 $4,500.00 No Bid $1,500.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

TR 573 Metal Valve Stems Long
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Manufacturer Offered MYERS TR573 TIP TOP/A135661 ALLIGATOR/TR573 No Bid DILL TR573
Price Each $3.95 $4.24 $10.00 No Bid $3.00
Extended Price $1,975.00 $2,120.00 $5,000.00 No Bid $1,500.00

1720008 TPMS SNAP-IN VALVE TPMS Rubber Snap-In Valve for 
Estimated Annual Quantity 150 150 150 150 150
Manufacturer Offered MYERS SNAP-IN TPMS No Bid No Bid No Bid DILL SD17208
Price Each $45.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.00
Extended Price $6,750.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $150.00

Valve Cores Specified Items
TRC1HT
Estimated Annual Quantity 2000 2000 2000 2000 2000
Manufacturer Offered MYERS 21547 SHORT 

HEAT
DILL/A133974 HALTEC/VALVE CORE No Bid DILL 540SV

Price Each $0.25 $0.09 $0.25 No Bid $0.15
Extended Price $500.00 $180.00 $500.00 No Bid $300.00

Plastic & Metal Valve Caps Specified Items
38 (Metal)
Estimated Annual Quantity 500 500 500 500 500
Manufacturer Offered MYERS GROUP 31 CO/A133976 No Bid No Bid DILL TR632
Price Each $0.35 $0.11 No Bid No Bid $0.25
Extended Price $175.00 $55.00 No Bid No Bid $125.00

39 (Plastic)
Estimated Annual Quantity 1200 1200 1200 1200 1200
Manufacturer Offered MYERS GROUP 31 CO/A133970 No Bid No Bid DILL CAP-P
Price Each $0.25 $0.01 No Bid No Bid $0.10
Extended Price $300.00 $12.00 No Bid No Bid $120.00

17492L1 LONG VALVE CAPS Long Skirted Black Plastic Cap with 
Seal for 17-20008
Estimated Annual Quantity 200 200 200 200 200
Manufacturer Offered MYERS GROUP 31 CO/A167818 No Bid No Bid DILL SDSH00050
Price Each $0.20 $0.25 No Bid No Bid $0.10
Extended Price $40.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid $20.00
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City of San Antonio
Bid Tabulation

Opened: May 10, 2024 Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local Non-Local
For: Annual Contract for Tires and Tre Services T & W Tire, LLC Deco Tire Inc The Goodyear Tire & 

Rubber Company
Hesselbein Tire 
Southwest, Inc.

Southern Tire Mart, LLC

6100017782 5834 I-10 East 1307 Harvard St. 200 Innovation Way 4823 Corner Parkway 800 Highway 98

Item Description Estimated Annual 
Quantity

San Antonio,
TX  78219
210-661-8271

Lubbock,
TX 79403

Akron,
OH  44316
              NAS

San Antonio,
TX  78219

Columbia,
MS  39429

MT

Tire Repair & Balancing Materials
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Assorted Tire Repair Accessories
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

Assorted Tire Repair Accessories Specified Items
Deleted - Bead Sealer KK507F 32 oz

Subtotal $54,427.50 $14,377.00 Incomplete No Bid $13,797.50

Assorted Tire Repair Accessories
Deleted - Manufacturer Discount

6b Delivery Schedule
Restocking Orders are Placed Every 1 Day 1 Day Not Specified 1 Day
Business Days Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Monday to Friday Not Specified Monday to Friday
Business Hours 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM 8:00 AM to 5:00 PM Not Specified 7:30 AM to 5:00 PM

Payment Terms Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30 Net 30
Total $10,972,643.40 Incomplete NAS Incomplete $11,321,956.60
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