

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2024 For: Annual Contract for Hybrid & Electric Vehicles			<b>Non-Local</b> Donalson-Hiner Automotive Group, Inc. dba Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 E Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	<b>Non-Local</b> Caldwell Country Chevrolet II, LLC dba Caldwell Country Chevrolet PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	<b>Local</b> Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 Ih-10 East San Antonio, TX 78232
6100018141			JDLR		
Item	Description	Quantity			
1	Compact Hybrid Sedan, 2WD, White	5	No Bid		
	Base Price Each year Model 2024:		\$24,500.00		
	Quantity of Model Year 2024:		5		
	Total Year Model 2024:		\$122,500.00		
	Base Price Each year Model 2025:		No Bid		
	Quantity of Model Year 2025:				
	Total Year Model 2025:				
	Make & Model Offered:		Toyota Corolla 2024		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		Toyota Corolla 1.8L 4 cyl. Hybrid		
	Transmission Offered:		CVT-F Cont. Variable Trans		
	Warranty:		36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/100,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Red McCombs Toyota		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX		
	Delivery		30 Calendar Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		In Stock		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		In Stock		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		(Left Blank)		
2	Compact Hybrid SUV, 2WD Amber Gill Mounted Lights, White	12	No Bid		
	Price Each:		\$33,987.50		
	Total:		\$407,850.00		
	Year Make & Model Offered:		2024 Toyota Rav-4		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		Toyota 4 Cyl.		
	Transmission Offered:		CVT-F Cont. 1.8L 4Cyl. Hybrid		
	Warranty:		36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Red McCombs Toyota		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX		
	Delivery		30 Calendar Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		In Stock		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		In Stock		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		
	Subtotal		\$407,850.00		
	Payment Terms		Net 30		
	Less Prompt Payment Discount		\$407,850.00		
	Percentage between lowest responsive bid and local bid		5.73%		
	Price differential		\$23,382.00		
	Non-Local Preference Award		\$407,850.00		

## City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2024			Non-Local		Local	
For: Annual Contract for Hybrid & Electric Vehicles			Donalson-Hiner Automotive Group, Inc. dba Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 E Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191		Caldwell Country Chevrolet II, LLC dba Caldwell Country Chevrolet PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	
6100018141			JDLR		Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 Ih-10 East San Antonio, TX 78232	
Item	Description	Quantity				
3	Compact Plug-In Hybrid Electric SUV 2WD or AWD, White  Base Price Each year Model 2024: Quantity of Model Year 2024: Total Year Model 2024:  Base Price Each year Model 2025: Quantity of Model Year 2025: Total Year Model 2025:  Make & Model Offered:  Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):  Transmission Offered:  Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model  Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model  Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	15	No Bid		NAS	
			No Bid		No Bid	
			\$45,606.00		\$40,890.00	
			15		10	
			\$684,090.00		\$408,900.00	
			Toyota Rav-4 AWD Plug-In Hybrid		2025 Ford Escape 4dr FWD PHEV	
			Toyota Rav-4 AWD 2.5L 4Cyl.		Ford 2.5L icvt Atkinson Cycle 1-4	
			CVT-E Variable Trans		Ford eCVT Automatic	
			36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/50,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery		36 Months or 36,000 Miles	
			Red McCombs Toyota		Cavender Grande Ford	
			13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX		4562 IH-10 East San Antonio, TX 78219	
			160 Calendar Days		240 - 300 Calendar Days	
			N/A		10/31/2024	
			N/A		10/31/2024	
			No		No	
4	Medium Hybrid SUV, 2WD, Amber Grill Mounted Strobe Lights, White  Price Each: Total:  Year Make & Model Offered:  Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):  Transmission Offered:  Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model  Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model  Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	3	No Bid		No Bid	
			\$42,333.00			
			\$126,999.00			
			2025 Toyota Highlander			
			2025 Toyota Highlander 2.4L 4Cyl.			
			CVT-F Cont. Variable Trans			
			36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery			
			Red McCombs Toyota			
			13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX			
			160 Calendar Days			
			N/A			
			N/A			
			No			

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2024 For: Annual Contract for Hybrid & Electric Vehicles  6100018141 JDLR			<b>Non-Local</b> Donalson-Hiner Automotive Group, Inc. dba Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 E Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	<b>Non-Local</b> Caldwell Country Chevrolet II, LLC dba Caldwell Country Chevrolet PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	<b>Local</b> Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 Ih-10 East San Antonio, TX 78232
Item	Description	Quantity			
5	Compact Sedan, Hybrid, Mixed Colors  Price Each: Total:  Year Make & Model Offered:  Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):  Transmission Offered:  Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model  Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model  Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	2024 Toyota Corolla  Toyota Corolla 1.8L 4Cyl.  CVT-F Cont. Variable Trans  36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery  Red McCombs Toyota  13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX  In Stock  In Stock  N/A  No	No Bid	No Bid
6	Mid-Size Sedan, Hybrid, Mixed Colors  Price Each: Total:  Year Make & Model Offered:  Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):  Transmission Offered:  Warranty:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:  Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:  Delivery  Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model  Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model  Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:	2	2025 Toyota Camery LE  2025 Toyota 2.5L 4 Cyl.  Electronic Variable Trans  36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery  Red McCombs Toyota  13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX  160 Calendar Days  N/A  N/A  No	No Bid	No Bid

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2024 For: Annual Contract for Hybrid & Electric Vehicles  6100018141 JDLR			<b>Non-Local</b> Donalson-Hiner Automotive Group, Inc. dba Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 E Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	<b>Non-Local</b> Caldwell Country Chevrolet II, LLC dba Caldwell Country Chevrolet PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	<b>Local</b> Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 Ih-10 East San Antonio, TX 78232
Item	Description	Quantity			
7	Compact Sedan, Plug-In Hybrid, White	4	No Bid		
	Price Each:		\$34,308.00		
	Total:		\$137,232.00		
	Year Make & Model Offered:		2024 Toyota Prius Prime		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		Toyota 2.0L 4 Cyl.		
	Transmission Offered:		CVT - Cont. Variable Trans		
	Warranty:		36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Red McCombs Toyota		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX		
	Delivery		90 Calendar Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		N/A		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		N/A		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		
8	Compact Hybrid Sedan, 2WD, Amber Gill Mounted Lights, White	3	No Bid		
	Price Each:		\$25,200.00		
	Total:		\$75,600.00		
	Year Make & Model Offered:		2024 Toyota Corolla Hybrid		
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		2024 Toyota Corolla 1.8L 4 Cyl.		
	Transmission Offered:		CVT-F Cont. Variable Trans		
	Warranty:		36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Red McCombs Toyota		
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX		
	Delivery		60 Calendar Days		
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		N/A		
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		N/A		
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No		

# City of San Antonio Bid Tabulation

Opened: June 28, 2024 For: Annual Contract for Hybrid & Electric Vehicles  6100018141 JDLR			<b>Non-Local</b> Donalson-Hiner Automotive Group, Inc. dba Silsbee Toyota 1396 Hwy 327 E Silsbee, TX 77656 409-880-9191	<b>Non-Local</b> Caldwell Country Chevrolet II, LLC dba Caldwell Country Chevrolet PO Box 27 Caldwell, TX 77836	<b>Local</b> Cavender Ford Motor Company, Ltd. dba Cavender Grande Ford 4562 Ih-10 East San Antonio, TX 78232
Item	Description	Quantity			
9	Deleted				
10	Deleted				
11	Compact Electric SUV, Dark Color	2			
	Price Each:		\$40,066.00	\$42,570.00	
	Total:		\$80,132.00	\$85,140.00	
	Year Make & Model Offered:		2024 Toyota B24X	2025 Chevrolet Equinox EV IMB48	
	Specific Make & Model of Engine Offered: (Include SAE NET HP):		Toyota 2024 B24X Single Electric Motor (150Kw)	12 V / 60AH 680 Encca	
	Transmission Offered:		Electric	Electric Drive	
	Warranty:		36 Months/36,000 Bumper to Bumper 5 Year/60,000 Powertrain 8 Year Battery	3 Years / 36,000 Miles	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Name:		Red McCombs Toyota	Gunn Chevrolet	
	Warranty Service Provider Facility Address:		13526 I-10 Frontage Rd. San Antonio, TX	San Antonio, TX	
	Delivery		90 Calendar Days	180 Calendar Days	
	Production Cut-off Date for Current Year Model		N/A	May, 2025	
	Last day order can be placed without missing cut-off date for current year model		N/A	April 30,2025	
	Can bidder provide bid items after cut-off date:		No	Yes	
12	Deleted				
	Payment Terms		Net 30	Net 30	Net 30
	Total		\$1,747,091.00	\$85,140.00	\$840,132.00
	<b>Total Award</b>		<b>\$1,747,091.00</b>		